08/08/2003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003

06:30 PM FIRST NAMED/PRIME SPONSOR PAGE 1
Representative Cantens

H 1417 **JOINT RESOLUTION by Cantens
Judges/Annual Service in Court; constitutional amendment to require
judges of District Courts of Appeal to perform annual service in
circuit court or county court, to provide penalties for judges who
do not perform such service, & to authorize Legislature to provide
additional penalties by general law. Amends s. 4, Art. V.
03706703 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00143
03/14/03 HOUSE Referred to Judiciary; Appropriations -HJ 00221
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Judiciary

H 9019 **RESOLUTION by Cantens; (CO-SPONSORS) Kendrick (Similar S 1562)
Apprenticeship Day 2003; designhates March 6, 2003, as
"Apprenticeship Day 2003 in Florida.

03/06/03 HOUSE Introduced, placed on Calendar -HJ 00153

03/07/03 HOUSE Placed on Ceremonial Resolutions Calendar -
Publication only -HJ 00168; Adopted; See also SR
1562 (Adopted) -HJ 00168

S 1562 RESOLUTION by Jones (Similar H 9019)

Apprenticeship Program; acknowledges immeasurable value of state’s

approved apprenticeship programs to Florida’s economy & recognizes

March 6, 2003, as Apprenticeship Day 2003 in State of Florida.

02/21/03 SENATE Prefiled

04/08/03 SENATE Introduced -SJ 00350; Adopted; See also HR 9019
(Adopted) -SJ 00351

H 9079 **RESOLUTION by Cantens; (CO-SPONSORS) Arza; Llorente; Planas;
Robaina; Sorensen; Zapata
Aguirre, Dr. Horacio; recognizes Dr. Horacio Aguirre for his
personal & professional accomplishments & expresses genuine
appreciation for his outstanding contributions to his community &
his state.
04/01/03 HOUSE Placed on Ceremonial Resolutions Calendar -
Publication only -HJ 00289; Read second time
-HJ 00289; Adopted -HJ 00289

H 9171 **RESOLUTION by Cantens; (CO-SPONSORS) Bullard
Stone, Marcia; recognizes accomplishments of & extends sincerest
congratulations & best wishes to Mrs. Marcia Stone on occasion of
her retirement.
05/02/03 HOUSE Placed on Ceremonial Resolutions Calendar -
Publication only; Read second time -HJ 01115;
Adopted -HJ 01116

**ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM FIRST NAMED/PRIME SPONSOR PAGE
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 9173 **RESOLUTION by Cantens; (CO-SPONSORS) Bullard
Santiago, Raymond; honors Raymond Santiago, the nation’s "'2003
Librarian of the Year."
05/02/03 HOUSE Placed on Ceremonial Resolutions Calendar -
Publication only; Read second time -HJ 01116;
Adopted -HJ 01116

**ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



08/08/2003

06:30 PM

FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003

CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE

Representative Cantens

H 0001 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Appropriations; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen;

Ambler; Anderson; Antone; Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Barreiro;
Baxley; Bean; Bendross-Mindingall; Bense; Benson; Berfield;
Bilirakis; Bowen; Brandenburg; Brown; Brummer; Brutus; Bucher;
Bullard; Byrd; Cantens; Carassas; Clarke; Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D.
Davis; M. Davis; Dean; Detert; Domino; Evers; Farkas; Fields;
Fiorentino; Galvano; Gannon; Garcia; Gardiner; Gelber; A. Gibson;
H. Gibson; Goodlette; Gottlieb; Green; Greenstein; Haridopolos;
Harper; Harrell; Harrington; Hasner; Henriquez; Hogan; Holloway;
Homan; Jennings; Johnson; Jordan; Joyner; Justice; Kallinger;
Kendrick; Kilmer; Kosmas; Kottkamp; Kravitz; Kyle; Littlefield;
Llorente; Machek; Mack; Mahon; Mayfield; Mclnvale; Meadows; Mealor;
Murman; Murzin; Needelman; Negron; Patterson; Paul; Peterman;
Pickens; Planas; Poppell; Prieguez; Quinones; Reagan; Rich;
Richardson; Ritter; Rivera; Robaina; Roberson; Ross; Rubio;
Russell; Ryan; Sansom; Seiler; Simmons; Slosberg; Smith; Sobel;
Sorensen; Spratt; Stansel; Stargel; Troutman; Vana; Waters; Wiles;
Wishner; Zapata
Sunshine for Seniors Act; provides popular name; provides
definitions; provides legislative findings & intent; creates
Sunshine for Seniors Program to assist low-income seniors with
obtaining prescription drugs from manufacturers” pharmaceutical
assistance programs; provides implementation & oversight duties of
Elderly Affairs Dept.; provides for community partnerships;
provides for contracts; requires annual evaluation reports on
program, etc. Creates 430.83. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.
04/10/03 SENATE Favorable with 3 amendment(s) by Appropriations
Subcommittee on Health and Human Services; YEAS 5
NAYS 0 -SJ 00427
04/11/03 SENATE Now in Appropriations -SJ 00427
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Appropriations,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to SB 22-A (Ch.
2003-405)

H 0003 **GENERAL BILL by Gelber; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Roberson (Similar

2ND ENG/H 0847, CS/S 2030)
Citizens” Right to Honest Government; creates "'Citizens” Right to
Honest Government Act'; provides criminal penalties for official
misconduct, criminal misuse of official position, disclosure or use
of confidential criminal justice information, & bid tampering;
provides status of confidential informants & confidential sources;
provides criminal penalty for perjury in official proceeding by
public servant, etc. Amends FS. Effective Date: 10/01/2003.
01/09/03 HOUSE Referred to Criminal Justice (PS); Public Safety &
Crime Prevention; Ethics & Elections (PR);
Procedures; Public Safety Appropriations (AP);

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED

BILLS

1



08/08/2003

06:30 PM

FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003

CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE

Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0003 **(Continued)

H 0847

S 2030

01/09/03 HOUSE Appropriations

02/28/03 HOUSE Withdrawn from Criminal Justice (PS); Public Safety
& Crime Prevention; Ethics & Elections (PR);
Procedures; Public Safety Appropriations (AP);
Appropriations; Withdrawn prior to
introduction,Link/1den/Sim/Compare passed, refer to
HB 847 (Ch. 2003-158) -HJ 00025

GENERAL BILL/2ND ENG by Goodlette; (CO-SPONSORS) Attkisson; Benson;

Brummer; Cantens; Gelber; Hogan; Llorente; Robaina; Roberson;

Sobel; Stargel; Zapata (Similar H 0003, CS/S 2030)

Citizens’ Right to Honest Government; cites act as "Paul Mendelson

Citizens” Right to Honest Government Act™; revises definition of

"bribery" & increases penalty therefor; increases penalty for

unlawful compensation for official behavior; provides criminal

penalties for official misconduct, disclosure or use of
confidential criminal justice information, & bid tampering; repeals
provisions re official misconduct, etc. Amends FS. Effective Date:

10/01/2003.

05/02/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 01113

06/11/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor

06/17/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-158

GENERAL BILL/CS by Ethics and Elections; Sebesta; (CO-SPONSORS)

Atwater (Similar H 0003, 2ND ENG/H 0847)

Citizens’ Right to Honest Govt.; creates "Paul Mendelson Citizens”’

Right to Honest Government Act'; increases penalty for unlawful

compensation for official behavior; provides criminal penalties for

official misconduct, criminal misuse of official position,
disclosure or use of confidential criminal justice information, &
bid tampering; provides criminal penalty for perjury in official
proceeding by public servant, etc. Amends FS. Effective Date:

10/01/2003.

05/02/03 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 01053;
Substituted HB 847 -SJ 01113; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB 847 (Ch.
2003-158)

H 0013 **GENERAL BILL by Mahon; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Littlefield; Reagan

(CS by Judiciary) (Similar S 1372)

Workplace Assault/Arrest; authorizes law enforcement officer to

make arrest without warrant under certain circumstances when

assault is made upon another person in that person’s workplace;

provides for immunity from civil liability under certain

circumstances; provides definition. Amends 901.15. Effective Date:

Upon becoming law.

04/25/03 HOUSE Withdrawn from Public Safety Appropriations (AP);
Appropriations -HJ 00648; Placed on Calendar

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED

BILLS

2



08/08/2003

06:30 PM

FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003

CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE

Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0013 **(Continued)

S 1372

05/02/03 HOUSE Died on Calendar

GENERAL BILL by Saunders (Similar H 0013)

Workplace Assault/Arrest; provides law enforcement officer may make

arrest without warrant under certain circumstances when assault is

made upon another person in that person’s workplace; provides for

immunity from civil liability under certain circumstances; provides

definition. Amends 901.15. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

03/03/03 SENATE Referred to Judiciary; Criminal Justice;
Governmental Oversight and Productivity; Rules and
Calendar

037/04/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Judiciary; Criminal
Justice; Governmental Oversight and Productivity;
Rules and Calendar -SJ 00072

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Judiciary

H 0027 **GENERAL BILL by Roberson; (CO-SPONSORS) Bucher; Bullard; Cantens;

S 1628

H 0119

Harper; Richardson; Zapata (ldentical S 1628, Compare H 0119,

CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1852, S 2344)

Postsecondary Tuition/Alien Students; classifies certain

nonresident aliens as residents for tuition purposes. Amends

1009.21. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

01/09/03 HOUSE Referred to Education Appropriations (AP);
Appropriations

03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced, referred to Education Appropriations
(AP); Appropriations -HJ 00026

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Education Appropriations (AP)

GENERAL BILL by Wilson; (CO-SPONSORS) Dawson; Margolis; Hill

(ldentical H 0027, Compare H 0119, CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1852, S 2344)

Postsecondary Tuition/Alien Students; (THIS BILL COMBINED IN

CS/S1852,1628,2344) classifies certain nonresident aliens as

residents for tuition purposes. Amends 1009.21. Effective Date:

07/01/2003.

04/15/03 SENATE CS combines this bill with SB 1852 & SB 2344; CS by
Education; YEAS 8 NAYS 0O -SJ 00504; Original
bill laid on Table, refer to combined CS/CS/SB 1852
(Died in House Messages)

GENERAL BILL by Zapata; (CO-SPONSORS) Arza; Bucher; Bullard;

Cantens; M. Davis; Garcia; Harper; Jordan; Kottkamp; Llorente;

Patterson; Planas; Reagan; Richardson; Rivera; Robaina; Roberson;

Rubio (CS by Education K-20) (Similar CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1852,

S 2344, Compare H 0027, S 1628)

Students/Resident Status/Tuition; provides exemption from payment

of nonresident tuition at community colleges & state universities

for certain students meeting eligibility criteria; reenacts

provision re general requirements for eligibility for state

financial aid, to incorporate amendment to specified provision, in

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED

BILLS

3



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 4
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0119 (Continued)
reference. Amends 1009.21; reenacts 1009.40(1)(a)-. Effective Date:
07/01/2003.
04/15/03 HOUSE Recommendation: Favorable with 1 amendment(s) by
Education Appropriations (AP); YEAS 16 NAYS O
04/16/03 HOUSE Now in Appropriations
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Appropriations
S 1852 GENERAL BILL/CS/CS/1ST ENG by Appropriations; Education; Diaz de la
Portilla; Wilson; Villalobos; (CO-SPONSORS) Margolis; Hill; Dawson
(Similar H 0119, Compare H 0027, S 1628, S 2344)
Students/Tuition/Resident Status; (THIS BILL COMBINES
S1852,1628,2344) classifies specified students as residents for
tuition purposes. Amends 1009.21. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/30/03 SENATE CS passed as amended; YEAS 39 NAYS 0O -SJ 00794
04/30/03 HOUSE In Messages
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Messages
S 2344 GENERAL BILL by Villalobos (Similar H 0119, Compare H 0027,
S 1628, CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1852)
Students/Resident Status/Tuition; (THIS BILL COMBINED IN
CS/S1852,1628,2344) classifies specified students as residents for
tuition purposes. Amends 1009.21. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/15/03 SENATE CS combines this bill with SB 1852 & SB 1628; CS by
Education; YEAS 8 NAYS 0O -SJ 00504; Original
bill laid on Table, refer to combined CS/CS/SB 1852
(Died in House Messages)

H 0037 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Kravitz; (CO-SPONSORS) Antone;
Bendross-Mindingall; Bullard; Cantens; Cusack; D. Davis; A. Gibson;
Harrell; Littlefield; Llorente; Murman; Needelman; Roberson;
Sansom; Sobel; Zapata (Similar S 1806)

Sexual Offenders; prohibits certain sexual offenders subject to
conditional release supervision from living within specified
distance of certain places where children congregate; prohibits
district school boards from establishing school bus stops within
1,000 feet of existing residence of persons prohibited from living
within 1,000 feet of school bus stop, etc. Amends 947.1405,
1006.22; creates 794.065. Effective Date: 10/01/2003.
05/02/03 SENATE In Messages; Received, referred to Criminal
Justice; Appropriations Subcommittee on Criminal
Justice; Appropriations -SJ 01152; Died in
Committee on Criminal Justice

S 1806 GENERAL BILL by Fasano; (CO-SPONSORS) Lynn (Similar 1ST
ENG/H 0037)

Sexual Offenders; prohibits certain sexual offenders subject to
conditional release supervision from living within specified
distance of certain places where children congregate; prohibits
persons convicted of certain sex crimes from residing within 1,000

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



08/08/2003

06:30 PM

FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003

CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE

Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 1806

(Continued)

feet of school, day care center, park, or playground; requires

district school boards to notify DOC re school bus stop locations,

etc. Amends 947.1405, 1006.22; creates 794.065. Effective Date:

10/01/2003.

04/24/03 SENATE Withdrawn from Appropriations -SJ 00539; Placed on
Calendar, on second reading

05/02/03 SENATE Died on Calendar

H 0045 **GENERAL BILL by Jordan; (CO-SPONSORS) Baxley; Cantens; D. Davis;

S 1468

H 0213

Hogan; Kravitz; Mahon; Zapata (ldentical S 1468, Compare H 0213,
S 2532)
Constitutional Compliance Assistance; establishes Constitutional

Compliance Assistance Program to enable students to receive
scholarship to attend private school; provides for award of
scholarship if constitutional mandate for class size is not met;
provides requirements for scholarship eligibility & for private
school eligibility; specifies obligations of program participants;
provides for calculation & payment of scholarships, etc. Creates
1002.395. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
01/09/03 HOUSE Referred to Education Innovation (EDK); Education
K-20; Education Appropriations (AP); Appropriations
03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced, referred to Education Innovation (EDK);
Education K-20; Education Appropriations (AP);
Appropriations -HJ 00027
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Education Innovation (EDK)
GENERAL BILL by Cowin (ldentical H 0045, Compare H 0213, S 2532)
Constitutional Compliance Assistance; establishes Constitutional
Compliance Assistance Program to enable students to receive
scholarship to attend private school; provides for award of
scholarship if constitutional mandate for class size is not met;
provides requirements for scholarship eligibility & for private
school eligibility; specifies obligations of program participants;
provides for calculation & payment of scholarships, etc. Creates
1002.395. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
02/20/03 SENATE Prefiled
03/04/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Ethics and Elections;
Education; Appropriations Subcommittee on
Education; Appropriations -SJ 00078
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Ethics and Elections
GENERAL BILL by Needelman; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens (Compare H 0045,
S 1468, S 2532)
Reduce Class Size Scholarship Prog.; establishes Reduce Class Size
Scholarship Opportunity Program to enable students to receive
scholarship to attend private school & to provide future dollars to
school districts to achieve reduced class sizes; provides for award
of scholarship if assigned public school & classroom is

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED

BILLS

5



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 6
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0213 (Continued)

overcrowded; provides requirements for scholarship eligibility &

for private school eligibility, etc. Creates 1002.395. Effective

Date: 07/01/2003.

02/13/03 HOUSE Referred to Education Innovation (EDK); Education
K-20; Education Appropriations (AP); Appropriations

03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced, referred to Education Innovation (EDK);
Education K-20; Education Appropriations (AP);
Appropriations -HJ 00036

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Education Innovation (EDK)

S 2532 GENERAL BILL by Wise (Compare H 0045, H 0213, S 1468)

Reduce Class Size Scholarship Prog.; creates Reduce Class Size

Scholarship Opportunity Program; provides for scholarship funding &

payment; amends provision re corporate tax credits for

contributions to nonprofit scholarship-funding organizations;

amends purposes to include children eligible to participate in said

program; redefines term "qualified student'; revises maximum

allowable amount of total scholarship funding tax credits, etc.

Creates 1002.395; amends 220.187. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

03/04/03 SENATE Filed

03/26/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Education; Finance and
Taxation; Appropriations Subcommittee on Education;
Appropriations -SJ 00266

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Education

H 0051 **GENERAL BILL by Garcia; (CO-SPONSORS) Barreiro; Bullard; Cantens;
Harrell; Littlefield (Similar 1ST ENG/H 0057, H 1309, CS/S 1588)
Controlled Substances; prohibits sale, manufacture, or delivery of
controlled substances, or possession of such substances with intent
to sell, manufacture, or deliver, within 1,000 feet of certain
educational institutions, described housing facilities, & any
state, county, or municipal park or publicly owned recreational
facility; ranks such offenses on offense severity ranking chart of
Criminal Punishment Code, etc. Amends 893.13, 921.0022. Effective
Date: 10/01/2003.

02/07/03 HOUSE On Subcommittee agenda-- Criminal Justice (PS),
02/20/03, 8:30 am, Morris Hall

02/18/03 HOUSE Withdrawn from Criminal Justice (PS); Public Safety
& Crime Prevention; Public Safety Appropriations
(AP); Appropriations; Withdrawn prior to
introduction,Link/1den/Sim/Compare passed, refer to
CS/SB 1588 (Ch. 2003-95) -HJ 00027

H 0057 GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Gannon; (CO-SPONSORS) Antone; Baxley;
Brummer; Bullard; M. Davis; Garcia; H. Gibson; Harper; Harrell;
Homan; Machek; Richardson; Robaina; Roberson; Sansom; Vana
(Similar H 0051, H 1309, CS/S 1588)

Drug Abuse Prevention & Control; prohibits sale, manufacture, or

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



08/08/2003

06:30 PM

FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003

CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE

Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0057

H 1309

S 1588

(Continued)

delivery of controlled substances, or possession of such substances

with intent to sell, manufacture, or deliver, within 1,000 feet of

certain educational institutions, described housing facilities, &

any state, county, or municipal park or publicly owned recreational

facility or community center, etc. Amends 893.13, 921.0022.

Effective Date: 10/01/2003.

04/28/03 HOUSE Ordered engrossed -HJ 00689

04/30/03 HOUSE Substituted CS/SB 1588; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to CS/SB 1588
(Ch. 2003-95) -HJ 00896

GENERAL BILL by Harper (Similar H 0051, 1ST ENG/H 0057, CS/S 1588)

Controlled Substances; makes unlawful certain activities re

controlled substances within 1,000 feet of public park or public

community center; provides criminal penalties; revises offense

severity ranking chart provisions, to conform. Amends 893.13,

921.0022. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

03/04/03 HOUSE Filed

03706703 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00135

03/11/03 HOUSE Withdrawn from further cons., Link/lden/Sim/Compare
passed, refer to CS/SB 1588 (Ch. 2003-95) -HJ 00171

GENERAL BILL/CS by Criminal Justice; Aronberg; (CO-SPONSORS)

Wilson; Atwater; Crist; Fasano; Bullard (Similar H 0051, 1ST

ENG/H 0057, H 1309)

Drug Abuse Prevention & Control; prohibits sale, manufacture, or

delivery of controlled substances, or possession of such substances

with intent to sell, manufacture, or deliver, within 1,000 feet of

certain educational institutions, described housing facilities, &

any state, county, or municipal park or publicly owned recreational

facility or community center, etc. Amends 893.13, 921.0022.

Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

05/01/03 SENATE Ordered enrolled -SJ 01057

05/20/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor

06/04/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-95

H 0059 **GENERAL BILL by Bean; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Baxley; Bense; Bullard;

S 1992

Cantens; Fiorentino; H. Gibson; Harrell; Kendrick; Kilmer;

Littlefield; Llorente; Needelman; Richardson; Robaina; Stargel;

Wiles; Zapata (CS by State Administration) (Similar CS/S 1992,

S 2564)

Medal of Heroism; provides that designated persons are eligible to

receive Medal of Heroism; provides for application to Governor.

Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

05/01/03 HOUSE Placed on Special Order Calendar; Substituted CS/SB
1992; Laid on Table, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to CS/SB 1992 (Ch. 2003-51) -HJ 00977

GENERAL BILL/CS by Governmental Oversight and Productivity;

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED

BILLS

7



08/08/2003

06:30 PM

FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003

CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 8

Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 1992

S 2564

H 0061

H 0053

H 0067

(Continued)

Argenziano; (CO-SPONSORS) Crist; Miller; Fasano; Atwater (Similar

H 0059, S 2564)

Medal of Heroism; provides that designated persons are eligible to

receive Medal of Heroism; provides for application to Governor.

Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

05/02/03 SENATE Ordered enrolled -SJ 01163

05/15/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor

05/27/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-51

GENERAL BILL by Crist (Similar H 0059, CS/S 1992)

Medal of Heroism; provides that designated persons are eligible to

receive Medal of Heroism. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

03/04/03 SENATE Filed

03/27/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Governmental Oversight and
Productivity; Military and Veterans” Affairs, Base
Protection, and Spaceports -SJ 00284

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Governmental Oversight and
Productivity, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer
to CS/SB 1992 (Ch. 2003-51)

**GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Sansom; (CO-SPONSORS) Allen; Ambler;

Antone; Bullard; Cantens; Clarke; Cretul; M. Davis; Evers; Galvano;

Gottlieb; Greenstein; Harrell; Hogan; Kendrick; Kilmer; Kottkamp;

Littlefield; Murzin; Needelman; Slosberg; Sobel; Stargel; Wishner;

Zapata (Similar H 0053, H 0067, CS/S 1438)

Property Tax Exemption/Veterans; entitles disabled veterans &

surviving spouses of such veterans to exemption from taxation of

value of certain property under certain circumstances; provides for

grandfathering persons currently receiving exemption. Amends

196.24_. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

04/10/03 SENATE In Messages

04/16/03 SENATE Received, referred to Comprehensive Planning;
Military and Veterans” Affairs, Base Protection,
and Spaceports; Finance and Taxation;
Appropriations Subcommittee on General Government;
Appropriations -SJ 00452

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Comprehensive Planning

GENERAL BILL by Sansom (Similar 1ST ENG/H 0061, H 0067, CS/S 1438)

Prop. Tax Exempt./Ex-military Spouse; entitles surviving spouse of

certain ex-service members to exemption from taxation of value of

certain property. Amends 196.24. Effective Date: Upon becoming

law.

01/10/03 HOUSE Prefiled; Withdrawn prior to introduction -HJ 00027

GENERAL BILL by Slosberg (Similar H 0053, 1ST ENG/H 0061,

CS/S 1438)

Prop. Tax Exempt./Ex-military Spouse; entitles surviving spouse of

certain ex-service members to exemption from taxation of value of

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED

BILLS



08/08/2003

06:30 PM

FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003

CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE

Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0067

S 1438

(Continued)

certain property under certain circumstances. Amends 196.24.

Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

02/07/03 HOUSE On Subcommittee agenda-- Veterans” & Military
Affairs (LGV), 02/20/03, 10:45 am, Reed Hall;
Withdrawn from Veterans” & Military Affairs (LGV);
Local Government & Veterans’ Affairs; Finance &
Tax; Withdrawn prior to introduction -HJ 00028

GENERAL BILL/CS by Comprehensive Planning; Clary; (CO-SPONSORS)

Argenziano; Fasano; Siplin; Crist (Similar H 0053, 1ST ENG/H 0061,

H 0067)

Prop. Taxes/Disabled Veteran/Spouse; entitles surviving spouse of

disabled veteran to exemption from taxation of value of certain

property under certain circumstances. Amends 196.24. Effective

Date: 07/01/2003.

04/22/03 SENATE Favorable by Finance and Taxation; YEAS 5 NAYS O
-SJ 00502

04/23/03 SENATE Now in Appropriations Subcommittee on General
Government -SJ 00502

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Appropriations Subcommittee on
General Government

H 0063 **GENERAL BILL by Mack; (CO-SPONSORS) Baxley; Bullard; Cantens;

S 1066

Cusack; Harrell; Homan; Kravitz; Littlefield; Llorente; Rivera;
Sansom; Stargel (CS by Public Safety & Crime Prevention) (Similar
S 1066)
Crimes Against Minors; revises elements of crimes of kidnapping
minor child & false imprisonment of minor child; revises elements
of crime of luring or enticing minor child for unlawful purpose;
increases penalty imposed for offense of luring or enticing minor
child for unlawful purpose; amends provision re offense severity
ranking chart of Criminal Punishment Code, to incorporate
amendments to specified provisions, in references thereto, etc.
Amends FS. Effective Date: 10/01/2003.
04/24/03 HOUSE Withdrawn from Public Safety Appropriations (AP);
Appropriations -HJ 00592; Placed on Calendar
05/02/03 HOUSE Died on Calendar
GENERAL BILL by Crist; (CO-SPONSORS) Siplin (Similar H 0063)
Crimes Against Minors; revises elements of crimes of kidnapping
minor child & false imprisonment of minor child; revises elements
of crime of luring or enticing minor child for unlawful purpose;
increases penalty imposed for offense of luring or enticing minor
child for unlawful purpose; amends provision re offense severity
ranking chart of Criminal Punishment Code, to incorporate
amendments to specified provisions, in references thereto, etc.
Amends FS. Effective Date: 10/01/2003.
04/23/03 SENATE Withdrawn from Rules and Calendar -SJ 00501; Placed

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED

BILLS

9



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 10
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 1066 (Continued)
04/23/03 SENATE on Calendar, on second reading
05/02/03 SENATE Died on Calendar

H 0077 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Green; (CO-SPONSORS) Antone; Baxley;
Berfield; Brandenburg; Brummer; Bullard; Cantens; Detert; Domino;
Fiorentino; A. Gibson; Harrell; Homan; Kottkamp; Kravitz;
Littlefield; Llorente; Murman; Reagan; Robaina; Roberson; Sansom;
Sobel; Wishner (Similar CS/CS/S 2172)

Dangerous Sexual Felony Offenders; deletes provisions re repeat

sexual offenders; provides criteria for qualification of enhanced

penalties; requires sentencing to mandatory minimum prison term;

provides definitions; provides statutory construction. Amends

794.0115. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

04/30/03 HOUSE Ordered engrossed -HJ 00815

05/01/03 HOUSE Substituted CS/CS/SB 2172; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to CS/CS/SB
2172 (Ch. 2003-115) -HJ 00999

S 2172 GENERAL BILL/CS/CS by Appropriations; Criminal Justice; Cowin
(Similar 1ST ENG/H 0077)

Dangerous Sexual Felony Offender Act; provides short title; defines
dangerous sexual felony offender; provides mandatory sentencing for
such offenders. Amends 794.0115. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
05/01/03 SENATE Ordered enrolled -SJ 01057

05/27/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
06/06/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-115

H 0083 **GENERAL BILL by Brummer; (CO-SPONSORS) Bean; Bullard; Cantens;
Fiorentino; Gottlieb; Greenstein; Littlefield; Richardson; Stargel
(CS by State Administration) (Similar S 0328, Compare H 0703,
CS/CS/S 0958, CS/CS/S 1436, CS/S 1646)
FRS/Instructional Personnel/DROP; increases period of time in which
members of Florida Retirement System who are employed as
instructional personnel in grades K-12 may participate in DROP;
provides time period for certain retired members to participate in
DROP. Amends 121.091. Effective Date: 06/30/2003.
04/25/03 HOUSE Withdrawn from Appropriations -HJ 00648; Placed on
Calendar
05/02/03 HOUSE Died on Calendar, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to CS/CS/SB 958 (Ch. 2003-260), SB 30-A (Ch.
2003-391)
S 0328 GENERAL BILL by Pruitt; (CO-SPONSORS) Fasano; Dockery; Lynn
(Similar H 0083, Compare H 0703, CS/CS/S 0958)
FRS/Instructional Personnel/DROP; increases period of time within
which members of the Florida Retirement System who are employed as
instructional personnel in grades K-12 may participate in DROP;

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 11
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 0328 (Continued)
provides statement of proper & legitimate state purpose. Amends
121.091. Effective Date: Contingent.
02/04/03 SENATE Referred to Governmental Oversight and
Productivity; Education; Appropriations
03/04/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Governmental Oversight and
Productivity; Education; Appropriations -SJ 00025
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Governmental Oversight and
Productivity, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer
to CS/CS/SB 958 (Ch. 2003-260), SB 30-A (Ch.
2003-391)
H 0703 GENERAL BILL by Pickens; (CO-SPONSORS) Ambler; Arza; Clarke;
Harrell; Homan; Zapata (CS by Appropriations) (Compare H 0065,
H 0083, H 0131, H 0265, H 0755, H 0851, H 0901, H 1507, H 1739,
S 0100, S 0208, S 0328, CS/CS/2ND ENG/S 0574, CS/CS/S 0958,
CS/S 1032, 1ST ENG/S 1260, S 1380, CS/CS/S 1436, CS/S 1646, S 2134,
CS/1ST ENG/S 2170, CS/S 2380, S 2418, S 2496, S 2576)
Quality Education; defines terms "‘core-curricula courses" &
"extracurricular courses'; establishes constitutional class size
maximums; establishes operating categorical fund for implementing
class size reduction; establishes Class Size Reduction
Infrastructure Program; establishes District Effort Recognition
Program; provides for Florida Learning Access Grants, etc. Amends
FS. Effective Date: 07/01/2003 except as otherwise provided.
04/23/03 HOUSE Pending review of CS -under Rule 6.3(b)
04/25/03 HOUSE Placed on Calendar -HJ 00404
05/02/03 HOUSE Died on Calendar, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to HB 1739 (Ch. 2003-8), CS/CS/SB 958 (Ch.
2003-260), SB 30-A (Ch. 2003-391)
S 0958 GENERAL BILL/CS/CS by Appropriations; Governmental Oversight and
Productivity; Governmental Oversight and Productivity (Compare
H 0083, H 0265, H 0703, H 1677, S 0328, CS/S 0420, CS/S 0444,
S 1380, CS/CS/S 1436, CS/S 1646, S 2270, 1ST ENG/S 2502)
FRS/Education; revises participation options for participants in
Community College Optional Retirement Program; revises certain
limitations on positions for which district school board may employ
member after specified period of retirement; increases period of
time in which certain members of FRS who are employed as
instructional personnel in K-12 may participate in DROP, etc.
Amends Ch. 121, 1012.875. Effective Date: 07/01/2003 except as
otherwise provided.
05/02/03 SENATE Ordered enrolled -SJ 01163
06/23/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
06/26/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-260; See
also SB 30-A (Ch. 2003-391)
S 1436 GENERAL BILL/CS/CS by Appropriations; Finance and Taxation;
Education; Carlton; Constantine (Compare H 0065, H 0083, H 0131,
H 0703, H 0755, H 0851, H 0901, H 1739, S 0208, CS/CS/S 0958,

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 12
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 1436 (Continued)

CS/S 1032, CS/S 1646, S 2134, CS/S 2380, S 2418, S 2496, S 2576)

Class Size Reduction Act; (THIS BILL COMBINES CS/S1436,CS/S1646)

establishes constitutional class size maximum; provides

accountability for class size reduction measures; establishes

Classrooms for Kids Program; establishes Class Size Reduction

Lottery Revenue Bond Program; authorizes instructional personnel

who receive authorization to extend participation in DROP; creates

Florida Business & Education in School Together (Florida BEST)

Program, etc. Amends FS. Effective Date: 07/01/2003 except as

otherwise provided.

05/01/03 SENATE CS passed as amended; YEAS 40 NAYS O -SJ 01021

05/01/03 HOUSE In returning messages

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in returning Messages, Link/lden/Sim/Compare
passed, refer to HB 1739 (Ch. 2003-8), CS/CS/SB 958
(Ch. 2003-260), SB 30-A (Ch. 2003-391)

S 1646 GENERAL BILL/CS by Education; Constantine (Compare H 0065, H 0083,

H 0131, H 0703, H 0755, H 0851, H 0901, S 0100, S 0208,

CS/CS/S 0958, CS/S 1032, CS/CS/S 1436, S 2134, CS/S 2380, S 2418,

S 2496)

Implementation of Amendment 9; (THIS BILL COMBINED IN

CS/CS/S1436,CS/1646) authorizes instructional personnel who receive

authorization to extend participation in DROP; provides for dept.

to calculate averages based upon student membership surveys;

removes requirement that life mgmt. course be offered during 9th &

10th grade years; creates Fla. Business & Education in School

Together (Fla. BEST) Program, etc. Amends FS. Effective Date:

07/01/2003.

03/13/03 SENATE CS combines this bill with CS/SB 1436; CS/CS by
Appropriations Subcommittee on Education; YEAS 5
NAYS 0O -SJ 00189; Original bill laid on Table,
refer to combined CS/CS/1436 (Died in House
Returning Messages); Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to CS/CS/SB 958 (Ch. 2003-260), SB 30-A (Ch.
2003-391)

H 0089 **GENERAL BILL by Johnson; (CO-SPONSORS) Allen; Attkisson; Baxley;
Cantens; Sansom (CS by Health Care) (Similar 1ST ENG/S 2082)
Grieving Parents Rights Act; provides popular name of *'Stephanie
Saboor Grieving Parents Rights Act'; provides that where health
care practitioner or facility has custody of fetus following
spontaneous fetal demise, health care facility must notify mother
of her right to burial or cremation of fetus; provides requirements
re notification; directs Health Dept. & AHCA to develop forms.
Creates 383.33625. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

04/29/03 HOUSE Placed on Special Order Calendar; Substituted SB
2082; Laid on Table, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 13
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0089 **(Continued)
04/29/03 HOUSE refer to SB 2082 (Ch. 2003-52) -HJ 00722

S 2082 GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Webster; (CO-SPONSORS) Cowin; Campbell
(Similar H 0089)
Saboor Grieving Parents Act; provides that where health
practitioner has custody of fetal remains following spontaneous
fetal demise, health practitioner must notify mother of her option
of burial or cremation of fetal remains; provides that where
facility has custody of fetal remains following spontaneous fetal
demise, facility must notify mother of her option of burial or
cremation of fetal remains, as well as procedures pertaining
thereto, etc. creates 383.33625. Effective Date: 05/27/2003.
05/01/03 SENATE Ordered enrolled -SJ 01057
05/15/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
05/27/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-52

H 0119 **GENERAL BILL by Zapata; (CO-SPONSORS) Arza; Bucher; Bullard;
Cantens; M. Davis; Garcia; Harper; Jordan; Kottkamp; Llorente;
Patterson; Planas; Reagan; Richardson; Rivera; Robaina; Roberson;
Rubio (CS by Education K-20) (Similar CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1852,

S 2344, Compare H 0027, S 1628)

Students/Resident Status/Tuition; provides exemption from payment

of nonresident tuition at community colleges & state universities

for certain students meeting eligibility criteria; reenacts

provision re general requirements for eligibility for state

financial aid, to incorporate amendment to specified provision, in

reference. Amends 1009.21; reenacts 1009.40(1)(a)-. Effective Date:

07/01/2003.

04/15/03 HOUSE Recommendation: Favorable with 1 amendment(s) by
Education Appropriations (AP); YEAS 16 NAYS O

04/16/03 HOUSE Now in Appropriations

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Appropriations

S 1852 GENERAL BILL/CS/CS/1ST ENG by Appropriations; Education; Diaz de la
Portilla; Wilson; Villalobos; (CO-SPONSORS) Margolis; Hill; Dawson
(Similar H 0119, Compare H 0027, S 1628, S 2344)
Students/Tuition/Resident Status; (THIS BILL COMBINES
S1852,1628,2344) classifies specified students as residents for
tuition purposes. Amends 1009.21. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/30/03 SENATE CS passed as amended; YEAS 39 NAYS 0O -SJ 00794
04/30/03 HOUSE In Messages
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Messages

S 2344 GENERAL BILL by Villalobos (Similar H 0119, Compare H 0027,

S 1628, CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1852)

Students/Resident Status/Tuition; (THIS BILL COMBINED IN
CS/S1852,1628,2344) classifies specified students as residents for
tuition purposes. Amends 1009.21. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/15/03 SENATE CS combines this bill with SB 1852 & SB 1628; CS by

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 14
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 2344 (Continued)
04/15/03 SENATE Education; YEAS 8 NAYS 0 -SJ 00504; Original
bill laid on Table, refer to combined CS/CS/SB 1852
(Died in House Messages)
H 0027 GENERAL BILL by Roberson; (CO-SPONSORS) Bucher; Bullard; Cantens;
Harper; Richardson; Zapata (ldentical S 1628, Compare H 0119,
CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1852, S 2344)
Postsecondary Tuition/Alien Students; classifies certain
nonresident aliens as residents for tuition purposes. Amends
1009.21. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
01/09/03 HOUSE Referred to Education Appropriations (AP);
Appropriations
03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced, referred to Education Appropriations
(AP); Appropriations -HJ 00026
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Education Appropriations (AP)
S 1628 GENERAL BILL by Wilson; (CO-SPONSORS) Dawson; Margolis; Hill
(ldentical H 0027, Compare H 0119, CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1852, S 2344)
Postsecondary Tuition/Alien Students; (THIS BILL COMBINED IN
CS/S1852,1628,2344) classifies certain nonresident aliens as
residents for tuition purposes. Amends 1009.21. Effective Date:
07/01/2003.
04/15/03 SENATE CS combines this bill with SB 1852 & SB 2344; CS by
Education; YEAS 8 NAYS 0O -SJ 00504; Original
bill laid on Table, refer to combined CS/CS/SB 1852
(Died in House Messages)

H 0125 **GENERAL BILL by Slosberg; (CO-SPONSORS) Bullard; Cantens; Farkas;
Garcia; Harper; Littlefield; Rich (CS by Transportation) (Similar
CS/S 0504, Compare S 2090)
Safety Belt Law Enforcement; provides popular name; deletes
requirement for enforcement of Florida Safety Belt Law as secondary
action. Amends 316.614. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.
04/04/03 HOUSE Pending review of CS under Rule 6.3(b)
04/07/03 HOUSE Now in Criminal Justice (PS) -HJ 00337
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Criminal Justice (PS)

S 0504 GENERAL BILL/CS by Transportation; Sebesta (Similar H 0125)
Safety Belt Law Enforcement; deletes requirement for enforcement of
Fla. Safety Belt Law as secondary action. Amends 316.614.
Effective Date: Upon becoming law.
04/21/03 SENATE CS read first time on 04/23/04 -SJ 00516
04/23/03 SENATE Now in Appropriations Subcommittee on

Transportation and Economic Development -SJ 00504
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Appropriations Subcommittee on
Transportation and Economic Development

S 2090 GENERAL BILL by Wasserman Schultz (Compare H 0125)
Safety Belt Law Enforcement; provides exception to safety belt law
enforcement as secondary action. Amends 316.614. Effective Date:

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 15
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 2090 (Continued)
Upon becoming law.
03/04/03 SENATE Filed
03/18/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Transportation; Criminal
Justice; Judiciary; Rules and Calendar -SJ 00207
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Transportation

H 0193 **GENERAL BILL by Barreiro; (CO-SPONSORS) Antone; Arza;
Bendross-Mindingall; Bullard; Cantens; Gannon; Justice; Rich;
Rivera; Roberson (CS by Education K-20) (Compare CS/CS/1ST
ENG/S 1334)

School Readiness/Joint Interim Study; provides legislative findings
& purpose; requires joint interim study to make recommendations re
restructuring existing school readiness program & creating new
constitutionally required voluntary universal prekindergarten
program. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.
04/30/03 HOUSE Placed on Special Order Calendar; Substituted
CS/CS/SB 1334; Laid on Table, Link/lden/Sim/Compare
passed, refer to CS/CS/SB 1334 (Ch. 2003-93)
-HJ 00815

S 1334 GENERAL BILL/CS/CS/1ST ENG by Education; Commerce, Economic
Opportunities, and Consumer Services; Garcia; Constantine; Carlton;
(CO-SPONSORS) Lynn; Atwater (Compare H 0193, S 0360, S 0534)
Universal Prekindergarten Education; (THIS BILL COMBINES
CS/S1334,534,360) implements specified provisions of State
Constitution; creates voluntary universal prekindergarten education
program; limits application of provisions re school readiness
programs; requires State Board of Education to submit report with
recommendations or options for on curriculum, design, & standards
of said program; directs OPPAGA & Auditor General to conduct audits
& submit reports, etc. Effective Date: 06/04/2003.

05/02/03 SENATE Ordered engrossed, then enrolled -SJ 01148
05/22/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
06/04/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-93

H 0195 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Bilirakis; (CO-SPONSORS) Baxley; Cantens;
Domino; Greenstein; Homan; Kendrick; Littlefield; Sansom; Wishner;
Zapata (Similar CS/S 0338, Compare CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 0572)
Emergency Medical Dispatch Act; creates said act; provides
definitions; provides presumption of nonnegligence for certain
persons who use emergency dispatch protocols; provides exceptions;
provides for grants to local agencies to support emergency medical
dispatch. Creates 768.1335; amends 401.111. Effective Date:

09/11/2003.

05/02/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 01113

06/11/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED

BILLS



08/08/2003

06:30 PM

FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003

CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 16

Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0195

S 0338

S 0572

H 0197

**(Continued)

06/23/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-180

GENERAL BILL/CS by Judiciary; Fasano; (CO-SPONSORS) Argenziano;

Peaden; Bullard (Similar 1ST ENG/H 0195, Compare CS/CS/1ST

ENG/S 0572)

Emergency Medical Dispatch Act; provides short title; provides

definitions; provides presumption of non-negligence in use of

emergency medical dispatch protocols by emergency medical
dispatcher or emergency medical dispatch agency, its agents, or
employees; authorizes grants by Health Dept. to emergency medical
dispatch agencies. Creates 768.1335; amends 401.111. Effective

Date: 09/11/2003.

05/02/03 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 01053;
Substituted HB 195 -SJ 01118; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB 195 (Ch.
2003-180)

GENERAL BILL/CS/CS/1ST ENG by Appropriations; Health, Aging, and

Long-Term Care; Fasano (Similar CS/1ST ENG/S 2212, CS/CS/1ST

ENG/S 2390, Compare 1ST ENG/H 0195, H 0289, 1ST ENG/H 0657, H 0761,

H 0845, H 0865, 1ST ENG/H 0931, 1ST ENG/H 1553, 1ST ENG/H 1573,

H 1891, 1ST ENG/H 1925, CS/S 0338, CS/1ST ENG/S 0460, 1ST

ENG/S 0530, CS/CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 0698, CS/S 1928, 2ND ENG/S 2142,

CS/CS/S 2144, S 2180, CS/3RD ENG/S 2568, CS/S 2750)

Health Care; provides exemption from certificate-of-need

requirements for certain open-heart-surgery programs; provides

requirements for persons to become certified geriatric specialists;
creates James & Esther King Center for Universal Research to

Eradicate Disease; creates '"Nick Oelrich Gift of Life Act'; allows

certain dental students to take examination required for practicing

dentistry in this state, etc. Amends FS. Appropriation: $215,196.

Effective Date: 07/01/2003 except as otherwise provided.

05/02/03 SENATE CS passed as amended; YEAS 37 NAYS O -SJ 01089

05/02/03 HOUSE In Messages; Died in Messages,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB 195 (Ch.
2003-180), HB 761 (Ch. 2003-187), HB 1553 (Ch.
2003-27), CS/SB 460 (Ch. 2003-289), SB 530 (Ch.
2003-46), CS/SB 2568 (Ch. 2003-57)

**GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Barreiro; (CO-SPONSORS) Arza; Bullard;

Cantens; M. Davis; Fiorentino; Greenstein; Kilmer; Murzin;
Needelman; Planas; Rivera; Robaina; Roberson; Rubio; Sorensen;
Wishner; Zapata (Similar S 0736)

Officer Cheryl Seiden Act; creates said act; prohibits, in any case
in which law enforcement officer is victim of crime before court,
entering of plea agreement purporting to bind present or future
action, judgment, or speech of law enforcement officer or law
enforcement agency at any court, sentencing, or parole hearing or

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED

BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 17
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0197 **(Continued)

re any investigation without reasonable prior notice to affected

officer or duly authorized representative, etc. Amends 921.143.

Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

05/02/03 SENATE In Messages; Received, referred to Criminal
Justice; Governmental Oversight and Productivity
-SJ 01153; Died in Committee on Criminal Justice

S 0736 GENERAL BILL by Fasano; (CO-SPONSORS) Argenziano; Lynn (Similar

1ST ENG/H 0197)

Plea Agreements/Law Enforcement; prohibits court from accepting

plea agreement that prohibits law enforcement officer from

appearing at parole hearing or clemency hearing; prohibits plea

agreement that prohibits law enforcement officer who was victim in

offense from appearing or providing statement at sentencing

hearing; defines term "law enforcement officer”™ for purposes of

act, etc. Amends 921.143. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

04/23/03 SENATE Withdrawn from Judiciary -SJ 00502; Now in
Governmental Oversight and Productivity

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Governmental Oversight and
Productivity

H 0213 **GENERAL BILL by Needelman; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens (Compare H 0045,

S 1468, S 2532)

Reduce Class Size Scholarship Prog.; establishes Reduce Class Size

Scholarship Opportunity Program to enable students to receive

scholarship to attend private school & to provide future dollars to

school districts to achieve reduced class sizes; provides for award

of scholarship if assigned public school & classroom is

overcrowded; provides requirements for scholarship eligibility &

for private school eligibility, etc. Creates 1002.395. Effective

Date: 07/01/2003.

02/13/03 HOUSE Referred to Education Innovation (EDK); Education
K-20; Education Appropriations (AP); Appropriations

03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced, referred to Education Innovation (EDK);
Education K-20; Education Appropriations (AP);
Appropriations -HJ 00036

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Education Innovation (EDK)

H 0045 GENERAL BILL by Jordan; (CO-SPONSORS) Baxley; Cantens; D. Davis;

Hogan; Kravitz; Mahon; Zapata (ldentical S 1468, Compare H 0213,

S 2532)

Constitutional Compliance Assistance; establishes Constitutional

Compliance Assistance Program to enable students to receive

scholarship to attend private school; provides for award of

scholarship if constitutional mandate for class size is not met;

provides requirements for scholarship eligibility & for private

school eligibility; specifies obligations of program participants;

provides for calculation & payment of scholarships, etc. Creates

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 18
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0045 (Continued)

1002.395. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

01/09/03 HOUSE Referred to Education Innovation (EDK); Education
K-20; Education Appropriations (AP); Appropriations

03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced, referred to Education Innovation (EDK);
Education K-20; Education Appropriations (AP);
Appropriations -HJ 00027

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Education Innovation (EDK)

S 1468 GENERAL BILL by Cowin (ldentical H 0045, Compare H 0213, S 2532)
Constitutional Compliance Assistance; establishes Constitutional
Compliance Assistance Program to enable students to receive
scholarship to attend private school; provides for award of
scholarship if constitutional mandate for class size is not met;
provides requirements for scholarship eligibility & for private
school eligibility; specifies obligations of program participants;
provides for calculation & payment of scholarships, etc. Creates
1002.395. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

02/20/03 SENATE Prefiled

03/04/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Ethics and Elections;
Education; Appropriations Subcommittee on
Education; Appropriations -SJ 00078

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Ethics and Elections

S 2532 GENERAL BILL by Wise (Compare H 0045, H 0213, S 1468)

Reduce Class Size Scholarship Prog.; creates Reduce Class Size
Scholarship Opportunity Program; provides for scholarship funding &
payment; amends provision re corporate tax credits for
contributions to nonprofit scholarship-funding organizations;
amends purposes to include children eligible to participate in said
program; redefines term "qualified student'; revises maximum
allowable amount of total scholarship funding tax credits, etc.
Creates 1002.395; amends 220.187. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
03/04/03 SENATE Filed
03/26/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Education; Finance and
Taxation; Appropriations Subcommittee on Education;
Appropriations -SJ 00266
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Education

H 0215 **GENERAL BILL by Kottkamp; (CO-SPONSORS) Anderson; Antone; Arza;
Attkisson; Baxley; Benson; Brandenburg; Bullard; Cantens; Carassas;
Cusack; D. Davis; M. Davis; Domino; Gannon; Gelber; Gottlieb;
Green; Hasner; Henriquez; Holloway; Jennings; Joyner; Kendrick;
Kravitz; Littlefield; Machek; Mack; Mclnvale; Meadows; Murzin;
Needelman; Paul; Peterman; Planas; Quinones; Rich; Richardson;
Ritter; Rivera; Roberson; Seiler; Smith; Sobel; Sorensen; Spratt;
Troutman; Vana; Wishner; Zapata (CS by Appropriations) (Compare
CS/2ND ENG/S 1214)
Civil Rights Violation/Damages; authorizes Atty. General to

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 19
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0215 **(Continued)
commence civil action to obtain damages or other relief for civil
rights violation under certain circumstances; provides for
attorney’s fees & costs; changes threshold for employer subject to
Fla. Civil Rights Act of 1992; makes unlawful discrimination or
segregation in places of public accommodation, etc. Creates
760.021, .08; amends 16.57, 760.02. Effective Date: Upon becoming
law.
04/30/03 HOUSE Placed on Special Order Calendar -HJ 00814;
Substituted CS/SB 1214 (Died in Senate Returning
Messages); Laid on Table, Link/Iden/Sim/Compare
passed, refer to HB 143-A (Ch. 2003-396) -HJ 00859
S 1214 GENERAL BILL/CS/2ND ENG by Appropriations; Villalobos;
(CO-SPONSORS) Miller; Campbell; Argenziano; Fasano; Bullard;
Margolis; Aronberg; Atwater; Peaden; Lawson; Siplin; Smith; Diaz de
la Portilla; Constantine; Hill (Similar H 0933, S 0138, Compare
H 0215)
Fla. Civil Rights Act of 1992; authorizes Attorney General to
commence civil action against person or group perpetuating
discriminatory practices; provides for damages, injunctive relief,
& civil penalties; provides for venue; provides for attorney’s fees
& costs; provides for deposit of civil penalties into General
Revenue Fund; authorizes Attorney General to investigate violations
under Fla. Civil Rights Act of 1992; revises provisions re state
employment policy, etc. Amends FS. Effective Date: Upon becoming
law except as otherwise provided.
05/02/03 HOUSE CS passed as amended; YEAS 113 NAYS 2 -HJ 01065
05/02/03 SENATE In returning messages; Died in returning Messages,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB 143-A
(Ch. 2003-396)

H 0223 **GENERAL BILL by Littlefield; (CO-SPONSORS) Bullard; Cantens;
Gottlieb; Rich; Sobel (CS by The Future of Florida’s Families)
(Similar 2ND ENG/S 0118)
Disabled/Spinal Injuries/Attendants; makes pilot program for
personal care attendants for spinal cord injury victims permanent;
provides criteria for participation In program; Increases
percentage of revenues collected from tax collection enforcement
diversion program for deposit into operating account of Fla.
Endowment Foundation for Vocational Rehabilitation. Amends
413.402,.4021. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/22/03 HOUSE Withdrawn from Judicial Appropriations (AP)

-HJ 00428; Now in Appropriations

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Appropriations

S 0118 GENERAL BILL/2ND ENG by Wise; (CO-SPONSORS) Fasano; Bullard; Crist
(Similar H 0223)
Disabilities/Spinal Cord Injury; makes program for personal care

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



08/08/2003

06:30 PM

FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003

CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 20

Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 0118

H 0227

S 0094

H 1355

H 1697

(Continued)

attendants for spinal cord injury victims permanent; provides
criteria for participation in program. Amends 413.402,.4021.
Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

05/01/03 SENATE Passed as amended; YEAS 37 NAYS 0O -SJ 00872
05/01/03 HOUSE In Messages

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Messages

**GENERAL BILL by Garcia; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Gottlieb;

Greenstein; Meadows; Rivera; Stargel (ldentical S 0094, Compare
H 1355, H 1697, CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1732, S 2262)
Elections/Early Voting; provides for county commissions to provide

additional polling locations that permit early voting. Effective

Date: 07/01/2003.

02/13/03 HOUSE Referred to Ethics & Elections (PR); Procedures;
Local Government & Veterans’ Affairs; Commerce &
Local Affairs Appropriations (AP); Appropriations

03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced, referred to Ethics & Elections (PR);
Procedures; Local Government & Veterans’ Affairs;
Commerce & Local Affairs Appropriations (AP);
Appropriations -HJ 00037

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Ethics & Elections (PR)

GENERAL BILL by Geller (ldentical H 0227, Compare H 1355, H 1697,

CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1732, S 2262)

Elections/Early Voting; provides for county commissions to provide

additional polling locations that permit early voting. Effective

Date: 07/01/2003.

12/20/02 SENATE Referred to Ethics and Elections

03/04/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Ethics and Elections
-SJ 00013

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Ethics and Elections

GENERAL BILL by Needelman; (CO-SPONSORS) Littlefield (Similar

CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1732, Compare H 0227, H 1697, H 1859, S 0094,

S 2262)

Early Voting; requires supervisors of elections to allow electors

to vote early; provides requirements for location & number of early

voting facilities; specifies period & hours of operation; requires

Dept. of State to adopt rules; provides penalty for failure to

provide for early voting; provides for voter to cast in-person

absentee ballot as formerly provided under certain provisions, to

conform; conforms cross reference. Amends 101.657,.62; creates

101.659. Effective Date: 01/01/2004.

03706703 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00138

03/11/03 HOUSE Referred to Ethics & Elections (PR); Procedures;
Appropriations -HJ 00184

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Ethics & Elections (PR)

GENERAL BILL by Cusack (ldentical S 2262, Compare H 0227, H 1355,

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED

BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 21
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 1697 (Continued)

S 0094, CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1732)

Elections; requires certain number of polling places to open at

least 1 week before each election for early absentee voting.

Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

03/13/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00192

03/17/03 HOUSE Referred to Ethics & Elections (PR); Procedures;
Transportation & Economic Development
Appropriations (AP); Appropriations -HJ 00225

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Ethics & Elections (PR)

S 1732 GENERAL BILL/CS/CS/1ST ENG by Governmental Oversight and
Productivity; Ethics and Elections; Cowin; (CO-SPONSORS) Margolis
(Similar H 1355, Compare H 0227, H 1697, H 1859, S 0094, S 2262)
Early Voting; requires supervisors of elections to allow electors
to vote early; provides requirements for location & number of early
voting facilities; specifies period & hours of operation; requires
supervisors of elections to provide notice of early voting;
modifies timeframe for testing voting equipment; provides for
periodic examination of equipment during early voting, etc. Amends
101.5612, .5613, .657,.62; creates 101.659. Effective Date:
01/01/2004.

04/25/03 SENATE CS passed as amended; YEAS 38 NAYS O -SJ 00591
04/28/03 HOUSE In Messages
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Messages
S 2262 GENERAL BILL by Margolis (ldentical H 1697, Compare H 0227,
H 1355, S 0094, CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1732)
Elections; requires certain number of polling places to open at
least 1 week before each election for early absentee voting.
Effective Date: Upon becoming law.
03/04/03 SENATE Filed
03/18/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Ethics and Elections
-SJ 00218
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Ethics and Elections

H 0231 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Russell; (CO-SPONSORS) Baxley;
Bendross-Mindingall; Bullard; Cantens; Fiorentino; Galvano;
Harrington; Littlefield; Mayfield; Murman; Reagan; Sobel; Stargel
(Similar CS/CS/CS/S 0716)

Instructional Materials/Cost Savings; authorizes DOE to conduct
pilot program; authorizes pilot program within specified counties
to enable selected school districts to realize cost savings in
purchase of used instructional materials; imposes requirements on
vendors of such materials; absolves state from responsibility for
certain fTinancial losses; requires Council for Education Policy
Research & Improvement to report to Legislature; provides for
future repeal. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

04/24/03 SENATE In Messages

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 22
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0231 **(Continued)
04/28/03 SENATE Received, referred to Education; Governmental
Oversight and Productivity; Appropriations
Subcommittee on Education; Appropriations -SJ 00704
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Education
S 0716 GENERAL BILL/CS/CS/CS by Appropriations; Governmental Oversight and
Productivity; Education; Fasano; (CO-SPONSORS) Dockery (Similar
1ST ENG/H 0231)
Instructional Materials/Cost Savings; authorizes DOE to conduct
pilot program; authorizes pilot program within specified counties
to enable selected school districts to realize cost savings in
purchase of used instructional materials; Imposes requirements on
vendors of such materials; absolves state from responsibility for
certain financial losses; requires Council for Education Policy
Research & Improvement to report to Legislature; provides for
future repeal. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/28/03 SENATE Withdrawn from Rules and Calendar -SJ 00672; Placed
on Calendar, on second reading
05/02/03 SENATE Died on Calendar

H 0243 **GENERAL BILL by Holloway; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Anderson; Arza;
Attkisson; Baxley; Bilirakis; Brutus; Bullard; Cantens; Cretul; M.
Davis; Evers; Fiorentino; Garcia; Hogan; Homan; Kendrick; Kilmer;
Kottkamp; Llorente; Murzin; Needelman; Negron; Planas; Prieguez;
Quinones; Reagan; Rivera; Rubio; Sansom; Stansel; Stargel; Zapata
(ldentical S 1916)

Education/lInvocation or Benediction; authorizes individual district
school boards by resolution to allow invocation or benediction at
specified secondary school-related events; provides legislative
intent; provides severability. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
03/05/03 HOUSE Favorable by- Judiciary; YEAS 13 NAYS 5

-HJ 00153
03/07/03 HOUSE Placed on Calendar -HJ 00153
05/02/03 HOUSE Died on Calendar

S 1916 GENERAL BILL by Bullard; (CO-SPONSORS) Cowin (ldentical H 0243)
Education/lInvocation or Benediction; authorizes individual district
school boards by resolution to allow invocation or benediction at
specified secondary school-related events; provides legislative
intent; provides severability. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
03/04/03 SENATE Filed
03/18/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Education; Judiciary;

Comprehensive Planning; Rules and Calendar
-SJ 00196
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Education

H 0267 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Zapata; (CO-SPONSORS) Anderson; Arza;

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 23
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0267 **(Continued)
Bullard; Cantens; Garcia; Gottlieb; Llorente; Murzin; Patterson;
Planas; Poppell; Rivera; Robaina; Roberson; Rubio; Sobel; Stargel;
Troutman (Similar 1ST ENG/S 1860)
Unpaid Taxes/Sale of Certificates; prohibits electronic sales of
certain tax certificates for unpaid taxes; authorizes county tax
collectors to conduct sales of tax certificates for unpaid taxes by
electronic means; specifies compliance requirements; requires
public access; authorizes tax collector to receive electronic
deposits & payments. Amends 197.432. Effective Date: 05/21/2003.
04/25/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 00648
05/19/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
05/21/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-22
S 1860 GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Diaz de la Portilla (Similar 1ST

ENG/H 0267)
Unpaid Taxes/Sale of Certificates; authorizes county tax collectors
to conduct sales of tax certificates for unpaid taxes by electronic
means; provides for compliance with certain provisions, governing
tax collections, sales, & liens; provides requirement for public
access; provides authority to tax collector to receive electronic
deposits & payments; redefines term "non-ad valorem assessment'.
Amends 197.432,.3632. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/24/03 SENATE Read third time -SJ 00543; Substituted HB 267

-SJ 00544 ; Laid on Table, Link/lden/Sim/Compare

passed, refer to HB 267 (Ch. 2003-22)

H 0311 **GENERAL BILL by Arza; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Domino; Kravitz;
Rivera; Roberson; Sansom; Zapata
Teacher Protection & Respect Act; provides popular name; provides
enhanced penalties for assault or battery of teacher or educator,
as defined in act; provides additional penalty for person who has
had one prior conviction for battery, aggravated battery, or felony
battery on teacher or educator; authorizes law enforcement officers
to make arrest for certain violations even when violation did not
occur in presence of officer. Creates 784.071. Effective Date:
10/01/2003.
02/25/03 HOUSE Referred to Public Safety & Crime Prevention
02/26/03 HOUSE Withdrawn from Public Safety & Crime Prevention;

Withdrawn prior to introduction -HJ 00043

H 0323 **GENERAL BILL by Harrell; (CO-SPONSORS) Allen; Cantens; Kravitz;
Littlefield (CS by Agriculture) (ldentical CS/S 1530)
Fraud Prevention Unit; creates said unit within Attorney General’s
Office to iImprove & coordinate state’s response to fraud & related
crimes; requires said unit to establish Statewide Complaint Receipt
& Referral Center to collect, refer, & analyze information

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 24
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0323 **(Continued)
concerning fraud; authorizes Attorney General to use volunteers;
requires Fraud Prevention Unit to coordinate i1ts investigations
with other law enforcement agencies & victim assistance programs,
etc. Effective Date: 07/01/2004.
04/16/03 HOUSE Pending review of CS under Rule 6.3(b)
04/18/03 HOUSE Now in Public Safety Appropriations (AP) -HJ 00385
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Public Safety Appropriations

(AP)

S 1530 GENERAL BILL/CS by Commerce, Economic Opportunities, and Consumer
Services; Villalobos; (CO-SPONSORS) Fasano; Crist (ldentical
H 0323)
Fraud Prevention Unit; creates said unit within Attorney General’s
Office to iImprove & coordinate state’s response to fraud & related
crimes; requires said unit to establish Statewide Complaint Receipt
& Referral Center to collect, refer, & analyze information
concerning fraud; authorizes Attorney General to use volunteers;
requires Fraud Prevention Unit to coordinate i1ts investigations
with other law enforcement agencies & victim assistance programs,
etc. Effective Date: 07/01/2004.
04/30/03 SENATE CS passed; YEAS 40 NAYS 0 -SJ 00820
04/30/03 HOUSE In Messages
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Messages

H 0327 **GENERAL BILL by Arza; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Zapata (ldentical
CS/S 0322)
Dist. School Bd. Employee/lLegislator; requires employee of district
school board who is member of Legislature to take unpaid leave for
time away from employment while on legislative business. Effective
Date: Upon becoming law.
02/25/03 HOUSE Referred to State Administration
03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced, referred to State Administration

-HJ 00044

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on State Administration

S 0322 GENERAL BILL/CS by Governmental Oversight and Productivity; Lynn
(ldentical H 0327)
Dist. School Bd. Employee/lLegislator; requires employee of district
school board who is member of Legislature to take unpaid leave for
time away from employment while on legislative business. Effective
Date: Upon becoming law.
04/01/03 SENATE CS read first time on 04/03/03 -SJ 00342
04/03/03 SENATE Now in Rules and Calendar -SJ 00342
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Rules and Calendar

H 0345 **JOINT RESOLUTION by Green; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Garcia; Kottkamp
(Compare H 1097, H 1109, H 1119, H 1877, S 0318, S 1506, S 1672)

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 25
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0345 **(Continued)
Constitutional Amendment/Initiative; constitutional amendment to
increase vote required to pass amendment to or revision of State
Constitution proposed by initiative from majority of those electors
voting on matter in election to three-fifths of those electors
voting on matter in election. Amends s. 5, Art. XI.
03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced, referred to Ethics & Elections (PR);
Procedures; Judiciary -HJ 00044
03/11/03 HOUSE Withdrawn from Ethics & Elections (PR); Procedures;
Judiciary; Withdrawn from further consideration
-HJ 00171

H 1097 JOINT RESOLUTION by Farkas; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens (Compare H 0345,
H 1109, H 1119, H 1877, S 0318, S 1506, S 1672)

Ratification of Amendment; constitutional amendment to iIncrease

vote required by voters to ratify amendment to State Constitution

from majority to two-thirds of those voting in election. Amends s.

5, Art. XI.

03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00089

03/07/03 HOUSE Referred to Ethics & Elections (PR); Procedures
-HJ 00166

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Ethics & Elections (PR)

H 1109 JOINT RESOLUTION by Hogan (Compare H 0345, H 1097, H 1119, H 1877,
S 0318, S 1506, S 1672)

Constitution/Amendment Ratification; constitutional amendment to

require that said amendments be approved by majority of voters in
majority of counties, as well as by majority of voters in state.

Amends s. 5, Art. XI.

03703703 HOUSE Prefiled

03/04/03 HOUSE Withdrawn prior to introduction

H 1119 JOINT RESOLUTION by Brandenburg (Similar S 1506, Compare H 0345,
H 1097, H 1109, H 1877, S 0318, S 1672)

Constitutional Amendment/lnitiatives; constitutional amendment to

reserve to electors the right to propose law by initiative process

& approve it by referendum; process would require approval from

3/5ths of electors voting on issue in order for proposed law to be

adopted, etc. Amends s. 1, Art. 111, s. 10, Art. 1V, s. 3 & 5, Art.

X1; creates s. 20, Art. 111.

03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00090

03/07/03 HOUSE Referred to Ethics & Elections (PR); Procedures
-HJ 00166

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Ethics & Elections (PR)

H 1877 JOINT RESOLUTION by Procedures; (CO-SPONSORS) Green; Hogan
(Compare H 0345, H 1097, H 1109, H 1119, S 0318, S 1506, S 1672)
Amendments/Revisions/Initiatives; constitutional amendment to
require signatures for initiative petitions to amend or revise
State Constitution to be gathered in three-fifths, rather than one
half, of congressional districts, & of state as whole, equal to ten
percent of votes cast in last presidential election & to increase

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 26
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 1877 (Continued)
vote required to adopt amendment to or revision of constitution
from majority to two-thirds of electors voting in favor, etc.
Amends Art. X1, ss. 3 & 5.
04/16/03 HOUSE Filed; Introduced -HJ 00401
05/02/03 HOUSE Died, reference deferred
S 0318 JOINT RESOLUTION by Smith (Compare H 0345, H 1097, H 1109, H 1119,
H 1877, S 1506, S 1672)
Legislation by Initiative; constitutional amendment to allow
legislation to be proposed by initiative, unless i1t provides for
number or assignment of judges or jurisdiction of courts, 1Is
constitutionally prohibited or requires passage by extraordinary
vote of Legislature, or changes boundaries of any municipality,
county, or special, legislative, or congressional district, etc.
Creates s. 20, Art. I1l1l; amends s. 10, Art. 1V, ss. 3 & 5, Art. XI.
03/04/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Ethics and Elections;
Judiciary; Rules and Calendar -SJ 00024
03/28/03 SENATE On Committee agenda-- Ethics and Elections,
04/02/03, 1:00 pm, 412-K --Temporarily postponed
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Ethics and Elections
S 1506 JOINT RESOLUTION by Atwater (Similar H 1119, Compare H 0345,
H 1097, H 1109, H 1877, S 0318, S 1672)
Constitutional Amendments/Initiative; constitutional amendment that
would reserve to electors the right to propose laws by initiative
process & approve it by referendum & would require approval from
three-fiftths of electors voting on issue in order for proposed law
to be adopted; such laws would not be subject to Governor’s veto
power & could not be amended or repealed by Legislature in its
first 2 years without extraordinary majority vote, etc. Amends Art.
I, Art. 1V, Art. XI.
03/04/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Ethics and Elections;
Judiciary; Appropriations; Rules and Calendar
-SJ 00081
03/28/03 SENATE On Committee agenda-- Ethics and Elections,
04/02/03, 1:00 pm, 412-K --Temporarily postponed
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Ethics and Elections
S 1672 JOINT RESOLUTION by Posey (Compare H 0345, H 1097, H 1109, H 1119,
H 1877, S 0318, CS/CS/S 1172, S 1506)
Approval/Constitutional Amendments; (THIS BILL COMBINED IN
CS/CS/S1172,1672) constitutional amendment to require approval by
two-thirds, rather than simple majority, of electors voting on
proposed constitutional amendment. Amends s. 5, Art. XI.
04/14/03 SENATE CS combines this bill with CS/SJR 1172; CS/CS by
Judiciary; YEAS 8 NAYS O -SJ 00426; Original
bill laid on Table, refer to combined CS/CS/SB 1172
(Failed to Pass Senate)

**ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 27
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0347 **GENERAL BILL by Green; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens (Similar H 1683,
S 0246)
Leaving Scene of Accident; increasing offense severity ranking for
accident involving death, for failure to stop & for leaving scene.
Amends 921.0022. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
02/13/03 HOUSE Prefiled
02/19/03 HOUSE Withdrawn prior to
introduction,Link/1den/Sim/Compare passed, refer to
HB 1683 (Ch. 2003-176) -HJ 00044
H 1683 GENERAL BILL by Kyle; (CO-SPONSORS) Attkisson; Cantens; Green;
LlIorente; Roberson; Sansom; Slosberg; Waters (ldentical S 0246,
Similar H 0347)
Leaving Scene of Accident/Penalty; provides enhanced penalty for
offense of leaving scene of accident involving fatality under
offense severity ranking chart of Criminal Punishment Code. Amends
921.0022. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
05/01/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 01029
06709703 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
06/20/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-176
S 0246 GENERAL BILL by Saunders; (CO-SPONSORS) Fasano; Crist (ldentical
H 1683, Similar H 0347)
Leaving Scene of Accident/Penalty; provides enhanced penalty for
offense of leaving scene of accident involving fatality under
offense severity ranking chart of Criminal Punishment Code. Amends
921.0022. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
05/01/03 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 00856;
Substituted HB 1683 -SJ 01036; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB 1683 (Ch.
2003-176)

H 0415 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Baxley; (CO-SPONSORS) Altman; Cantens;
Cretul; Homan; Kravitz; Needelman; Sansom; Stargel; Zapata
(Similar CS/S 1250)
Public Libraries/Computers/Obscenity; requires public libraries to
install & maintain computer software or equivalent technology that
prohibits access to obscene materials by minors; permits libraries
to prohibit access to materials that incite violence; provides that
installation of software or technology in library having only one
public-access computer is within library’s discretion; provides
finding of important state interest. Effective Date: 10/01/2003.
04/23/03 SENATE In Messages; Received, referred to Governmental
Oversight and Productivity; Comprehensive Planning;
Criminal Justice; Communication and Public
Utilities; Rules and Calendar -SJ 00532
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Governmental Oversight and
Productivity
S 1250 GENERAL BILL/CS by Comprehensive Planning; Wise (Similar 1ST
ENG/H 0415, Compare 1ST ENG/H 0049, S 1408, CS/CS/S 1434)

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 28
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 1250 (Continued)

Public Libraries/Computers/Obscenity; requires public libraries to

install & maintain computer software or equivalent technology that

prohibits access to obscene materials by minors; provides that

installation of software or technology in library having only one

public-access computer is within library’s discretion; provides

finding of important state interest; establishes minimum standards

for receipt of operating grants. Amends 257.17. Effective Date:

10/01/2003.

04/14/03 SENATE CS read first time on 04/16/03 -SJ 00437

04/16/03 SENATE Now in Criminal Justice -SJ 00426

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Criminal Justice,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to CS/CS/SB
1434 (Ch. 2003-126)

H 0429 **MEMORIAL by Jordan; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen; Altman; Ambler;
Anderson; Antone; Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Bean;
Bendross-Mindingall; Bense; Benson; Berfield; Bilirakis; Bowen;
Brandenburg; Brown; Brummer; Brutus; Bucher; Bullard; Byrd;
Cantens; Clarke; Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D. Davis; M. Davis; Dean;
Detert; Domino; Evers; Farkas; Fields; Fiorentino; Galvano; Gannon;
Garcia; Gardiner; Gelber; A. Gibson; H. Gibson; Goodlette;
Gottlieb; Green; Greenstein; Harper; Harrell; Harrington; Hasner;
Henriquez; Hogan; Holloway; Homan; Jennings; Johnson; Joyner;
Justice; Kallinger; Kendrick; Kilmer; Kosmas; Kottkamp; Kravitz;
Kyle; Littlefield; Llorente; Machek; Mack; Mahon; Mayfield;
Mclnvale; Meadows; Mealor; Murman; Murzin; Needelman; Negron;
Patterson; Paul; Peterman; Pickens; Planas; Quinones; Reagan; Rich;
Richardson; Ritter; Rivera; Robaina; Roberson; Ross; Rubio;
Russell; Ryan; Sansom; Seiler; Simmons; Slosberg; Smith; Sobel;
Sorensen; Spratt; Stansel; Stargel; Troutman; Vana; Wiles; Wishner;
Zapata (ldentical S 1728)

Captain M. Scott Speicher; urges Congress to take all actions

necessary to resolve fate of Captain M. Scott Speicher, United

States Navy, MIA-Captured.

04/10/03 SENATE Adopted -SJ 00379

04/16/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 00401

05/23/03 Signed by Officers and filed with Secretary of
State

S 1728 MEMORIAL by Wise; (CO-SPONSORS) King; Alexander; Argenziano;
Aronberg; Atwater; Bennett; Bullard; Campbell; Carlton; Clary;
Constantine; Cowin; Crist; Dawson; Diaz de la Portilla; Dockery;
Fasano; Haridopolos; Garcia; Geller; Hill; Jones; Klein; Lawson;
Lee; Lynn; Margolis; Miller; Peaden; Posey; Pruitt; Saunders;
Sebesta; Siplin; Smith; Villalobos; Wasserman Schultz; Webster;
Wilson (ldentical H 0429)

Captain M. Scott Speicher; urges Congress to take all actions

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



08/08/2003

06:30 PM

FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003

CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 29

Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 1728

(Continued)

necessary to resolve fate of Captain M. Scott Speicher, United

States Navy, MIA-Captured.

04/10/03 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 00381;
Substituted HM 429 -SJ 00379; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HM 429
(Adopted)

H 0437 **JOINT RESOLUTION by Johnson; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Littlefield;

Sansom (CS by Procedures)
Appropriations/Amendments/Initiative; constitutional amendment to
specify that appropriations power is exclusively legislative power
& to prohibit other branches of government from appropriating funds
or directing appropriation of funds by Legislature or requiring
Legislature to increase any particular tax, fine, or fee & to
require that amendments proposed by initiative must be revenue
neutral. Amends s. 3, Art. 11, s. 3, Art. XI.
04/14/03 HOUSE Favorable by Finance & Tax; YEAS 17 NAYS 7

-HJ 00397; Now in Appropriations -HJ 00397
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Appropriations

H 0453 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Adams; (CO-SPONSORS) Attkisson; Berfield;

S 0126

Bullard; Cantens; Fiorentino; Homan; Rivera; Roberson; Troutman;
Wishner; Zapata (Similar CS/S 0126)
Victim of Sex Offense/Pub. Rec.; provides exemption from public
records requirements for criminal intelligence information or
criminal investigative information which is a photograph,
videotape, or image of any part of body of victim of sexual
offense; provides for retroactive effect of exemption; provides for
future legislative review & repeal; provides statement of public
necessity. Amends 119.07. Effective Date: 06/17/2003.
05/01/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 01029
06/04/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
06/17/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-157
PUBLIC RECORDS/GENERAL BILL/CS by Criminal Justice; Campbell;
(CO-SPONSORS) Lynn; Argenziano (Similar 1ST ENG/H 0453)
Victim of Sexual Offense/Pub. Rec.; provides exemption from
public-records requirements for photograph, videotape, or image of
any part of body of victim of sexual offense; provides for future
legislative review and repeal; provides statement of public
necessity. Amends 119.07. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.
05/01/03 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 00856;
Substituted HB 453 -SJ 01036; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB 453 (Ch.
2003-157)

**ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 30
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0463 **GENERAL BILL by Arza; (CO-SPONSORS) Attkisson; Bullard; Cantens;
Garcia; Llorente; Planas; Prieguez; Rivera; Robaina; Spratt; Zapata
(CS by Education K-20) (Similar CS/1ST ENG/S 2156, Compare H 1831)
Fla. High School Activities Assoc.; conforms provisions; renames
association; revises procedures re student physical assessments;
adds appointee to board of directors; deletes obsolete report;
requires report re policy for separate championships in high school
sports for private & public schools. Amends 1006.18,.20. Effective
Date: Upon becoming law.

04/30/03 HOUSE Placed on Special Order Calendar; Substituted CS/SB
2156; Laid on Table, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to CS/SB 2156 (Ch. 2003-129) -HJ 00866

S 2156 GENERAL BILL/CS/1ST ENG by Education; Diaz de la Portilla (Similar
H 0463, Compare H 1831)

Fla. High School Activities Assoc.; provides technical revisions;
renames association as Fla. High School Athletic Association;
revises procedures for students” physical examinations; revises
membership of board of directors; deletes obsolete provisions.
Amends 1006.18,.20. Effective Date: 06/10/2003.

05/01/03 SENATE Ordered enrolled -SJ 01057

05/27/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
06/10/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-129

H 1831 GENERAL BILL by Education K-20; (CO-SPONSORS) Attkisson; Kilmer
(Similar CS/2ND ENG/S 1772, Compare 1ST ENG/H 0319, H 0463, H 0911,
H 1739, 1ST ENG/H 1745, 1ST ENG/H 1881, CS/CS/S 1006, CS/CS/S 1520,
CS/1ST ENG/S 2156, S 2324, S 2576, CS/CS/S 2738)

School Code Rewrite; provides exception to public records
exemption; includes employees of state universities in definition
for purposes of pretax benefits program; includes employees of
state university boards of trustees in definition for purposes of
deferred compensation program; redesignates developmental research
school as lab school; includes state universities as self-insurers
for purposes of workers” compensation, etc. Amends FS. Effective
Date: Upon becoming law.
04/30/03 HOUSE Placed on Special Order Calendar; Substituted CS/SB
1772 (Died in Senate Returning Messages); Laid on
Table, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB
1739 (Ch. 2003-8), CS/CS/SB 1006 (Ch. 2003-91),
CS/SB 2156 (Ch. 2003-129), HB 51-A (Ch. 2003-392)
-HJ 00823

H 0481 **GENERAL BILL by Waters; (CO-SPONSORS) Anderson; Arza; Ausley;
Bilirakis; Bowen; Brown; Cantens; Carassas; Farkas; Greenstein;
Henriquez; Justice; Littlefield; Patterson; Peterman; Russell (CS
by State Administration) (Similar CS/S 2248)

Charitable Youth Org./Service Work; authorizes state & its
political subdivisions to contract with charitable youth

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 31
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0481 **(Continued)
organizations for certain public service work; provides conditions
for contracts & annual award limit; provides for audit; provides
limitations; provides for termination of contract by court. Creates
255.60. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.
05/02/03 HOUSE Placed on Special Order Calendar; Substituted CS/SB
2248; Laid on Table, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to CS/SB 2248 (Ch. 2003-113) -HJ 01091
S 2248 GENERAL BILL/CS by Governmental Oversight and Productivity;
Wasserman Schultz; (CO-SPONSORS) Bennett; Lawson; Miller; Diaz de
la Portilla; Jones; Posey (Similar H 0481)
Charitable Youth Org./Service Work; authorizes state & its
political subdivisions to contract with charitable youth
organizations for certain public service work; provides for
contracts & award limit; provides limitations. Creates 255.60.
Effective Date: 06/05/2003.
05/02/03 SENATE Ordered enrolled -SJ 01163
05/22/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
06/05/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-113

H 0493 **GENERAL BILL by Jordan; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens (ldentical S 0060)
Student Conduct/Truancy; authorizes school superintendent to file
truancy petition for any student placed on suspension for more than
specified period during school year; provides legislative findings
re enforcing codes of student conduct; requires that superintendent
recommend procedures to school board for certain suspended
students; requires that student’s parent or guardian cooperate in
controlling student”s behavior, etc. Amends 984.151, 1003.26.
Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

02/26/03 HOUSE Referred to Pre-K through 12 (EDK); Education K-20;
Public Safety & Crime Prevention; Education
Appropriations (AP); Appropriations

03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced, referred to Pre-K through 12 (EDK);
Education K-20; Public Safety & Crime Prevention;
Education Appropriations (AP); Appropriations
-HJ 00053

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Pre-K through 12 (EDK)

S 0060 GENERAL BILL by Wise; (CO-SPONSORS) Fasano (ldentical H 0493)
Student Conduct/Truancy; authorizes school superintendent to file
truancy petition for any student placed on suspension for more than
specified period during school year; provides legislative findings
re enforcing codes of student conduct; requires that superintendent
recommend procedures to school board for certain suspended
students; requires that student’s parent or guardian cooperate in
controlling student’s behavior, etc. Amends 984.151, 1003.26.
Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

12/20/02 SENATE Referred to Education

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



08/08/2003

06:30 PM

FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003

CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 32

Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 0060

H 0527

H 1153

S 1866

(Continued)
037/04/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Education -SJ 00011
05702703 SENATE Died in Committee on Education

**GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Arza; (CO-SPONSORS) Altman; Brummer;

Cantens; Hasner; Rivera; Robaina; Zapata (Compare H 1153,
CS/S 1866)
Educational Facilities; authorizes certain municipalities, by

proposal & resolution, to convert public schools to charter

schools; provides requirements for resolution; provides for

application to district school board for conversion; provides for

notice of denial of application & appeal; provides restrictions re

capital outlay funding; provides for rules. Effective Date:

07/01/2003.

05/01/03 SENATE In Messages

05/02/03 SENATE Received, referred to Education; Comprehensive
Planning; Appropriations Subcommittee on Education;
Appropriations -SJ 01154; Died in Committee on
Education

GENERAL BILL by Galvano (Compare 1ST ENG/H 0527, CS/S 1866)

Educational Facilities; authorizes creation of workplace school

benefit districts to assist in financing construction & maintenance

of educational facilities; provides for creation of community

redevelopment agencies as alternative; provides funding for

workplace school benefit districts or community redevelopment

agencies; creates "Fla. Qualified Public Educ. Facilities Private

Activity Bond Allocation Act”, etc. Creates 1013.358,.359, .3595,

159.831-835. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00092

03/07/03 HOUSE Referred to Local Government & Veterans’ Affairs;
Finance & Tax -HJ 00167

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Local Government & Veterans’
Affairs

GENERAL BILL/CS by Education; Diaz de la Portilla (Compare 1ST

ENG/H 0527, H 1153)

Educational Facilities; prescribes that educational facilities

benefit districts & community development districts may apply to

convert group of public schools to charter schools; prescribes

additional purposes of educational facilities benefit districts;

provides for appeal of certain school board decisions; provides for

creation of such districts by general-purpose governments; expands

purpose & funding for districts, etc. Amends 1002.33,

1013.355,.356. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

05/01/03 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 00856

05/02/03 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 01053; Died on
Calendar

**ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 33
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0535 **GENERAL BILL by Hogan; (CO-SPONSORS) Baxley; Bilirakis; Brutus;
Bullard; Cantens; Cretul; Culp; Fiorentino; Garcia; Kilmer; Planas
(Compare 1ST ENG/H 1887)

Public K-12 Educational Instruction; directs each district school

superintendent to provide for display of motto "IN GOD WE TRUST"™ in

prominent location in public schools. Amends 1003.45. Effective

Date: Upon becoming law.

04/04/03 HOUSE Now in Education K-20

04/10/03 HOUSE On Committee agenda-- Education K-20, 04/14/03,
9:00 am, Morris Hall --Not considered

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Education K-20

H 1887 GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Education K-20; (CO-SPONSORS) Arza;
Attkisson; Bullard; Domino; Kilmer; Quinones; Sansom; Stargel
(Similar CS/S 1522, Compare H 0535, S 2154)

Student’s Education/Parent & Family; creates Family & School
Partnership for Student Achievement Act; requires DOE to develop
guidelines for parent guide; provides additional notification to
parents of students with substantial reading deficiencies; amends
provision re incentives & bonuses under Dale Hickham Excellent
Teaching Prog.; authorizes each dist. school superintendent to
provide for display of motto "IN GOD WE TRUST', etc. Amends Chs.
1001, 1002, 1003, 1008, 1012. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
05/01/03 HOUSE Temporarily postponed, on Third Reading -HJ 00998
05/02/03 HOUSE Temporarily postponed, on Third Reading -HJ 01060;
Died on Calendar, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to CS/SB 1522 (Ch. 2003-118)

H 0541 **GENERAL BILL by Llorente; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Planas; Rivera;

Robaina; Troutman; Zapata (Similar 1ST ENG/S 2356)

Proceedings Relating to Children; revises definition of term "other

person responsible for child’s welfare™ to include employees of, &

volunteers at, specified institutions; includes public schools &
religious organizations among specified institutions; iIncreases

penalties re reporting of sexual abuse of child. Amends 39.01,.205.

Effective Date: 10/01/2003.

04/07/03 HOUSE On Committee agenda-- The Future of Florida’s
Families, 04/09/03, 8:45 am, Reed Hall --Not
considered

04/10/03 HOUSE On Committee agenda-- The Future of Florida’s
Families, 04/14/03, 1:00 pm, Reed Hall --Not

considered
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on The Future of Florida’s
Families
S 2356 GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Villalobos; (CO-SPONSORS) Lynn (Similar

H 0541)
Proceedings Relating to Children; revises definition of term "other
person responsible for child’s welfare™ to include employees of, &

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 34
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 2356 (Continued)
volunteers at, specified institutions; includes public schools &
religious organizations among specified institutions; iIncreases
penalties re reporting of sexual abuse of child; permits
municipalities to require certain municipal employees to be drug
tested. Amends 39.01, .205; creates 39.00145. Effective Date:
10/01/2003.
04/24/03 SENATE Passed as amended; YEAS 38 NAYS O -SJ 00548
04/25/03 HOUSE In Messages
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Messages

H 0545 **GENERAL BILL by Llorente; (CO-SPONSORS) Bullard; Cantens; Planas;
Rivera; Robaina; Roberson; Zapata (CS by Appropriations)
(ldentical CS/S 2078)
Medical Practice; authorizes issuance of temporary certificates for
visiting physicians to obtain medical privileges for instructional
purposes in conjunction with certain plastic surgery training
programs & plastic surgery educational symposiums; limits number of
certificates that may be issued per calendar year; provides
financial responsibility requirements; provides practice
limitations & conditions, etc. Creates 458.3137. Effective Date:
Upon becoming law.
04/30/03 HOUSE Placed on Special Order Calendar; Substituted CS/SB

2078; Laid on Table, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to CS/SB 2078 (Ch. 2003-75) -HJ 00861

S 2078 GENERAL BILL/CS by Health, Aging, and Long-Term Care; Villalobos
(ldentical H 0545)
Medical Practice; authorizes issuance of temporary certificates for
visiting physicians to obtain medical privileges for instructional
purposes in conjunction with certain plastic surgery training
programs & plastic surgery educational symposiums; limits number of
certificates that may be issued per calendar year; provides
financial responsibility requirements; provides practice
limitations & conditions, etc. Creates 458.3137. Effective Date:

06/02/2003.

05/01/03 SENATE Ordered enrolled -SJ 01057

05/20/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
06702703 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-75

H 0547 **GENERAL BILL by Prieguez; (CO-SPONSORS) Arza; Baxley; Brutus;
Bucher; Bullard; Cantens; D. Davis; Machek; Planas; Rivera;
Robaina; Wiles; Zapata (CS by Business Regulation) (Similar
CS/S 1248)
OPPAGA/Real Property Reform; requires OPPAGA to review & evaluate
changes to laws affecting land sales, exemptions, & mandatory
homeowners” associations & disclosure laws re adult & residential

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



08/08/2003
06:30 PM

FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003

CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 35

Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0547 **(Continued)

S 1248

subdivisions; requires OPPAGA to consult with DBPR, homeowners &

homeowners” associations, & developers & to hold hearings; requires

report. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

05/02/03 HOUSE Placed on Special Order Calendar; Temporarily
postponed, on Second Reading -HJ 01093; Died on
Calendar

GENERAL BILL/CS by Comprehensive Planning; Wise; (CO-SPONSORS)

Fasano; Garcia; Lynn; Crist (Similar H 0547)

OPPAGA/Real Property Reform; requires OPPAGA to review & evaluate

changes to laws affecting land sales, exemptions, & mandatory
homeowners” associations & disclosures laws re adult & residential
subdivisions; requires OPPAGA to consult with DBPR, homeowners &
homeowners” associations, & developers & to hold hearings; requires
report re its evaluation of need for change to laws that protect
interests of consumers & property owners, etc. Effective Date:
Upon becoming law.

04/30/03 HOUSE In Messages

05/02/03 HOUSE Placed on Special Order Calendar; Died in Messages

H 0627 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Bilirakis; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Harrell;

S 1694

H 1819

Llorente (Similar CS/CS/S 1694, Compare 1ST ENG/H 1819, CS/S 1680)
Insurance Fraud; provides for bringing action against unauthorized
insurer under certain circumstances; makes it unlawful for certain
affiliated parties to participate iIn insurance business without
authorization; provides criminal penalties for acting as insurer
without valid certificate; specifies certain investigators as law
enforcement officers; provides criminal penalty for certain charges
re services & parts, etc. Amends FS. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/30/03 HOUSE Ordered engrossed -HJ 00862
05/01/03 HOUSE Substituted CS/CS/SB 1694; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to CS/CS/SB
1694 (Ch. 2003-148) -HJ 01005
GENERAL BILL/CS/CS by Governmental Oversight and Productivity;
Banking and Insurance; Posey; (CO-SPONSORS) Fasano; Atwater
(Similar 1ST ENG/H 0627, Compare 1ST ENG/H 1819, CS/S 1680)
Insurance Fraud; cites act as ""Pete Orr Insurance Anti-Fraud Act';
provides civil remedy for consumers against unauthorized insurers
for unpaid claims; prohibits certain persons under disciplinary
sanctions from participating in insurance business; provides
criminal penalties for entity transacting insurance without
certificate of authority, etc. Amends 624.155,.310,.401, 629.989,
860.15, 921.0022; creates 817.413. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
05/01/03 SENATE Ordered enrolled -SJ 01057
05/29/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
06/12/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-148
GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Insurance; Berfield; (CO-SPONSORS) Ambler;

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED

BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 36
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 1819 (Continued)

Llorente; Robaina (Compare 1ST ENG/H 0627, CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1202,

CS/CS/S 1694)

Motor Vehicle Insurance Costs; creates Motor Vehicle Insurance

Affordability Reform Act of 2003; requires certain persons to

maintain confidential & exempt status of certain information under

certain circumstances; provides additional requirements re

registration of certain clinics; provides additional grounds for

discipline of health professionals; prohibits person from

organizing, planning, or participating in staged motor vehicle

accident, etc. Amends FS. Effective Date: 10/01/2003 except as

otherwise provided.

04/30/03 HOUSE Ordered engrossed -HJ 00970

05/01/03 HOUSE Temporarily postponed, on Third Reading -HJ 01001

05/02/03 HOUSE Died on Calendar, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to CS/CS/SB 1694 (Ch. 2003-148), CS/SB 32-A
(Ch. 2003-411)

S 1680 GENERAL BILL/CS by Banking and Insurance; Posey; (CO-SPONSORS)

Fasano (Compare 1ST ENG/H 0627, CS/CS/S 1694)

Pete Orr Insurance Anti-Fraud Act; provides short title; provides

civil remedy for consumers against unauthorized insurers for unpaid

claims; provides criminal penalties for entity transacting

insurance without certificate of authority. Amends 624.155, .401.

Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

04/14/03 SENATE Favorable by Health, Aging, and Long-Term Care;
YEAS 10 NAYS 0O -SJ 00424

04/15/03 SENATE Now in Judiciary -SJ 00424

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Judiciary,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to CS/CS/SB
1694 (Ch. 2003-148)

H 0707 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Planas; (CO-SPONSORS) Altman; Baxley;
Bullard; Cantens; Hogan; Llorente; Murzin; Needelman; Rivera;
Sansom (Similar CS/S 2072)

Unborn Quick Child/Homicide; includes death of unborn quick child

under DUl manslaughter; makes killing of said child rather than

killing of viable fetus "vehicular homicide™™; provides that killing

said child by injury to mother which would be murder in any degree

if it resulted in death of mother is murder in same degree;

provides that death of mother does not bar prosecution under

specified circumstances, etc. Amends 316.193, 782.071, .09,

921.0022. Effective Date: 10/01/2003.

04/29/03 SENATE In Messages

05/01/03 SENATE Received, referred to Criminal Justice; Judiciary;
Appropriations Subcommittee on Criminal Justice;
Appropriations -SJ 01055

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Criminal Justice

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 37
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 2072 GENERAL BILL/CS by Criminal Justice; Cowin (Similar 1ST
ENG/H 0707)
Unborn Quick Child/Homicide; includes death of unborn quick child
under DUl manslaughter; makes killing of said child rather than
killing of viable fetus "vehicular homicide™; provides that killing
said child by injury to mother which would be murder in any degree
if it resulted in death of mother is murder in same degree;
provides that death of mother does not bar prosecution, etc. Amends
316.193, 782.071,.09, 921.0022. Effective Date: 10/01/2003.
04/09/03 SENATE CS read first time on 04/10/03 -SJ 00396
04/10/03 SENATE Now in Judiciary -SJ 00383
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Judiciary

H 0709 **GENERAL BILL by Planas; (CO-SPONSORS) Bullard; Cantens; Llorente;

Rivera; Robaina; Seiler (Similar CS/S 0096)

Student Loans/Asst. State Attorneys; provides for financial

assistance program administered by Justice Administrative

Commission to provide assistance to qualified assistant state

attorneys & assistant public defenders for repayment of government

student loans; provides for elements of program; provides for

funding. Creates 43.201. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

03/18/03 HOUSE On Subcommittee agenda-- Judicial Appropriations
(AP), 03/20/03, 9:30 am, 24-H

03/20/03 HOUSE Recommendation: Favorable with 1 amendment(s) by
Judicial Appropriations (AP); YEAS 9 NAYS O

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Judicial Appropriations (AP)

S 0096 GENERAL BILL/CS by Judiciary; Campbell; (CO-SPONSORS) Fasano

(Similar H 0709)

Student Loans/Asst. State Attorneys; provides for financial

assistance program administered by Justice Administrative

Commission to provide assistance to qualified assistant state

attorneys & assistant public defenders for repayment of eligible

student loans; defines term “eligible student loan'; provides for

elements of program; provides for funding. Creates 43.201.

Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

03/05/03 SENATE Favorable with 1 amendment(s) by Governmental
Oversight and Productivity; YEAS 9 NAYS O
-SJ 00165

03706703 SENATE Now in Appropriations Subcommittee on Article V
Implementation and Judiciary -SJ 00165

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Appropriations Subcommittee on
Article V Implementation and Judiciary

H 0715 **GENERAL BILL by Rivera; (CO-SPONSORS) Bullard; Cantens; M. Davis;
Gannon; Llorente; Planas; Robaina; Rubio; Zapata (CS by Judiciary)
(Similar CS/CS/2ND ENG/S 2050)
Child Custody Evaluations; provides presumption of good faith for

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 38
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0715 **(Continued)
actions of court-appointed psychologist who conducts child custody
evaluation; prohibits anonymous complaints; provides prerequisites
to parent bringing legal action against psychologist; provides for
award of reasonable attorney’s fees & reasonable court costs.
Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/30/03 HOUSE Placed on Special Order Calendar; Substituted
CS/CS/SB 2050; Laid on Table, Link/lden/Sim/Compare
passed, refer to CS/CS/SB 2050 (Ch. 2003-112)
-HJ 00862
S 2050 GENERAL BILL/CS/CS/2ND ENG by Health, Aging, and Long-Term Care;
Judiciary; Aronberg (Similar H 0715)
Child Custody Evaluations; provides presumption of good faith for
actions of court-appointed psychologist who conducts child custody
evaluation; prohibits anonymous complaints; provides prerequisites
to parent’s bringing legal action against psychologist; provides
for court to award attorney’s fees & reasonable court costs.
Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
05/01/03 SENATE Ordered enrolled -SJ 01057
05/22/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
06/05/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-112

H 0747 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Kallinger; (CO-SPONSORS) Attkisson;
Cantens; Kravitz; Llorente; Slosberg (Similar CS/S 1734)
Sexual Battery Time Limitations; revises language re time
limitations for prosecution of crime of sexual battery. Amends
775.15. Effective Date: 10/01/2003.
04/30/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 00970
05/28/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
06/06/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-116
S 1734 GENERAL BILL/CS by Judiciary; Webster; (CO-SPONSORS) Fasano; Lynn;
Atwater (Similar 1ST ENG/H 0747)
Sexual Battery Time Limitations; revises provisions re time
limitations for prosecution of first-degree felony offense of
sexual battery against victim under age of 18. Amends 775.15.
Effective Date: 10/01/2003.
04/29/03 SENATE Amendment(s) adopted -SJ 00735; Substituted HB 747
-SJ 00735; Laid on Table, Link/lden/Sim/Compare
passed, refer to HB 747 (Ch. 2003-116)

H 0749 **GENERAL BILL by Kallinger; (CO-SPONSORS) Baxley; Cantens; Justice;
Machek; Murman; Quinones; Wiles; Zapata (CS by The Future of
Florida’s Families) (Similar CS/S 2664)
Care for Persons with Disabilities; provides popular name of
"Stephanie Banguera Act; creates Fla. Lifespan Respite Care
Program; authorizes CFS Dept. to contract for said program; creates

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 39
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0749 **(Continued)
Relative Caregiver Program; requires that training & education
programs be provided by dept.; authorizes AHCA to require
monitoring of relative caregivers; provides for certification of
relative caregivers by dept., etc. Creates 393.0662. Effective
Date: 07/01/2003.
04/18/03 HOUSE Pending review of CS under Rule 6.3(b)
04/22/03 HOUSE Now in Appropriations -HJ 00397
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Appropriations

S 2664 GENERAL BILL/CS by Children and Families; Constantine (Similar
H 0749)
Care for Persons with Disabilities; creates Fla. Lifespan Respite
Care Program; authorizes CFS Dept. to contract for Lifespan Respite
Care Program; provides contingent appropriation; creates Relative
Caregiver Program; provides for training & education; provides for
certification of relative caregivers; limits compensation of said
caregivers; provides for revocation of certification of relative
caregivers; requires rules; provides for certification by CFS
Dept., etc. Creates 393.0662. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.
04/14/03 SENATE CS read first time on 04/16/03 -SJ 00450
04/16/03 SENATE Now in Health, Aging, and Long-Term Care -SJ 00426
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Health, Aging, and Long-Term

Care

H 0803 **GENERAL BILL by Barreiro; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen; Altman;
Ambler; Anderson; Antone; Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Baxley; Bean;
Bendross-Mindingall; Bense; Benson; Berfield; Bilirakis; Bowen;
Brandenburg; Brown; Brummer; Brutus; Bucher; Bullard; Byrd;
Cantens; Clarke; Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D. Davis; M. Davis; Dean;
Detert; Domino; Evers; Farkas; Fields; Fiorentino; Galvano; Gannon;
Garcia; Gardiner; Gelber; A. Gibson; H. Gibson; Goodlette;
Gottlieb; Green; Greenstein; Harper; Harrell; Harrington; Hasner;
Henriquez; Hogan; Holloway; Homan; Jennings; Johnson; Jordan;
Joyner; Justice; Kendrick; Kilmer; Kosmas; Kottkamp; Kravitz; Kyle;
Littlefield; Llorente; Machek; Mack; Mahon; Mayfield; Mclnvale;
Meadows; Mealor; Murman; Murzin; Needelman; Negron; Patterson;
Paul ; Peterman; Pickens; Planas; Prieguez; Quinones; Reagan; Rich;
Richardson; Ritter; Rivera; Robaina; Roberson; Ross; Rubio;
Russell; Ryan; Sansom; Seiler; Simmons; Slosberg; Smith; Sobel;
Sorensen; Spratt; Stansel; Stargel; Troutman; Vana; Wiles; Wishner;
Zapata (ldentical S 2412)

Florida Jewish History Month; designates month of January of each
year as "Florida Jewish History Month'; provides for proclamation
by Governor to that effect. Creates 683.195. Effective Date:

04/17/2003.

04/10/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 00381

04/16/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED

BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 40
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0803 **(Continued)
04/16/03 -HJ 00404
04/17/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-7 -HJ 00414
S 2412 GENERAL BILL by Margolis; (CO-SPONSORS) Klein; Geller; Wasserman
Schultz; Fasano (ldentical H 0803)
Florida Jewish History Month; designates month of January of each
year as "Florida Jewish History Month'; provides for proclamation
by Governor to that effect. Creates 683.195. Effective Date: Upon
becoming law.
04/08/03 SENATE Reconsidered -SJ 00351; Substituted HB 803
-SJ 00351; Laid on Table, Link/lden/Sim/Compare
passed, refer to HB 803 (Ch. 2003-7)

H 0805 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Baker; (CO-SPONSORS) Attkisson; Brown;
Bullard; Cantens; Kravitz; Patterson; Sansom; Zapata (Similar
CS/S 1100, Compare CS/1ST ENG/S 2062)

Military Dependents/Scholarships; establishes program for

contributions to nonprofit scholarship-funding organizations to be

used for dependent children of veterans & military personnel;

provides for tax credits that may be granted each fiscal year for

such contributions; provides requirements & limitations. Creates

220.1875. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

04/07/03 SENATE Favorable with 3 amendment(s) by Military and
Veterans” Affairs, Base Protection, and Spaceports;
YEAS 5 NAYS 1 -SJ 00358

04/08/03 SENATE Now in Education -SJ 00358

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Education

S 1100 GENERAL BILL/CS by Military and Veterans” Affairs, Base Protection,
and Spaceports; Fasano; (CO-SPONSORS) Lynn; Crist; Bullard
(Similar 1ST ENG/H 0805, Compare CS/1ST ENG/S 2062)

Military Dependents/Scholarships; establishes program for

contributions to nonprofit scholarship-funding organizations to be

used for dependent children of veterans & military personnel;

provides for tax credits that may be granted each fiscal year for

such contributions; provides requirements & limitations. Creates

220.1875. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

03/26/03 SENATE CS read first time on 04/02/03 -SJ 00313

03/28/03 SENATE Now in Appropriations Subcommittee on
Transportation and Economic Development -SJ 00304

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Appropriations Subcommittee on
Transportation and Economic Development

S 2062 GENERAL BILL/CS/1ST ENG by Appropriations; Lee; (CO-SPONSORS)
Fasano; Haridopolos (Compare H 0419, 1ST ENG/H 0805, CS/S 1100)
Scholarship Funding Tax Credits; increases total amount of tax
credit which may be granted each state fiscal year; provides for
scholarship amounts awarded to be annually adjusted based on
percentage change in Consumer Price Index; establishes program for

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 41
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 2062 (Continued)
contributions to nonprofit scholarship-funding organizations to be
used for dependent children of military personnel; provides
add-back to adjusted federal income, etc. Amends 220.187,.02,.13;
creates 220.1875. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/25/03 SENATE CS passed as amended; YEAS 26 NAYS 11 -SJ 00594
04/28/03 HOUSE In Messages
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Messages

H 0843 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Appropriations; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen;
Ambler; Anderson; Antone; Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Barreiro;
Baxley; Bean; Bendross-Mindingall; Bense; Benson; Berfield;
Bilirakis; Bowen; Brandenburg; Brown; Brummer; Brutus; Bucher;
Bullard; Byrd; Cantens; Carassas; Clarke; Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D.
Davis; M. Davis; Dean; Detert; Domino; Evers; Farkas; Fields;
Fiorentino; Galvano; Gannon; Garcia; Gardiner; Gelber; A. Gibson;
H. Gibson; Goodlette; Gottlieb; Green; Greenstein; Haridopolos;
Harper; Harrell; Harrington; Hasner; Henriquez; Hogan; Holloway;
Homan; Jennings; Johnson; Jordan; Joyner; Justice; Kallinger;
Kendrick; Kilmer; Kosmas; Kottkamp; Kravitz; Kyle; Littlefield;
Llorente; Machek; Mack; Mahon; Mclnvale; Meadows; Mealor; Murman;
Murzin; Needelman; Negron; Patterson; Paul; Peterman; Pickens;
Planas; Poppell; Prieguez; Quinones; Reagan; Rich; Richardson;
Ritter; Rivera; Robaina; Roberson; Ross; Rubio; Russell; Ryan;
Sansom; Seiler; Simmons; Slosberg; Smith; Sobel; Sorensen; Spratt;
Stansel; Stargel; Troutman; Vana; Waters; Wiles; Wishner; Zapata
Low-income Elderly/RX Expenses; revises pharmaceutical expense
assistance program for low-income elderly individuals; adds
eligibility groups; provides benefits; requires AHCA, 1in
administering program, to collaborate with both Elderly Affairs
Dept. & CFS Dept.; requires federal approval of benefits. Amends
409.9065. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

03/13/03 SENATE In Messages

03/19/03 SENATE Received, referred to Health, Aging, and Long-Term
Care; Appropriations Subcommittee on Health and
Human Services; Appropriations -SJ 00241

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Health, Aging, and Long-Term
Care

H 0847 **GENERAL BILL/2ND ENG by Goodlette; (CO-SPONSORS) Attkisson; Benson;
Brummer; Cantens; Gelber; Hogan; Llorente; Robaina; Roberson;
Sobel; Stargel; Zapata (Similar H 0003, CS/S 2030)
Citizens’ Right to Honest Government; cites act as "Paul Mendelson
Citizens” Right to Honest Government Act™; revises definition of
"bribery"™ & increases penalty therefor; increases penalty for
unlawful compensation for official behavior; provides criminal

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



08/08/2003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 42
Representative Cantens (Continued)
H 0847 **(Continued)
penalties for official misconduct, disclosure or use of

confidential criminal justice information, & bid tampering; repeals
provisions re official misconduct, etc. Amends FS. Effective Date:

10/01/2003.

05/02/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 01113

06/11/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
06/17/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-158

H 0003 GENERAL BILL by Gelber; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Roberson (Similar

2ND ENG/H 0847, CS/S 2030)

Citizens” Right to Honest Government; creates "'Citizens” Right to

Honest Government Act'; provides criminal penalties for official

misconduct, criminal misuse of official position, disclosure or use

of confidential criminal justice information, & bid tampering;
provides status of confidential informants & confidential sources;
provides criminal penalty for perjury in official proceeding by

public servant, etc. Amends FS. Effective Date: 10/01/2003.

01/09/03 HOUSE Referred to Criminal Justice (PS); Public Safety &
Crime Prevention; Ethics & Elections (PR);
Procedures; Public Safety Appropriations (AP);
Appropriations

02/28/03 HOUSE Withdrawn from Criminal Justice (PS); Public Safety
& Crime Prevention; Ethics & Elections (PR);
Procedures; Public Safety Appropriations (AP);
Appropriations; Withdrawn prior to
introduction,Link/1den/Sim/Compare passed, refer to
HB 847 (Ch. 2003-158) -HJ 00025

S 2030 GENERAL BILL/CS by Ethics and Elections; Sebesta; (CO-SPONSORS)

Atwater (Similar H 0003, 2ND ENG/H 0847)

Citizens’ Right to Honest Govt.; creates '"Paul Mendelson Citizens”’

Right to Honest Government Act'; increases penalty for unlawful

compensation for official behavior; provides criminal penalties for

official misconduct, criminal misuse of official position,
disclosure or use of confidential criminal justice information, &
bid tampering; provides criminal penalty for perjury in official
proceeding by public servant, etc. Amends FS. Effective Date:

10/01/2003.

05/02/03 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 01053;
Substituted HB 847 -SJ 01113; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB 847 (Ch.
2003-158)

H 0859 **GENERAL BILL by Robaina; (CO-SPONSORS) Allen; Arza; Bullard;
Cantens; Cusack; Galvano; Garcia; Hogan; Llorente; Patterson;
Planas; Reagan; Rivera; Ross; Rubio; Stargel; Troutman; Wiles;
Wishner; Zapata (CS by Transportation) (Linked H 1737, Similar
CS/S 2060, Compare H 1679, S 2268)

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 43
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0859 **(Continued)
Law Enforcement Officers; revises delinquent fee for described late
renewal or extension of certain driver’s licenses; provides for
deposit of funds into State Law Enforcement Officer Recruitment &
Retention Trust Fund for certain purposes; creates law enforcement
accountability pay scale; provides for pay increase for certain
career service law enforcement officers; provides methods of
payment. Amends 322.21. Appropriation. Effective Date:
07/01/2003.
04/14/03 HOUSE Pending review of CS under Rule 6.3(b)
04/15/03 HOUSE Now in Public Safety & Crime Prevention -HJ 00371
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Public Safety & Crime
Prevention
H 1737 TRUST FUND/GENERAL BILL by Robaina; (CO-SPONSORS) Galvano; Garcia;
Roberson (Linked H 0859)
State Law Enforcement Recruitment TF; creates State Law Enforcement
Officer Recruitment & Retention Trust Fund within Revenue Dept.;
provides for sources of moneys & purposes; provides for annual
carryforward of unused funds; provides for future review &
termination or re-creation of trust fund. Creates 20.2101.
Effective Date: Contingent.
04/09/03 HOUSE Favorable by Transportation; YEAS 18 NAYS O
-HJ 00372
04/14/03 HOUSE Now in Public Safety & Crime Prevention -HJ 00372
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Public Safety & Crime
Prevention
S 2060 GENERAL BILL/CS by Transportation; Dockery; (CO-SPONSORS) Fasano;
Siplin (Similar H 0859)
Law Enforcement Officers; revises delinquent fee for described late
renewal or extension of certain driver’s licenses; provides for
deposit of funds into State Law Enforcement Officer Recruitment &
Retention Trust Fund for certain purposes. Amends 322.21.
Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/21/03 SENATE CS read first time on 04/23/04 -SJ 00526
04/23/03 SENATE Now in Criminal Justice -SJ 00504
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Criminal Justice
H 1679 GENERAL BILL by Harper; (CO-SPONSORS) Jennings (ldentical S 2268,
Compare H 0859)
Law Enforcement Officers/Salaries; provides for annual salary
adjustment for certified law enforcement officers. Effective Date:
07/01/2003.
03/13/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00191
03/17/03 HOUSE Referred to State Administration; Local Government
& Veterans” Affairs; Finance & Tax; Appropriations
-HJ 00225
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on State Administration
S 2268 GENERAL BILL by Siplin; (CO-SPONSORS) Dockery; Wilson; Campbell
(ldentical H 1679, Compare H 0859)

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 44
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 2268 (Continued)

Law Enforcement Officers/Salaries; provides for annual salary

adjustment for certified law enforcement officers. Effective Date:

07/01/2003.

03/19/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Criminal Justice;
Comprehensive Planning; Governmental Oversight and
Productivity; Appropriations Subcommittee on
Criminal Justice; Appropriations -SJ 00227

04/17/03 SENATE On Committee agenda-- Criminal Justice, 04/22/03,
2:15 pm, 37-S --Temporarily postponed

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Criminal Justice

H 0947 **GENERAL BILL by Planas; (CO-SPONSORS) Bullard; Cantens; Homan;
Llorente; Reagan; Rivera; Robaina; Stargel; Troutman; Zapata
(Similar CS/S 2430)
Blood Alcohol Level/Drug Testing; revises language that provides
for tests to determine blood alcohol content or presence of
chemical or controlled substances. Amends 316.1932, 327.352.
Effective Date: 05/27/2003.
04/30/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 00970
05/21/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
05/27/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-54
S 2430 GENERAL BILL/CS by Criminal Justice; Saunders (Similar H 0947)
Blood Alcohol Content/Tests; revises provisions that provide for
tests to determine blood alcohol content or presence of chemical or
controlled substances. Amends 316.1932, 327.352. Effective Date:
Upon becoming law.
04/29/03 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 00783;
Substituted HB 947 -SJ 00772; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB 947 (Ch.
2003-54)

H 0961 **GENERAL BILL by Negron; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Planas (ldentical
S 1622)
Juvenile Drug Courts; provides for creation of county juvenile drug
courts; provides for assessments for court costs by circuit &
county courts to be used for operation, administration, &
programming of teen & juvenile drug courts & provides for
distribution of such assessments. Amends 938.19. Effective Date:
10/01/2003.
04/03/03 HOUSE Now in Judiciary -HJ 00337
04/10/03 HOUSE On Committee agenda-- Judiciary, 04/14/03, 4:00 pm,

Morris Hall --Not considered

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Judiciary

S 1622 GENERAL BILL by Aronberg (ldentical H 0961)
Juvenile Drug Courts; provides for creation of county juvenile drug

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 45
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 1622 (Continued)
courts; provides for assessments for court costs by circuit &
county courts to be used for operation, administration, &
programming of teen & juvenile drug courts & provides for
distribution of such assessments. Amends 938.19. Effective Date:
10/01/2003.
02/24/03 SENATE Prefiled
03/04/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Judiciary; Comprehensive
Planning; Appropriations Subcommittee on Article V
Implementation and Judiciary; Appropriations
-SJ 00086
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Judiciary

H 1019 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by State Administration; (CO-SPONSORS)

Cantens; Mack (Similar S 1026)

Minor/Videotaped Statement/Pub. Rec.; amends specified provision re

public records exemption for any information in videotaped

statement of minor who is alleged to be or who is victim of sexual
battery, lewd acts, or other sexual misconduct which reveals
minor’s identity; makes editorial changes; adds clarifying
language; removes October 2, 2003, repeal thereof scheduled under

OGSR Act of 1995. Amends 119.07. Effective Date: 10/01/2003.

05/02/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 01114

05/28/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor

06/10/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-137

S 1026 PUBLIC RECORDS/GENERAL BILL by Criminal Justice; (CO-SPONSORS) Lynn

(Similar 1ST ENG/H 1019)

Videotaped Statement/Minor/Pub. Rec.; provides exemption from

public-records requirements for information in videotaped statement

held by law enforcement agency which reveals identity of certain
minors; provides for disclosure to another governmental entity;
requires that receiving governmental entity maintain
confidentiality of identifying information; abrogates repeal of
specified provision scheduled under OGSR Act of 1995. Amends

119.07; abrogates repeal of 119.07(3)2. Effective Date:

10/01/2003.

05/01/03 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 00856;
Substituted HB 1019 -SJ 01023; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB 1019 (Ch.
2003-137)

H 1091 **MEMORIAL by Hasner; (CO-SPONSORS) Altman; Cantens; Gottlieb;
Needelman; Rich; Sansom; Troutman; Zapata (ldentical S 1170,
Similar H 9021)
Israel; expresses solidarity with Israel in its fight against
terrorism.

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 46
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 1091 **(Continued)
03703703 HOUSE Prefiled
03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced, placed on Calendar -HJ 00089
05/02/03 HOUSE Died on Calendar, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to HR 9021 (Adopted)

S 1170 MEMORIAL by Cowin; (CO-SPONSORS) Bullard; Wise; Aronberg; Lawson;
Fasano; Webster; Campbell; Klein; Margolis; Wilson (ldentical
H 1091, Similar H 9021)

Israel; expresses solidarity with Israel in its fight against

terrorism.

04/10/03 SENATE Adopted -SJ 00380

04/16/03 HOUSE In Messages

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Messages, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to HR 9021 (Adopted)

H 9021 RESOLUTION by Hasner; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen; Altman; Ambler;
Anderson; Antone; Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Barreiro; Bean;
Bendross-Mindingall; Bense; Benson; Berfield; Bilirakis; Bowen;
Brandenburg; Brown; Brummer; Brutus; Bucher; Bullard; Byrd;
Cantens; Carassas; Clarke; Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D. Davis; M.
Davis; Dean; Detert; Domino; Evers; Farkas; Fields; Fiorentino;
Galvano; Gannon; Gardiner; Gelber; A. Gibson; H. Gibson; Goodlette;
Gottlieb; Green; Greenstein; Haridopolos; Harper; Harrell;
Harrington; Henriquez; Hogan; Holloway; Homan; Jennings; Johnson;
Jordan; Joyner; Justice; Kallinger; Kendrick; Kilmer; Kottkamp;
Kravitz; Kyle; Littlefield; Llorente; Machek; Mack; Mahon;
Mayfield; Mclnvale; Meadows; Mealor; Murman; Murzin; Needelman;
Negron; Patterson; Peterman; Pickens; Planas; Poppell; Prieguez;
Quinones; Reagan; Rich; Richardson; Ritter; Rivera; Robaina;
Roberson; Ross; Rubio; Russell; Ryan; Sansom; Seiler; Simmons;
Slosberg; Smith; Sobel; Sorensen; Spratt; Stansel; Stargel;
Troutman; Vana; Waters; Wiles; Wishner; Zapata (Similar H 1091,
S 1170)

Solidarity with Israel; expresses solidarity with Israel iIn its
fight against terrorism.

03/06/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00153

03/07/03 HOUSE Read second time -HJ 00159; Adopted -HJ 00160

H 1097 **JOINT RESOLUTION by Farkas; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens (Compare H 0345,
H 1109, H 1119, H 1877, S 0318, S 1506, S 1672)
Ratification of Amendment; constitutional amendment to iIncrease
vote required by voters to ratify amendment to State Constitution
from majority to two-thirds of those voting in election. Amends s.
5, Art. XI.
03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00089
03/07/03 HOUSE Referred to Ethics & Elections (PR); Procedures

-HJ 00166

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Ethics & Elections (PR)

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 47
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0345 JOINT RESOLUTION by Green; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Garcia; Kottkamp
(Compare H 1097, H 1109, H 1119, H 1877, S 0318, S 1506, S 1672)
Constitutional Amendment/Initiative; constitutional amendment to
increase vote required to pass amendment to or revision of State
Constitution proposed by initiative from majority of those electors
voting on matter in election to three-fifths of those electors
voting on matter in election. Amends s. 5, Art. XI.

03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced, referred to Ethics & Elections (PR);
Procedures; Judiciary -HJ 00044

03/11/03 HOUSE Withdrawn from Ethics & Elections (PR); Procedures;
Judiciary; Withdrawn from further consideration
-HJ 00171

H 1109 JOINT RESOLUTION by Hogan (Compare H 0345, H 1097, H 1119, H 1877,
S 0318, S 1506, S 1672)

Constitution/Amendment Ratification; constitutional amendment to

require that said amendments be approved by majority of voters in
majority of counties, as well as by majority of voters in state.

Amends s. 5, Art. XI.

03703703 HOUSE Prefiled

03/04/03 HOUSE Withdrawn prior to introduction

H 1119 JOINT RESOLUTION by Brandenburg (Similar S 1506, Compare H 0345,
H 1097, H 1109, H 1877, S 0318, S 1672)

Constitutional Amendment/lnitiatives; constitutional amendment to

reserve to electors the right to propose law by initiative process

& approve it by referendum; process would require approval from

3/5ths of electors voting on issue in order for proposed law to be

adopted, etc. Amends s. 1, Art. 111, s. 10, Art. 1V, s. 3 & 5, Art.

X1; creates s. 20, Art. 111.

03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00090

03/07/03 HOUSE Referred to Ethics & Elections (PR); Procedures
-HJ 00166

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Ethics & Elections (PR)

H 1877 JOINT RESOLUTION by Procedures; (CO-SPONSORS) Green; Hogan
(Compare H 0345, H 1097, H 1109, H 1119, S 0318, S 1506, S 1672)
Amendments/Revisions/Initiatives; constitutional amendment to
require signatures for initiative petitions to amend or revise
State Constitution to be gathered in three-fifths, rather than one
half, of congressional districts, & of state as whole, equal to ten
percent of votes cast in last presidential election & to increase
vote required to adopt amendment to or revision of constitution
from majority to two-thirds of electors voting in favor, etc.
Amends Art. X1, ss. 3 & 5.

04/16/03 HOUSE Filed; Introduced -HJ 00401
05/02/03 HOUSE Died, reference deferred

S 0318 JOINT RESOLUTION by Smith (Compare H 0345, H 1097, H 1109, H 1119,
H 1877, S 1506, S 1672)

Legislation by Initiative; constitutional amendment to allow
legislation to be proposed by initiative, unless i1t provides for
number or assignment of judges or jurisdiction of courts, 1Is

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



08/08/2003

06:30 PM

FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003

CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 48

Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 0318

S 1506

S 1672

(Continued)

constitutionally prohibited or requires passage by extraordinary

vote of Legislature, or changes boundaries of any municipality,

county, or special, legislative, or congressional district, etc.

Creates s. 20, Art. I1l1l; amends s. 10, Art. 1V, ss. 3 & 5, Art. XI.

03/04/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Ethics and Elections;
Judiciary; Rules and Calendar -SJ 00024

03/28/03 SENATE On Committee agenda-- Ethics and Elections,
04/02/03, 1:00 pm, 412-K --Temporarily postponed

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Ethics and Elections

JOINT RESOLUTION by Atwater (Similar H 1119, Compare H 0345,

H 1097, H 1109, H 1877, S 0318, S 1672)

Constitutional Amendments/Initiative; constitutional amendment that

would reserve to electors the right to propose laws by initiative

process & approve it by referendum & would require approval from

three-fifths of electors voting on issue in order for proposed law

to be adopted; such laws would not be subject to Governor’s veto

power & could not be amended or repealed by Legislature in its

first 2 years without extraordinary majority vote, etc. Amends Art.

I, Art. 1V, Art. XI.

03/04/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Ethics and Elections;
Judiciary; Appropriations; Rules and Calendar
-SJ 00081

03/28/03 SENATE On Committee agenda-- Ethics and Elections,
04/02/03, 1:00 pm, 412-K --Temporarily postponed

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Ethics and Elections

JOINT RESOLUTION by Posey (Compare H 0345, H 1097, H 1109, H 1119,

H 1877, S 0318, CS/CS/S 1172, S 1506)

Approval/Constitutional Amendments; (THIS BILL COMBINED IN

CS/CS/S1172,1672) constitutional amendment to require approval by

two-thirds, rather than simple majority, of electors voting on

proposed constitutional amendment. Amends s. 5, Art. XI.

04/14/03 SENATE CS combines this bill with CS/SJR 1172; CS/CS by
Judiciary; YEAS 8 NAYS O -SJ 00426; Original
bill laid on Table, refer to combined CS/CS/SB 1172
(Failed to Pass Senate)

H 1107 **GENERAL BILL by Jordan; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; D. Davis; Quinones

(CS by The Future of Florida’s Families) (Similar CS/S 0128,
Compare 2ND ENG/H 0835)

Children & Families; provides for court-ordered visitation for
grandparents & great-grandparents under certain circumstances;
provides for appointment of guardian ad litem & family mediation if
court makes preliminary finding that minor is threatened with
demonstrable significant mental or emotional harm without such
visitation; requires court-ordered evaluation of child if mediation
fails, etc. Amends Chs. 39, 63, 752, 61.13. Effective Date:

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED

BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 49
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 1107 **(Continued)
07/01/2003.
04/21/03 HOUSE Pending review of CS -under Rule 6.3(b)
04/25/03 HOUSE Placed on Calendar -HJ 00397
05/02/03 HOUSE Died on Calendar, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to HB 835 (Ch. 2003-58)

S 0128 GENERAL BILL/CS by Judiciary; Campbell; (CO-SPONSORS) Cowin
(Similar H 1107, Compare 2ND ENG/H 0835)

Children & Families; provides for court-ordered visitation for

grandparents & great-grandparents under certain circumstances;

provides for appointment of guardian ad litem & family mediation if

court makes preliminary finding that minor is threatened with

demonstrable significant mental or emotional harm without such

visitation; requires court-ordered evaluation of child if mediation

fails, etc. Amends Chs. 39, 63, 752, 61.13. Effective Date:

07/01/2003.

04/21/03 SENATE CS read first time on 04/23/03 -SJ 00513

04/22/03 SENATE Now in Appropriations Subcommittee on Article V
Implementation and Judiciary -SJ 00504

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Appropriations Subcommittee on
Article V Implementation and Judiciary,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB 835 (Ch.
2003-58)

H 0835 GENERAL BILL/2ND ENG by Mahon; (CO-SPONSORS) Ambler; Anderson;
Attkisson; Baxley; Benson; Berfield; Brummer; Clarke; Domino;
Galvano; Gannon; Homan; Joyner; Kilmer; Planas; Reagan; Rich;
Roberson; Stargel; Wishner (Linked H 0983, Identical CS/1ST
ENG/S 2456, Compare H 0011, H 1107, CS/S 0128, CS/S 2526)

Adoption; provides legislative findings & intent re rights &
responsibilities of adoptive children, biological parents, &
adoptive parents; provides for award of certain fees & costs in
event of fraud or duress at discretion of court; authorizes
child-placing agency to remove abandoned infant from placement
under certain circumstances; provides requirements for unmarried
biological father to establish parental rights, etc. Amends Ch. 63.
Effective Date: 05/30/2003.
04/28/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 00704
05/21/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
05/30/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-58; See also
CS/SB 2526 (Ch. 2003-56)

H 1155 **GENERAL BILL by Poppell; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen; Altman;
Ambler; Anderson; Antone; Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Barreiro;
Baxley; Bean; Bendross-Mindingall; Bense; Benson; Berfield;
Bilirakis; Bowen; Brandenburg; Brown; Brummer; Brutus; Bucher;
Bullard; Byrd; Cantens; Carassas; Clarke; Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D.
Davis; M. Davis; Dean; Detert; Domino; Evers; Farkas; Fields;

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 50
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 1155 **(Continued)

Fiorentino; Galvano; Gannon; Garcia; Gardiner; Gelber; A. Gibson;

H. Gibson; Goodlette; Gottlieb; Greenstein; Harper; Harrell;

Harrington; Hasner; Henriquez; Hogan; Holloway; Homan; Jennings;

Jordan; Joyner; Justice; Kallinger; Kendrick; Kilmer; Kosmas;

Kottkamp; Kravitz; Kyle; Littlefield; Llorente; Machek; Mack;

Mahon; Mayfield; Mclnvale; Meadows; Mealor; Murman; Murzin;

Needelman; Negron; Patterson; Paul; Peterman; Pickens; Planas;

Prieguez; Quinones; Reagan; Rich; Richardson; Ritter; Rivera;

Robaina; Roberson; Ross; Rubio; Russell; Ryan; Sansom; Seiler;

Simmons; Slosberg; Sobel; Sorensen; Spratt; Stansel; Stargel;

Troutman; Waters; Wiles; Wishner; Zapata (ldentical S 1698)

Challenger License Plates; renames Challenger license plate as

Challenger/Columbia license plate. Amends 320.08056, -08058.

Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

04/24/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 00594

05/19/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor

05/21/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-26

S 1698 GENERAL BILL by Posey; (CO-SPONSORS) Fasano; Webster; Lynn;

Haridopolos (ldentical H 1155)

Challenger License Plates; renames Challenger license plate as

Challenger/Columbia license plate. Amends 320.08056, -08058.

Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

04/16/03 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 00423;
Substituted HB 1155 -SJ 00412; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB 1155 (Ch.
2003-26)

H 1185 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Ambler; (CO-SPONSORS) Brutus; Cantens;
Rivera; Robaina; Troutman; Zapata (Similar CS/CS/S 1020, S 1984,
Compare CS/CS/2ND ENG/S 1492)
Courts; amends certain provisions re various court procedures &
various admin. & judicial proceedings; provides that any judge
setting or granting bail shall set separate bail amount for each
charge or offense; provides for standard conditions of pretrial
release without trial judge stating such conditions on record;
provides that judge at First appearance may not reduce bail set by
another judge issuing arrest warrant, etc. Amends FS. Effective
Date: 07/01/2003.
05/01/03 HOUSE Ordered engrossed -HJ 00982
05/02/03 HOUSE Temporarily postponed, on Third Reading -HJ 01086;

Died on Calendar

S 1020 GENERAL BILL/CS/CS by Judiciary; Criminal Justice; Campbell
(Similar 1ST ENG/H 1185, S 1984, Compare CS/CS/2ND ENG/S 1492)
Court Procedures; amends certain provisions re various court
procedures & various admin. & judicial proceedings; provides that
any judge setting or granting bail shall set separate bail amount

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 51
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 1020 (Continued)
for each charge or offense; provides for standard conditions of
pretrial release without trial judge stating such conditions on
record; provides that judge at First appearance may not reduce bail
set by another judge issuing arrest warrant, etc. Amends FS.
Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
05/02/03 SENATE Pending amendment withdrawn -SJ 01074; Amendment(s)
adopted -SJ 01074; Died on Calendar
S 1984 GENERAL BILL by Campbell (Similar 1ST ENG/H 1185, CS/CS/S 1020,
Compare CS/CS/2ND ENG/S 1492)
Magistrates & Masters; amends certain provisions re various court
procedures; redesignates "magistrates™ as 'trial court judges';
amends certain provisions re various administrative & judicial
proceedings; redesignates "masters”™ & "‘general or special masters"
as ''general or special magistrates”™. Amends FS. Effective Date:
10/01/2003.
03/04/03 SENATE Filed
03/18/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Judiciary; Governmental
Oversight and Productivity; Appropriations
Subcommittee on Article V Implementation and
Judiciary; Appropriations -SJ 00201
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Judiciary
S 1492 GENERAL BILL/CS/CS/2ND ENG by Appropriations; Finance and Taxation;
Smith (Compare 1ST ENG/H 1185, H 1929, CS/CS/S 1020, CS/CS/1ST
ENG/S 1168, CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1184, S 1358, S 1984)
Judicial System; modifies county revenue & expenditure reporting
requirements; authorizes clerk to dispose of items of physical
evidence in cases where no collateral attack is pending;
establishes Clerk of Court Operations Conference; provides that
counties may continue to fund legal aid programs as local
requirement with funds approved by board of county commissioners;
continues fee imposed on certain payments of alimony & child
support, etc. Amends FS. Effective Date: 05/01/2004 except as
otherwise provided.
05/01/03 SENATE CS passed as amended; YEAS 40 NAYS O -SJ 00862
05/01/03 HOUSE In Messages
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Messages, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to HB 113-A (Ch. 2003-402)

H 1253 **GENERAL BILL by Peterman; (CO-SPONSORS) Antone; Bullard; Cantens;
Detert; Harper; Holloway; Kendrick; Quinones; Roberson (Similar
CS/S 2558)
Worker Safety/Agric. Pesticides; creates "Fla. Agricultural Worker
Safety Act'; provides for enforcement of federal worker protection
regulations; requires agricultural employers to make agricultural
pesticide info. available to workers, designated representatives &
medical personnel; prohibits agricultural employers from failing to

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 52
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 1253 **(Continued)
provide required information & from taking retaliatory action
against workers for exercising their rights, etc. Creates
487.2011-.2071. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/14/03 HOUSE Favorable by Commerce; YEAS 16 NAYS 0 -HJ 00394
04/21/03 HOUSE Now in Agriculture -HJ 00394
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Agriculture

S 2558 GENERAL BILL/CS by Agriculture; Hill; (CO-SPONSORS) Bullard; Siplin
(Similar H 1253)
Fla. Agricultural Worker Safety Act; creates said act; provides for
enforcement of federal worker protection regulations; requires
agricultural employers to make agricultural pesticide information
available to workers, designated representatives & medical
personnel; prohibits agricultural employers from failing to provide
required information & from taking retaliatory action against
workers for exercising their rights, etc. Creates 487.2011-.2071.
Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/22/03 SENATE CS read first time on 04/23/04 -SJ 00529
04/23/03 SENATE Now in Health, Aging, and Long-Term Care -SJ 00505
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Health, Aging, and Long-Term

Care

H 1287 **GENERAL BILL by Barreiro; (CO-SPONSORS) Bullard; Cantens; Kottkamp;
Llorente; Reagan; Rivera (CS by Public Safety & Crime Prevention)
(Compare S 1328)

Criminal Offenses Against Elderly; provides for mandatory term of
imprisonment for certain thefts against persons 65 years of age or
older; changes dollar values which constitute differing levels of
offense; provides for mandatory term of imprisonment for certain
acts of exploitation against elderly person or disabled adult;
ranks such offenses on offense severity ranking chart of Criminal
Punishment Code. Amends 812.0145, 825.103, 921.0022. Effective
Date: 07/01/2003.
04/25/03 HOUSE Withdrawn from Appropriations -HJ 00648; Placed on
Calendar
05/02/03 HOUSE Died on Calendar
S 1328 GENERAL BILL by Fasano (Compare H 1287)
Criminal Offenses Against Elderly; provides for reclassification of
felonies committed against elderly or disabled; provides for
reclassification of misdemeanors committed against persons 65 years
of age or older; provides for mandatory term of imprisonment for
certain thefts against persons 65 years of age or older, etc.
Creates 775.0847; amends 784.08, 812.0145, 825.103. Effective
Date: 07/01/2003.
03703703 SENATE Referred to Judiciary; Criminal Justice;
Appropriations Subcommittee on Criminal Justice;
Appropriations

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



08/08/2003

06:30 PM

FLORIDA LEGISLATURE - REGULAR SESSION - 2003

CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 53

Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 1328

(Continued)

03/04/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Judiciary; Criminal
Justice; Appropriations Subcommittee on Criminal
Justice; Appropriations -SJ 00070

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Judiciary

H 1311 **GENERAL BILL by Baxley; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens (Similar S 2022)

S 2022

Physician Assistants; requires additional continuing medical

education in clinical & legal aspects of prescribing controlled

substances; removes controlled substances from formulary of

medicinal drugs a physician assistant may not prescribe; includes

physician assistants in definition of "practitioner™ under Drug

Abuse & Prevention Control law, to authorize them to prescribe

controlled substances. Amends 458.347, 459.022, 893.02. Effective

Date: 07/01/2003.

03/11/03 HOUSE Referred to Health Standards (HC); Health Care;
Appropriations -HJ 00184

04/22/03 HOUSE Withdrawn from Health Standards (HC); Health Care;
Appropriations; Withdrawn from further
consideration -HJ 00459

GENERAL BILL by Clary (Similar H 1311)

Physician Assistants; revises continuing medical education

requirements re prescribing of controlled substances by physician

assistants; deletes prohibitions against prescribing of controlled

substances by physician assistants; revises definition of term

"practitioner™ for purposes of Florida Comprehensive Drug Abuse

Prevention & Control Act to include physician assistant. Amends

458.347, 459.022, 893.02. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

03/18/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Health, Aging, and
Long-Term Care; Criminal Justice; Appropriations
Subcommittee on Health and Human Services -SJ 00203

03/26/03 SENATE Also referred to Appropriations -SJ 00262

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Health, Aging, and Long-Term
Care

H 1369 **GENERAL BILL by Henriquez; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens (ldentical

S 1870)

Nicholas lsaac Cordero Act; creates said act; requires person who

knows that crime is being committed to report crime to law

enforcement officer, under specified circumstances, iIf crime

exposes victim to serious bodily injury likely to cause death;

provides penalties; provides exceptions. Creates 877.31. Effective

Date: Upon becoming law.

03/06/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00139

03/11/03 HOUSE Referred to Criminal Justice (PS); Public Safety &
Crime Prevention; Judiciary -HJ 00184

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED

BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 54
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 1369 **(Continued)
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Criminal Justice (PS)

S 1870 GENERAL BILL by Diaz de la Portilla (ldentical H 1369)
Nicholas lsaac Cordero Act; creates said act; requires person who
knows that crime is being committed to report crime to law
enforcement officer, under specified circumstances, iIf crime
exposes victim to serious bodily injury likely to cause death;
provides penalties; provides exceptions. Creates 877.31. Effective
Date: Upon becoming law.
03/04/03 SENATE Filed
03718703 SENATE Introduced, referred to Criminal Justice;

Judiciary; Rules and Calendar -SJ 00193

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Criminal Justice

H 1375 **GENERAL BILL by Reagan; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens (CS by Local

Government & Veterans” Affairs) (Similar CS/CS/S 0518, Compare

H 0317, H 0397, CS/CS/2ND ENG/S 0574, S 2730, S 2836)

Florida Building Code/Elevators; applies code requirements to

certain additional structures; provides requirements, procedures,

limitations, & criteria for regional emergency elevator access;
revises specific powers of Fla. Bldg. Commission; provides for
interpretations of building code by certain entities; exempts truss
placement plans from certain requirements; prohibits certain
installations of fireworks or pyrotechnic devices in certain
facilities, etc. Amends FS. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

04/28/03 HOUSE Pending review of CS under Rule 6.3(b)

04/29/03 HOUSE Placed on Calendar

05/02/03 HOUSE Died on Calendar

S 0518 GENERAL BILL/CS/CS by Comprehensive Planning; Regulated Industries;

Constantine (Similar H 1375, Compare H 0317, H 0397, CS/CS/2ND

ENG/S 0574, S 2730, S 2836)

Florida Building Code/Elevators; provides code amendment criteria &

review requirements; provides requirements re regional emergency

elevator access; revises duties of Fla. Building Commission;
provides legislative intent re interpretation of Fla. Building

Code; exempts truss placement plans from certain requirements;

revises Building Code Training Program; establishes penalties for

unauthorized use of fireworks & pyrotechnic devices, etc. Amends

FS. Effective Date: Upon becoming law except as otherwise

provided.

04/28/03 SENATE Withdrawn from Banking and Insurance -SJ 00672; Now
in Appropriations Subcommittee on Transportation
and Economic Development

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Appropriations Subcommittee on
Transportation and Economic Development

H 0317 GENERAL BILL by Benson (CS by Local Government & Veterans” Affairs)

(Compare H 1375, CS/CS/S 0518, CS/CS/2ND ENG/S 0574)

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 55
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 0317 (Continued)
Florida Building Commission; specifies legislative approval of
certain recommendations of said commission re certain provisions of
Florida Building Code; requires commission to adopt certain
provisions as part of said code; provides legislative findings;
exempts adoption of such provisions from certain requirements of
law or commission rules; increases membership on Elevator Safety
Technical Advisory Committee; deletes obsolete requirement, etc.
Amends 399.106. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.
04/22/03 HOUSE Pending review of CS under Rule 6.3(b)
04/25/03 HOUSE Now in Commerce -HJ 00463
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Commerce

H 0397 GENERAL BILL by Kallinger; (CO-SPONSORS) Bullard; Richardson (CS by
Business Regulation) (Compare H 1375, CS/CS/S 0518, CS/CS/2ND
ENG/S 0574)
Emergency Elevator Access; provides requirements re regional
emergency elevator access; requires elevators in certain newly
constructed or substantially renovated buildings to be keyed alike
within each of state emergency response regions; provides for these
requirements to be phased in for certain existing buildings; allows
local fire marshals to allow substitute emergency measures for
elevator access in certain circumstances, etc. Effective Date:
07/01/2003.
05/02/03 HOUSE Placed on Special Order Calendar; Temporarily

postponed, on Second Reading -HJ 01093; Died on
Calendar

S 0574 GENERAL BILL/CS/CS/2ND ENG by Comprehensive Planning; Regulated
Industries; Constantine; (CO-SPONSORS) Crist (Compare H 0317,
H 0397, H 0703, H 1375, CS/CS/S 0518, S 2836)
Fla. Building Code; provides requirements re regional emergency
elevator access; establishes penalties for unauthorized use of
fireworks & pyrotechnic devices; includes hospice facilities in
Florida Building Code; deletes requirements to adopt physical plant
standards for hospice; requires life-cycle, cost-analysis in
selection of public school facilities, etc. Amends 399.106, .13,
633.171, 553.73, 400.605, 1013.45; creates 400.6055. Effective
Date: 07/01/2003.
05/02/03 SENATE CS passed as amended; YEAS 38 NAYS O -SJ 01117
05/02/03 HOUSE In Messages; Died in Messages

S 2730 GENERAL BILL by Bennett (Compare H 1375, CS/CS/S 0518)
Florida Building Code; exempts truss placement plans from certain
requirements; authorizes local governments to impose certain fees
for code enforcement; deletes Fla. Building Commission authority to
adopt certain rules & enter into certain contracts to administer
product evaluation & approval system; deletes provisions re local
or statewide approval of products or methods or systems of
construction, etc. Amends 553.73,.77,.79,.80,.842. Effective Date:
Upon becoming law.

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 56
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 2730 (Continued)
04/10/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Comprehensive Planning;
Finance and Taxation -SJ 00385
04/16/03 SENATE On Committee agenda-- Comprehensive Planning,
04/21/03, 8:45 am, 412-K --Temporarily postponed
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Comprehensive Planning
S 2836 GENERAL BILL by Haridopolos (Compare H 1375, CS/CS/S 0518,
CS/CS/2ND ENG/S 0574)
Pyrotechnic Devices; provides that operation of pyrotechnic devices
or fireworks iIn indoor facility under certain conditions 1is
third-degree felony. Amends 633.171. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/09/03 SENATE Filed -SJ 00303
04/16/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Comprehensive Planning;
Commerce, Economic Opportunities, and Consumer
Services; Criminal Justice; Judiciary -SJ 00429
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Comprehensive Planning

H 1405 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Machek; (CO-SPONSORS) Attkisson; Bullard;

Cantens; Mclnvale; Rubio (Similar CS/1ST ENG/S 2260, Compare

H 1069, CS/S 2316)

Water Policy; deletes provision requiring legislative approval to

abolish or combine basins existing within SWFWMD; authorizes basin

board boundaries within SWFWMD to be amended by governing board

resolution; revises criteria to be applied in determining priority

of water bodies under surface water & management plans & programs;

provides for transfer of land & other incidentals from St. Johns

River Water Management Dist. to SWFWMD, etc. Amends Chs. 373, 403,

259.101. Effective Date: Upon becoming law except as otherwise

provided.

04/30/03 HOUSE Ordered engrossed -HJ 00969

05/02/03 HOUSE Substituted CS/SB 2260; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to CS/SB 2260
(Ch. 2003-265) -HJ 01058

S 2260 GENERAL BILL/CS/1ST ENG by Natural Resources; Dockery (Similar 1ST

ENG/H 1405, Compare H 0407, CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 0554, CS/S 2316)

Water Policy; deletes provision requiring legislative approval to

abolish or combine basins existing within SWFWMD; redefines term

“"interdistrict transfer & use'; revises legislative intent re

Surface Water Improvement & Management Act; revises criteria to be

applied in determining priority of water bodies under surface water

improvement & management plans & programs; revises boundaries of

St. Johns River & SWFWMD, etc. Amends Chs. 373, 403, 259.101.

Effective Date: 06/26/2003 except as otherwise provided.

05/02/03 SENATE Ordered enrolled -SJ 01163

06/26/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor;
Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-265; See
also CS/CS/SB 554 (Ch. 2003-64)

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 57
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 1069 GENERAL BILL by Russell (CS by Natural Resources) (Similar

CS/S 2758, Compare 1ST ENG/H 1363, 1ST ENG/H 1405, 2ND ENG/H 1459,

S 0662, CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1312, CS/S 2316)

Water Resources; requires local governments to include projected

water use in comprehensive plans; revises procedure for fixing &

changing rates to include recovery of costs of alternative water

supply facilities; provides for water conservation guidance manual;

provides for public workshop on development of regional water

supply plans that include consideration of population projections;

allows for limited transfer of water, etc. Amends FS. Effective

Date: Upon becoming law.

04/21/03 HOUSE Pending review of CS -under Rule 6.3(b)

04/25/03 HOUSE Placed on Calendar -HJ 00385

05/02/03 HOUSE Died on Calendar

S 2316 GENERAL BILL/CS by Communication and Public Utilities; Atwater;

(CO-SPONSORS) Siplin (Compare H 1005, H 1069, 1ST ENG/H 1363, 1ST

ENG/H 1405, 2ND ENG/H 1459, CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1312, CS/1ST

ENG/S 2260, CS/S 2758)

Water Supplies; provides for development of water conservation

guidance manual by DEP; provides for purpose & contents of manual &

requirements with respect thereto; requires DEP to adopt manual by

rule by specified date; requires public water supply utilities to

develop water conservation programs based upon options contained in

manual ; authorizes DEP to grant variances from mining reclamation

activities, etc. Amends Chs. 373, 403, 378.212,.404. Effective

Date: Upon becoming law.

05701703 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 00856

05/02/03 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 01053; Died on
Calendar, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to
CS/SB 2260 (Ch. 2003-265)

H 1411 **GENERAL BILL by Rivera; (CO-SPONSORS) Bullard; Cantens; M. Davis;
Garcia; Llorente; Planas; Robaina; Rubio; Zapata (ldentical
S 2778)
Schools/Relief from Overcrowding; establishes the S.C.R.I1.P.T.
grants program for school overcrowing relief; provides popular
name; provides findings, intent, & purposes; provided definition;
provides school district, parent, & DOE obligations; provides
private school eligibility requirements; provides for initial
award, renewal, & disbursement of S_.C.R.I.P.T. grants; limits
liability of state re award or use of said grant. Creates 1013.215.
Effective Date: Upon becoming law.
04/23/03 HOUSE Favorable by Education K-20; YEAS 15 NAYS 8

-HJ 00525; Now in Appropriations -HJ 00525

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Appropriations

S 2778 GENERAL BILL by Haridopolos; (CO-SPONSORS) Fasano; Webster
(ldentical H 1411)
Schools/Relief from Overcrowding; establishes the S.C.R.I1.P.T.

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 58
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 2778 (Continued)

grants program for school overcrowding relief; provides popular

name; provides findings, intent, & purposes; provided definition;

provides school district, parent, & DOE obligations; provides

private school eligibility requirements; provides for initial

award, renewal, & disbursement of S_.C.R.I.P.T. grants; limits

liability of state re award or use of said grant. Creates 1013.215.

Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

04/04/03 SENATE Filed -SJ 00303

04/10/03 SENATE Introduced, referred to Education; Appropriations
Subcommittee on Education; Appropriations -SJ 00390

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Education

H 1475 **GENERAL BILL by Ambler; (CO-SPONSORS) Allen; Anderson; Bean;
Bullard; Cantens; Clarke; Domino; Evers; Fiorentino; Galvano;
Greenstein; Harrell; Hasner; Homan; Justice; Kosmas; Kottkamp;
Llorente; Murzin; Needelman; Reagan; Robaina; Sansom; Stargel;
Zapata (CS by Judiciary) (ldentical CS/2ND ENG/S 1098, Compare
H 0477, H 0489, H 0505, H 1415, 1ST ENG/H 1745, 2ND ENG/S 0482,
CS/S 0570, 2ND ENG/S 0594, CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1168)

Uniformed Servicemembers Protection; creates "Florida Uniformed

Servicemembers Protection Act'; provides for applicability of

specified federal laws to servicemembers when serving on active

duty or state active duty; prohibits retaliatory action by landlord
for termination of rental agreement by servicemember; prohibits
landlord from discriminating against servicemember in offering
dwelling unit for rent or in any of terms of rental agreement, etc.

Amends FS. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

04/29/03 HOUSE Placed on Special Order Calendar; Substituted CS/SB
1098; Laid on Table, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to CS/SB 1098 (Ch. 2003-72), SB 482 (Ch.
2003-30) -HJ 00735

S 1098 GENERAL BILL/CS/2ND ENG by Military and Veterans” Affairs, Base
Protection, and Spaceports; Fasano; (CO-SPONSORS) Lynn; Crist;
Haridopolos; Atwater (ldentical H 1475, Compare H 0477, H 0489,

H 0505, H 1415, 1ST ENG/H 1745, 2ND ENG/S 0482, CS/S 0570, 2ND

ENG/S 0594, CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1168)

Uniformed Servicemembers Protection; creates "Florida Uniformed

Servicemembers Protection Act'; provides for applicability of

specified federal laws to servicemembers when serving on active

duty or state active duty; prohibits retaliatory action by landlord
for termination of rental agreement by servicemember; prohibits
landlord from discriminating against servicemember in offering
dwelling unit for rent or in any of terms of rental agreement, etc.

Amends FS. Effective Date: 06/02/2003.

05/02/03 SENATE Ordered engrossed, then enrolled -SJ 01125

05/22/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 59
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 1098 (Continued)

06702703 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-72; See also
SB 482 (Ch. 2003-30)

H 0477 GENERAL BILL by Patterson; (CO-SPONSORS) Littlefield; Quinones (CS
by Judiciary) (Similar 2ND ENG/S 0482, Compare H 0505, H 1475,
CS/2ND ENG/S 1098)

Rental Agreements; removes provisions requiring payment of

liquidated damages to landlord under certain circumstances upon

termination of rental agreement; prohibits landlord from
discriminating against member of United States Armed Forces in
offering dwelling unit for rent; provides that rental agreement
having specific duration may require tenant to give notice before

vacating premises, etc. Amends 83.682,.67; creates 83.575.

Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

04/25/03 HOUSE Placed on Special Order Calendar; Substituted SB
482; Laid on Table, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to SB 482 (Ch. 2003-30), CS/SB 1098 (Ch.
2003-72) -HJ 00618

H 0489 GENERAL BILL by Quinones; (CO-SPONSORS) Rivera; Troutman (CS by
Insurance) (Similar CS/S 0570, Compare 2ND ENG/H 0513, H 1475, 2ND
ENG/S 0594, CS/2ND ENG/S 1098)

Members of U.S. Armed Services; authorizes certain entities to

charge for & include optional waiver of liability provision in

certain contracts under certain circumstances; provides
limitations; requires insurer to refund entire unearned premium to
any member of armed services who cancels policy under certain
circumstances. Creates 624.105; amends 627.7283. Effective Date:

Upon becoming law.

04/14/03 HOUSE Pending review of CS under Rule 6.3(b)

04/15/03 HOUSE Now in Veterans” & Military Affairs (LGV) -HJ 00392

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Veterans” & Military Affairs
(LGV), Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB
513 (Ch. 2003-281), CS/SB 1098 (Ch. 2003-72)

H 0505 GENERAL BILL by Quinones; (CO-SPONSORS) Rivera (Compare H 0477,

H 1475, 2ND ENG/S 0482, CS/2ND ENG/S 1098)

Termination of Rental Agreements; removes provisions requiring

payment of liquidated damages to landlord under certain

circumstances upon termination of rental agreement by members of

United States Armed Forces. Amends 83.682. Effective Date: Upon

becoming law.

02/26/03 HOUSE Referred to Judiciary; Veterans” & Military Affairs
(LGV); Local Government & Veterans” Affairs

03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced, referred to Judiciary; Veterans’ &
Military Affairs (LGV); Local Government &
Veterans” Affairs -HJ 00055

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Judiciary,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to SB 482 (Ch.
2003-30), CS/SB 1098 (Ch. 2003-72)

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 60
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 1415 GENERAL BILL by Hogan; (CO-SPONSORS) Clarke; Galvano (CS by
Transportation) (Similar CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 1168, Compare 1ST
ENG/H 0189, H 0677, H 1209, H 1475, H 1513, 1ST ENG/H 1605, CS/1ST
ENG/S 0676, CS/CS/S 0682, CS/2ND ENG/S 1098, S 1272, CS/S 2128,
CS/CS/S 2658)

Motor Vehicles; revises definition of "off-highway vehicle™;
revises provisions for mailing citations for violating toll
facility; revises provisions re unlawful speed; deletes provision
prohibiting speeding in posted school zone; deletes provision for
expedited service for duplicate certificate of title to off-highway
vehicles & charge thereof; revises requirements for establishing
specialty license plate, etc. Amends FS. Effective Date:
10/01/2003 except as otherwise provided.
04/14/03 HOUSE Favorable by Finance & Tax; YEAS 19 NAYS 3
-HJ 00398; Now in Appropriations -HJ 00398
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Appropriations,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to CS/SB 676
(Ch. 2003-286), CS/SB 1098 (Ch. 2003-72)

H 1745 GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Education K-20; (CO-SPONSORS) Brummer;
Kilmer (Compare 1ST ENG/H 0319, H 1475, H 1831, CS/S 0354, CS/2ND
ENG/S 1098, CS/CS/S 1520, S 1798)

Higher Education Finance Policy; revises provisions re
determination of resident status for tuition purposes; provides for
classification of certain graduate teaching assistants or graduate
research assistants; amends provisions re Fla. Bright Futures
Scholarship Program; revises initial eligibility criteria for Fla.
Academic Scholarship & for Fla. Medallion Scholarship; provides for
subsidies to public postsecondary education institutions, etc.
Amends Ch. 1009, 1002.41. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
05/01/03 SENATE In Messages
05/02/03 SENATE Received, referred to Education; Appropriations
Subcommittee on Education; Appropriations
-SJ 01160; Died in Committee on Education,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to CS/SB 354
(Ch. 2003-89), CS/SB 1098 (Ch. 2003-72), HB 51-A
(Ch. 2003-392)

S 0482 GENERAL BILL/2ND ENG by Lynn; (CO-SPONSORS) Fasano; Argenziano;
Atwater (Similar H 0477, Compare H 0505, H 1475, CS/2ND
ENG/S 1098)

Rental Agreements; removes provisions requiring payment of
liquidated damages to landlord under certain circumstances upon
termination of rental agreement; prohibits landlord from
discriminating against member of United States Armed Forces in
offering dwelling unit for rent; provides for termination of
tenancy having specific duration; requires tenant to give notice
before vacating premises, etc. Amends 83.682,.67; creates 83.575.
Effective Date: 05/23/2003.

04/28/03 SENATE Ordered enrolled -SJ 00784

05/13/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 61
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 0482 (Continued)

05/23/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-30; See also
CS/SB 1098 (Ch. 2003-72)

S 0570 GENERAL BILL/CS by Judiciary; Fasano; (CO-SPONSORS) Cowin (Similar

H 0489, Compare H 1475, 2ND ENG/S 0594, CS/2ND ENG/S 1098)
U.S. Armed Forces/Rights of Members; requires insurer to refund
entire unearned premium of motor vehicle insurance to any member of
United States Armed Forces who cancels policy under certain
circumstances. Amends 627.7283. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.
04/02/03 HOUSE In Messages
04/18/03 HOUSE Received, referred to Insurance Regulation (IN);
Insurance; Veterans” & Military Affairs (LGV);
Local Government & Veterans” Affairs -HJ 00408
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Insurance Regulation (IN),
Link/1den/Sim/Compare passed, refer to CS/SB 1098
(Ch. 2003-72)

S 0594 GENERAL BILL/2ND ENG by Fasano; (CO-SPONSORS) Posey; Crist
(Similar CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 2152, Compare H 0489, H 0661, H 1475, 1ST
ENG/H 1687, CS/CS/S 0186, CS/S 0570, CS/2ND ENG/S 1098)

Military Affairs; requires insurer to refund entire unearned
premium to any member of armed services who cancels policy under
certain circumstances; provides for consideration of compatibility
with military installations in developing future land use element
to comprehensive plan; requires such agreements to be consistent
with adopted comp. plans or amendments to such plans adopted within
one year after agreement execution, etc. Amends Ch. 163, 627.7283.
Effective Date: Upon becoming law.
05/01/03 SENATE Passed as amended; YEAS 39 NAYS O -SJ 00874
05/01/03 HOUSE In Messages
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Messages, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to CS/SB 1098 (Ch. 2003-72)

S 1168 GENERAL BILL/CS/CS/1ST ENG by Appropriations; Transportation;
Sebesta (Similar H 1415, Compare H 1209, H 1475, H 1513, CS/2ND
ENG/S 1098, S 1272, CS/CS/2ND ENG/S 1492, CS/S 2128)

Motor Vehicles; includes airbags & airbag assemblies within
definition of term "major component part” for purposes of
provisions prohibiting operation of chop shop & authorizes seizure
& forfeiture of parts & vehicles; provides common wheelchair is not
motor vehicle; amends provision re expedited issuance of duplicate
certificates of title of off-highway vehicles; provides for display
of license plate on wreckers, etc. Amends FS. Effective Date:
10/01/2003 except as otherwise provided.
04/30/03 SENATE CS passed as amended; YEAS 40 NAYS O -SJ 00804
04/30/03 HOUSE In Messages
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Messages, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to CS/SB 1098 (Ch. 2003-72)

**ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 62
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 1515 **GENERAL BILL by Reagan; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Llorente; Planas;
Zapata (CS by The Future of Florida’s Families) (Similar
CS/S 0480)
Commission on Marriage & Family; provides legislative findings &
intent; creates Commission on Marriage & Family Support Initiatives
within CFS Dept. for administrative purposes; requires development
of certain documents; provides for coordination with other
organizations & entities; provides for funding of commission;
repeals provisions re Commission on Responsible Fatherhood &
community-based programs to encourage responsible fatherhood, etc.
Repeals 383.0112-.0114. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/30/03 HOUSE Placed on Special Order Calendar; Substituted CS/SB

480; Laid on Table, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,
refer to CS/SB 480 (Ch. 2003-122) -HJ 00880

S 0480 GENERAL BILL/CS by Governmental Oversight and Productivity; Lynn;
(CO-SPONSORS) Atwater (Similar H 1515)
Commission on Marriage & Family; provides legislative findings &
intent; creates Commission on Marriage & Family Support Initiatives
within CFS Dept.; provides for membership; provides scope of
activity; provides for coordination with other organizations &
entities; provides for funding of commission; repeals provisions re
Commission on Responsible Fatherhood & community-based programs to
encourage responsible fatherhood. Repeals 383.0112-.0114.
Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
05/01/03 SENATE Ordered enrolled -SJ 01057
05/27/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
06/10/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-122

H 1527 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by H. Gibson; (CO-SPONSORS) Baxley; Bullard;
Cantens; Domino; Greenstein; Harrell; Jennings; Justice; Kravitz;
Roberson; Vana (Similar CS/S 1116, Compare CS/S 2750)
Florida Alzheimer’s Training Act; prescribes training standards for
employees of home health agencies, adult day care centers, &
hospices, respectively, that provide care for persons who have
Alzheimer’s disease or related disorders; prescribes duties of
Elderly Affairs Dept.; provides for compliance with guidelines
within certain time period; provides for approval of Alzheimer’s
training & trainers, etc. Amends 400.4785, .5571,.6045. Effective
Date: 07/01/2003.
05/02/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 01113
06/26/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor;

Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-271

S 1116 GENERAL BILL/CS by Health, Aging, and Long-Term Care; Saunders;
(CO-SPONSORS) Fasano; Crist (Similar 1ST ENG/H 1527, Compare
CS/S 2750)
Florida Alzheimer’s Training Act; creates said act; prescribes
training standards for employees of home health agencies, adult day
care centers, & hospices, respectively, that provide care for

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 63
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 1116 (Continued)

persons who have Alzheimer’s disease or related disorders;

prescribes duties of Elderly Affairs Dept.; provides for compliance

with guidelines within certain time period; provides for approval
of Alzheimer’s training & trainers, etc. Amends

400.4785,.5571,.6045. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.

05/02/03 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 01053;
Substituted HB 1527 -SJ 01119; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB 1527 (Ch.
2003-271)

S 2750 GENERAL BILL/CS by Health, Aging, and Long-Term Care; Peaden;

(CO-SPONSORS) Bullard (Compare 1ST ENG/H 1527, H 1647, 1ST

ENG/H 1713, 1ST ENG/H 1925, CS/CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 0562, CS/CS/1ST

ENG/S 0572, CS/CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 0698, CS/S 1116, S 1912, CS/1ST

ENG/S 2212, CS/CS/1ST ENG/S 2390, CS/S 2618, CS/CS/S 2738)

Health Care; provides for Health Dept. rather than CFS Dept. to

manage Raymond C. Philips Research & Education Unit; revises

standard under which patient’s access to his or her own clinical
records may be restricted; provides for release of certain nursing
home resident records to Health Dept. pursuant to subpoena;
provides requirements for persons to become certified geriatric
specialists, etc. Amends FS. Appropriation: $157,017. Effective

Date: 07/01/2003 except as otherwise provided.

05/01/03 SENATE Amendment pending -SJ 00878

05/02/03 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 01053; Died on
Calendar, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB
1527 (Ch. 2003-271)

H 1529 **GENERAL BILL by Robaina; (CO-SPONSORS) Allen; Ambler; Antone;
Barreiro; Bendross-Mindingall; Bullard; Cantens; Garcia; Harper;
Henriquez; Holloway; Homan; Jennings; Llorente; Planas; Prieguez;
Quinones; Rich; Roberson; Rubio; Zapata (CS by The Future of
Florida’s Families) (Similar CS/S 2096)

Nursing Home Facilities; provides that AHCA require nursing homes
to provide wage or benefit increases for certain staff members;
provides for computation of such increases; provides exclusions;
provides for monitoring by agency; provides exemptions. Effective
Date: 07/01/2003.

04/23/03 HOUSE Pending review of CS under Rule 6.3(b)

04/25/03 HOUSE Now in Health Care -HJ 00397

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Health Care

S 2096 GENERAL BILL/CS by Health, Aging, and Long-Term Care; Wasserman
Schultz; (CO-SPONSORS) Siplin; Wilson; Margolis; Argenziano;
Dawson; Hill; Diaz de la Portilla (Similar H 1529)

Nursing Homes; requires increase in wages & benefits of specified
nursing home staff; provides for use of wage or benefit funds;
requires AHCA to monitor compliance with act; provides exception.

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 64
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 2096 (Continued)
Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
04/22/03 SENATE Favorable by Appropriations Subcommittee on Health
and Human Services; YEAS 3 NAYS 2 -SJ 00505
04/23/03 SENATE Now in Appropriations -SJ 00505
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Appropriations

H 1585 **GENERAL BILL by Hogan; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Planas; Roberson
Criminal Prosecution/Time Limitation; provides longer statute of
limitations for certain criminal offenses; provides exception.
Amends 775.15. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

03/07/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00161

03/14/03 HOUSE Referred to Public Safety & Crime Prevention
-HJ 00223

05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Public Safety & Crime
Prevention

H 1675 **GENERAL BILL by Prieguez; (CO-SPONSORS) Bullard; Cantens
(ldentical S 0158)
Facilitating or Furthering Burglary; defines term "burglary';
provides that it is third-degree felony for person to damage wire
or line that transmits or conveys telephone or power to dwelling or
to otherwise impair or impede such telephone or power transmission
or conveyance for purpose of facilitating or furthering commission
or attempted commission of burglary of dwelling, etc. Creates
810.061; reenacts 810.02(1)(b); amends 921.0022. Effective Date:

07/01/2003.

04/28/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 00704

05/19/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
06702703 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-84

S 0158 GENERAL BILL by Villalobos (ldentical H 1675)

Facilitating or Furthering Burglary; defines term "burglary';

provides that it is third-degree felony for person to damage wire

or line that transmits or conveys telephone or power to dwelling or

to otherwise impair or impede such telephone or power transmission

or conveyance for purpose of facilitating or furthering commission

or attempted commission of burglary of dwelling, etc. Creates

810.061; reenacts 810.02(1)(b); amends 921.0022. Effective Date:

07/01/2003.

04/25/03 SENATE Read second time -SJ 00623

04/28/03 SENATE Substituted HB 1675 -SJ 00662; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB 1675 (Ch.
2003-84)

H 1683 **GENERAL BILL by Kyle; (CO-SPONSORS) Attkisson; Cantens; Green;

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 65
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 1683 **(Continued)
LlIorente; Roberson; Sansom; Slosberg; Waters (ldentical S 0246,
Similar H 0347)
Leaving Scene of Accident/Penalty; provides enhanced penalty for
offense of leaving scene of accident involving fatality under
offense severity ranking chart of Criminal Punishment Code. Amends
921.0022. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
05/01/03 HOUSE Ordered enrolled -HJ 01029
06/09/03 Signed by Officers and presented to Governor
06/20/03 Approved by Governor; Chapter No. 2003-176
S 0246 GENERAL BILL by Saunders; (CO-SPONSORS) Fasano; Crist (ldentical
H 1683, Similar H 0347)
Leaving Scene of Accident/Penalty; provides enhanced penalty for
offense of leaving scene of accident involving fatality under
offense severity ranking chart of Criminal Punishment Code. Amends
921.0022. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
05/01/03 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 00856;
Substituted HB 1683 -SJ 01036; Laid on Table,
Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed, refer to HB 1683 (Ch.
2003-176)
H 0347 GENERAL BILL by Green; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens (Similar H 1683,
S 0246)
Leaving Scene of Accident; increasing offense severity ranking for
accident involving death, for failure to stop & for leaving scene.
Amends 921.0022. Effective Date: 07/01/2003.
02/13/03 HOUSE Prefiled
02/19/03 HOUSE Withdrawn prior to
introduction,Link/1den/Sim/Compare passed, refer to
HB 1683 (Ch. 2003-176) -HJ 00044

H 1703 **GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Public Safety & Crime Prevention;
(CO-SPONSORS) Barreiro; Bullard; Cantens (Similar CS/S 0232)
Mitigating Factors/Certain Offenses; provides that the fact that
victim was initiator, willing participant, aggressor, or provoker
of incident, or consented to incident, is not mitigating factor to
offenses under specified provisions, under certain circumstances.
Amends 921.0026. Effective Date: Upon becoming law.

04/04/03 SENATE In Messages

04/10/03 SENATE Received, referred to Judiciary; Appropriations
Subcommittee on Criminal Justice; Appropriations
-SJ 00405

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Judiciary

S 0232 GENERAL BILL/CS by Criminal Justice; Cowin; (CO-SPONSORS) Fasano
(Similar 1ST ENG/H 1703)

Mitigating Factors/Certain Offenses; provides that consent is not
mitigating factor for certain sexual offenses if defendant is more
than 5 years older than victim, unless court makes written finding

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 66
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 0232 (Continued)

supported by record that victim knowingly & intentionally deceived

defendant about victim’s actual age. Amends 921.0026. Effective

Date: Upon becoming law.

04/16/03 SENATE Withdrawn from Children and Families -SJ 00423; Now
in Appropriations Subcommittee on Criminal Justice

05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Appropriations Subcommittee on
Criminal Justice

H 1735 **JOINT RESOLUTION by Brummer; (CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Fiorentino
(Similar S 2512)
Public School Teachers/Salaries; constitutional amendment to allow
public school teachers in kindergarten through grade 12 to choose
to accept salary set statewide by Legislature or to join union that
will seek to set teachers” salaries through collective bargaining.
Creates s. 8, Art. IX.
04/07/03 HOUSE On Committee agenda-- Judiciary, 04/09/03, 10:15
am, Morris Hall --Temporarily deferred
04/10/03 HOUSE On Committee agenda-- Judiciary, 04/14/03, 4:00 pm,
Morris Hall --Not considered
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Committee on Judiciary
S 2512 JOINT RESOLUTION by Cowin (Similar H 1735)
Public School Teachers/Salaries; constitutional amendment to allow
public school teachers in kindergarten through grade 12 to choose
to accept salary set statewide by Legislature or to join union that
will seek to set teachers” salaries through collective bargaining.
Creates s. 8, Art. IX.
04/22/03 SENATE Favorable by Education; YEAS 5 NAYS 4 -SJ 00503
04/23/03 SENATE Now in Governmental Oversight and Productivity
-SJ 00503
05/02/03 SENATE Died in Committee on Governmental Oversight and
Productivity

H 9005 **RESOLUTION by Littlefield; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen; Ambler;
Anderson; Antone; Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Barreiro; Baxley; Bean;
Bense; Benson; Berfield; Bilirakis; Bowen; Brandenburg; Brown;
Brummer; Brutus; Bucher; Bullard; Byrd; Cantens; Carassas; Clarke;
Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D. Davis; M. Davis; Dean; Detert; Evers;
Farkas; Fields; Fiorentino; Galvano; Gannon; Garcia; Gardiner;
Gelber; A. Gibson; H. Gibson; Goodlette; Gottlieb; Green; Harper;
Harrell; Harrington; Hasner; Henriquez; Hogan; Holloway; Homan;
Jennings; Johnson; Jordan; Joyner; Justice; Kallinger; Kendrick;
Kilmer; Kosmas; Kottkamp; Kravitz; Kyle; Llorente; Machek; Mack;
Mahon; Mayfield; Mclnvale; Meadows; Mealor; Murman; Murzin;
Needelman; Negron; Patterson; Paul; Peterman; Pickens; Planas;
Poppell; Prieguez; Quinones; Reagan; Rich; Richardson; Ritter;

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 67
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 9005 **(Continued)
Rivera; Robaina; Roberson; Ross; Rubio; Russell; Ryan; Sansom;
Seiler; Simmons; Slosberg; Smith; Sobel; Sorensen; Spratt; Stansel;
Stargel; Troutman; Vana; Waters; Wiles; Wishner; Zapata (Similar
S 0576, S 2542)
Tampa Bay Buccaneers; salutes Tampa Bay Buccaneers for acquiring
best record in National Football League this season, for winning
Super Bowl XXXVII & world championship, etc.
03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00101
03/13/03 HOUSE Read second time -HJ 00187; Adopted; See also SR
576 (Adopted), SR 2542 (Adopted) -HJ 00187
S 0576 RESOLUTION by Jones; (CO-SPONSORS) Bennett; Lee; Dockery; Fasano;
Sebesta; Crist; King; Alexander; Argenziano; Aronberg; Atwater;
Bullard; Carlton; Clary; Constantine; Cowin; Dawson; Diaz de la
Portilla; Garcia; Geller; Hill; Klein; Lynn; Margolis; Miller;
Peaden; Posey; Pruitt; Saunders; Siplin; Smith; Villalobos;
Wasserman Schultz; Webster; Wilson; Wise (Similar H 9005, S 2542)
Tampa Bay Buccaneers; commends Tampa Bay Buccaneers for their
outstanding 2002 football season & tremendous victory in Super Bowl
XXXVIL.
03713703 SENATE Introduced -SJ 00175; Read second time -SJ 00175;
Adopted; YEAS 37 NAYS O0; See also HR 9005
(Adopted), SR 2542 (Adopted) -SJ 00175
S 2542 RESOLUTION by Miller (Similar H 9005, S 0576)
Tampa Bay Buccaneers; recognizes, commends, & honors players,
coaches, & managers & owners of Tampa Bay Buccaneers for their
great victory in Super Bowl 2003 & for all other benefits they have
brought us.
03/04/03 SENATE Filed
03/26/03 SENATE Introduced -SJ 00258; Adopted; See also HR 9005
(Adopted), SR 576 (Adopted) -SJ 00258

H 9015 **RESOLUTION by Anderson; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen; Ambler; Antone;
Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Barreiro; Baxley; Bean;
Bendross-Mindingall; Bense; Benson; Berfield; Bilirakis; Bowen;
Brandenburg; Brown; Brummer; Brutus; Bucher; Bullard; Byrd;
Cantens; Carassas; Clarke; Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D. Davis; M.
Davis; Dean; Detert; Domino; Evers; Farkas; Fields; Fiorentino;
Galvano; Gannon; Garcia; Gardiner; Gelber; A. Gibson; H. Gibson;
Goodlette; Gottlieb; Green; Greenstein; Haridopolos; Harper;
Harrell; Harrington; Hasner; Henriquez; Hogan; Holloway; Homan;
Jennings; Johnson; Jordan; Joyner; Justice; Kallinger; Kendrick;
Kilmer; Kosmas; Kottkamp; Kravitz; Kyle; Littlefield; Llorente;
Machek; Mack; Mahon; Mayfield; Mclnvale; Meadows; Mealor; Murman;
Murzin; Needelman; Negron; Patterson; Paul; Peterman; Pickens;
Planas; Poppell; Prieguez; Quinones; Reagan; Rich; Richardson;
Ritter; Rivera; Robaina; Roberson; Ross; Rubio; Russell; Ryan;

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 68
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 9015 **(Continued)
Sansom; Seiler; Simmons; Slosberg; Smith; Sobel; Sorensen; Spratt;
Stansel; Stargel; Troutman; Vana; Waters; Wiles; Wishner; Zapata
Still, Christopher M./Artist; commends Christopher M. Still for his
artistic achievements & for outstanding contributions he has made
to State of Florida & to this Chamber.
03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00020; Read second time -HJ 00020;

Adopted -HJ 00020

H 9017 **RESOLUTION by Harrington; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen; Ambler;
Anderson; Antone; Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Barreiro; Baxley; Bean;
Bendross-Mindingall; Bense; Benson; Berfield; Bilirakis; Bowen;
Brandenburg; Brown; Brummer; Brutus; Bucher; Bullard; Byrd;
Cantens; Carassas; Clarke; Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D. Davis; M.
Davis; Dean; Detert; Domino; Evers; Farkas; Fields; Fiorentino;
Galvano; Gannon; Garcia; Gardiner; Gelber; A. Gibson; H. Gibson;
Goodlette; Gottlieb; Green; Greenstein; Haridopolos; Harper;
Harrell; Hasner; Henriquez; Hogan; Holloway; Homan; Jennings;
Johnson; Jordan; Joyner; Justice; Kallinger; Kendrick; Kilmer;
Kosmas; Kottkamp; Kravitz; Kyle; Littlefield; Llorente; Machek;
Mack; Mahon; Mayfield; Mclnvale; Meadows; Mealor; Murman; Murzin;
Needelman; Negron; Patterson; Paul; Peterman; Pickens; Planas;
Poppell; Prieguez; Quinones; Reagan; Rich; Richardson; Ritter;
Rivera; Robaina; Roberson; Ross; Rubio; Russell; Ryan; Sansom;
Seiler; Simmons; Slosberg; Smith; Sobel; Sorensen; Spratt; Stansel;
Stargel; Troutman; Vana; Waters; Wiles; Wishner; Zapata
Baker, Representative Carey L.; pays tribute to State
Representative Carey L. Baker & commends him for his sacrificial
service to his state & nation.

03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00020; Read second time -HJ 00020;
Adopted -HJ 00020

H 9021 **RESOLUTION by Hasner; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen; Altman; Ambler;
Anderson; Antone; Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Barreiro; Bean;
Bendross-Mindingall; Bense; Benson; Berfield; Bilirakis; Bowen;
Brandenburg; Brown; Brummer; Brutus; Bucher; Bullard; Byrd;
Cantens; Carassas; Clarke; Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D. Davis; M.
Davis; Dean; Detert; Domino; Evers; Farkas; Fields; Fiorentino;
Galvano; Gannon; Gardiner; Gelber; A. Gibson; H. Gibson; Goodlette;
Gottlieb; Green; Greenstein; Haridopolos; Harper; Harrell;
Harrington; Henriquez; Hogan; Holloway; Homan; Jennings; Johnson;
Jordan; Joyner; Justice; Kallinger; Kendrick; Kilmer; Kottkamp;
Kravitz; Kyle; Littlefield; Llorente; Machek; Mack; Mahon;
Mayfield; Mclnvale; Meadows; Mealor; Murman; Murzin; Needelman;
Negron; Patterson; Peterman; Pickens; Planas; Poppell; Prieguez;
Quinones; Reagan; Rich; Richardson; Ritter; Rivera; Robaina;

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 69
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 9021 **(Continued)
Roberson; Ross; Rubio; Russell; Ryan; Sansom; Seiler; Simmons;
Slosberg; Smith; Sobel; Sorensen; Spratt; Stansel; Stargel;
Troutman; Vana; Waters; Wiles; Wishner; Zapata (Similar H 1091,
S 1170)
Solidarity with Israel; expresses solidarity with Israel iIn its
fight against terrorism.
03/06/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00153
03/07/03 HOUSE Read second time -HJ 00159; Adopted -HJ 00160

H 1091 MEMORIAL by Hasner; (CO-SPONSORS) Altman; Cantens; Gottlieb;
Needelman; Rich; Sansom; Troutman; Zapata (ldentical S 1170,
Similar H 9021)
Israel; expresses solidarity with Israel in its fight against
terrorism.
03703703 HOUSE Prefiled
03/04/03 HOUSE Introduced, placed on Calendar -HJ 00089
05/02/03 HOUSE Died on Calendar, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,

refer to HR 9021 (Adopted)

S 1170 MEMORIAL by Cowin; (CO-SPONSORS) Bullard; Wise; Aronberg; Lawson;
Fasano; Webster; Campbell; Klein; Margolis; Wilson (ldentical
H 1091, Similar H 9021)
Israel; expresses solidarity with Israel in its fight against
terrorism.
04/10/03 SENATE Adopted -SJ 00380
04/16/03 HOUSE In Messages
05/02/03 HOUSE Died in Messages, Link/lden/Sim/Compare passed,

refer to HR 9021 (Adopted)

H 9033 **RESOLUTION/1ST ENG by Stargel; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen; Ambler;
Anderson; Antone; Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Baker; Barreiro; Baxley;
Bean; Bendross-Mindingall; Bense; Benson; Berfield; Bilirakis;
Bowen; Brandenburg; Brown; Brummer; Brutus; Bucher; Bullard; Byrd;
Cantens; Carassas; Clarke; Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D. Davis; M.
Davis; Dean; Detert; Domino; Evers; Farkas; Fields; Fiorentino;
Galvano; Gardiner; Gelber; A. Gibson; H. Gibson; Goodlette;
Gottlieb; Green; Greenstein; Harrell; Harrington; Hasner;
Henriquez; Hogan; Holloway; Homan; Jennings; Johnson; Jordan;
Joyner; Justice; Kallinger; Kendrick; Kilmer; Kosmas; Kottkamp;
Kravitz; Kyle; Littlefield; Llorente; Machek; Mack; Mahon;
Mayfield; Mclnvale; Meadows; Mealor; Murman; Murzin; Needelman;
Negron; Patterson; Paul; Peterman; Pickens; Planas; Poppell;
Prieguez; Quinones; Reagan; Rich; Richardson; Ritter; Rivera;
Robaina; Roberson; Ross; Rubio; Russell; Ryan; Sansom; Seiler;
Simmons; Slosberg; Smith; Sobel; Spratt; Stansel; Troutman; Vana;
Waters; Wiles; Wishner; Zapata
Support of Armed Forces Against lraq; supports use of United States
Armed Forces against lrag.

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 70
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 9033 **(Continued)
03/21/03 HOUSE Read second time -HJ 00231; Amendment(s) adopted
-HJ 00232; Adopted as amended -HJ 00234

H 9047 **RESOLUTION by Arza; (CO-SPONSORS) Barreiro; Bendross-Mindingall;
Brutus; Bullard; Cantens; Garcia; Greenstein; Planas; Prieguez;
Rivera; Robaina; Rubio; Zapata
Head Coach Don Strock; congratulates Head Coach Don Strock on
outstanding success of inaugural season of Division I-AA football
program at Florida International University.
03/19/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00211; Read second time -HJ 00211;

Adopted -HJ 00211

H 9089 **RESOLUTION by Ambler; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen; Altman; Anderson;
Antone; Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Barreiro; Baxley; Bean;
Bendross-Mindingall; Bense; Benson; Berfield; Bilirakis; Bowen;
Brandenburg; Brown; Brummer; Brutus; Bucher; Bullard; Byrd;
Cantens; Clarke; Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D. Davis; M. Davis; Dean;
Detert; Domino; Evers; Farkas; Fields; Fiorentino; Galvano; Gannon;
Garcia; Gardiner; Gelber; A. Gibson; H. Gibson; Goodlette;
Gottlieb; Green; Greenstein; Harper; Harrell; Harrington; Hasner;
Henriquez; Hogan; Holloway; Homan; Jennings; Johnson; Jordan;
Joyner; Justice; Kallinger; Kendrick; Kilmer; Kosmas; Kottkamp;
Kravitz; Littlefield; Llorente; Machek; Mack; Mahon; Mayfield;
Mclnvale; Meadows; Mealor; Murman; Murzin; Needelman; Negron;
Patterson; Paul; Peterman; Pickens; Planas; Prieguez; Quinones;
Reagan; Rich; Richardson; Ritter; Rivera; Robaina; Roberson; Ross;
Rubio; Russell; Ryan; Sansom; Seiler; Simmons; Slosberg; Smith;
Sobel; Sorensen; Spratt; Stansel; Stargel; Troutman; Vana; Wiles;
Wishner; Zapata
Florida National Guard Day; honors Florida National Guard &
designates April 1, 2003, as "Florida National Guard Day."
04/01/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00283; Read second time -HJ 00283;

Adopted -HJ 00283

H 9111 **RESOLUTION by Quinones; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen; Altman; Ambler;
Anderson; Antone; Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Barreiro; Baxley; Bean;
Bendross-Mindingall; Bense; Benson; Berfield; Bilirakis; Bowen;
Brandenburg; Brown; Brummer; Brutus; Bucher; Bullard; Byrd;
Cantens; Carassas; Clarke; Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D. Davis; M.
Davis; Dean; Detert; Domino; Evers; Farkas; Fields; Fiorentino;
Galvano; Gannon; Garcia; Gardiner; Gelber; A. Gibson; H. Gibson;
Goodlette; Gottlieb; Green; Greenstein; Harper; Harrell;
Harrington; Hasner; Henriquez; Hogan; Holloway; Homan; Jennings;
Johnson; Jordan; Joyner; Justice; Kallinger; Kendrick; Kilmer;

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 71
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 9111 **(Continued)
Kosmas; Kottkamp; Kravitz; Kyle; Littlefield; Llorente; Machek;
Mack; Mahon; Mayfield; Mclnvale; Meadows; Mealor; Murman; Murzin;
Needelman; Negron; Patterson; Paul; Peterman; Pickens; Planas;
Poppell; Prieguez; Reagan; Rich; Richardson; Ritter; Rivera;
Robaina; Roberson; Ross; Rubio; Russell; Ryan; Sansom; Seiler;
Simmons; Slosberg; Sobel; Sorensen; Spratt; Stansel; Stargel;
Troutman; Vana; Waters; Wiles; Wishner; Zapata
Puerto Rico Day; designates April 8, 2003, as "Puerto Rico Day"™ in
Florida.
04/04/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00331
04/08/03 HOUSE Read second time -HJ 00345; Adopted -HJ 00346

H 9113 **RESOLUTION by Johnson; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen; Altman; Ambler;
Anderson; Antone; Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Barreiro; Baxley; Bean;
Bendross-Mindingall; Bense; Benson; Berfield; Bilirakis; Bowen;
Brandenburg; Brown; Brummer; Brutus; Bucher; Bullard; Byrd;
Cantens; Carassas; Clarke; Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D. Davis; M.
Davis; Dean; Detert; Domino; Evers; Farkas; Fields; Fiorentino;
Galvano; Gannon; Garcia; Gardiner; Gelber; A. Gibson; H. Gibson;
Goodlette; Gottlieb; Green; Greenstein; Harper; Harrell;
Harrington; Hasner; Henriquez; Hogan; Holloway; Homan; Jennings;
Jordan; Joyner; Kallinger; Kendrick; Kilmer; Kosmas; Kottkamp;
Kravitz; Kyle; Littlefield; Llorente; Machek; Mack; Mahon;
Mayfield; Mclnvale; Meadows; Mealor; Murman; Murzin; Needelman;
Negron; Patterson; Paul; Peterman; Pickens; Planas; Poppell;
Prieguez; Quinones; Reagan; Rich; Ritter; Rivera; Robaina;
Roberson; Ross; Rubio; Russell; Ryan; Sansom; Seiler; Simmons;
Slosberg; Sobel; Sorensen; Spratt; Stansel; Stargel; Wiles;
Wishner; Zapata (Similar S 2790)

Taiwan People/UN & World Health Org.; supports negotiation of Free

Trade Agreement between United States & Taiwan; supports Taiwan’s

efforts to be accepted as observer at World Health Assembly &

Health Network of World Health Organization.

04/08/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00343; Read second time -HJ 00343;
Adopted; See also SR 2790 (Adopted) -HJ 00343

S 2790 RESOLUTION by Diaz de la Portilla; (CO-SPONSORS) Wasserman Schultz;
Argenziano (Similar H 9113)

Taiwan People/UN & World Health Org.; supports right of people of

Taiwan to participate in United Nations & World Health Organization

affairs & to decide their own future.

04/08/03 SENATE Introduced -SJ 00350; Read second time -SJ 00350;
Adopted; See also HR 9113 (Adopted) -SJ 00350

H 9149 **RESOLUTION by Anderson; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen; Altman; Ambler;
Antone; Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Barreiro; Baxley; Bean;

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 72
Representative Cantens (Continued)

H 9149 **(Continued)
Bendross-Mindingall; Bense; Benson; Berfield; Bowen; Brandenburg;
Brown; Brummer; Brutus; Bucher; Bullard; Byrd; Cantens; Carassas;
Clarke; Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D. Davis; M. Davis; Dean; Detert;
Domino; Evers; Farkas; Fields; Fiorentino; Galvano; Gannon; Garcia;
Gardiner; Gelber; A. Gibson; H. Gibson; Goodlette; Gottlieb; Green;
Greenstein; Harper; Harrell; Harrington; Hasner; Henriquez; Hogan;
Holloway; Homan; Jennings; Johnson; Jordan; Joyner; Kallinger;
Kendrick; Kilmer; Kosmas; Kottkamp; Kravitz; Kyle; Littlefield;
Llorente; Machek; Mack; Mahon; Mayfield; Mclnvale; Meadows; Mealor;
Murman; Murzin; Needelman; Negron; Patterson; Paul; Peterman;
Pickens; Planas; Poppell; Prieguez; Quinones; Reagan; Rich;
Richardson; Ritter; Rivera; Robaina; Roberson; Ross; Rubio;
Russell; Ryan; Sansom; Seiler; Simmons; Slosberg; Smith; Sobel;
Sorensen; Spratt; Stansel; Stargel; Troutman; Vana; Waters; Wiles;
Wishner; Zapata
Communities for a Lifetime; encourages Florida’s communities to
adopt Governor Jeb Bush’s Communities for a Lifetime initiative in
order to retailn our seniors & attract more retirees to Florida.
04/25/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00650
04/28/03 HOUSE Read second time -HJ 00696; Adopted -HJ 00697

H 9151 **RESOLUTION by Sansom; (CO-SPONSORS) Adams; Allen; Altman; Ambler;
Anderson; Arza; Attkisson; Ausley; Barreiro; Baxley; Bean;
Bendross-Mindingall; Bense; Benson; Berfield; Bowen; Brandenburg;
Brown; Brummer; Bucher; Bullard; Byrd; Cantens; Carassas; Clarke;
Cretul; Culp; Cusack; D. Davis; M. Davis; Dean; Detert; Domino;
Evers; Farkas; Fields; Fiorentino; Galvano; Gannon; Garcia;
Gardiner; Gelber; A. Gibson; H. Gibson; Goodlette; Gottlieb; Green;
Greenstein; Harper; Harrell; Harrington; Hasner; Henriquez;
Holloway; Homan; Jennings; Johnson; Jordan; Joyner; Justice;
Kallinger; Kendrick; Kilmer; Kosmas; Kottkamp; Kravitz; Kyle;
Littlefield; Llorente; Machek; Mack; Mahon; Mclnvale; Meadows;
Mealor; Murman; Murzin; Needelman; Negron; Patterson; Paul;
Peterman; Pickens; Planas; Poppell; Prieguez; Quinones; Reagan;
Rich; Richardson; Ritter; Rivera; Robaina; Roberson; Ross; Rubio;
Russell; Ryan; Seiler; Simmons; Slosberg; Smith; Sobel; Sorensen;
Spratt; Stansel; Stargel; Troutman; Vana; Waters; Wiles; Wishner;
Zapata (Similar S 2848)

Shreve, Jack/ Fla. Public Counsel; expresses heartfelt gratitude to

Jack Shreve for his years of commitment to residents of Florida,

offers enthusiastic congratulations upon his coming retirement, &

extends best wishes for many satisfying years in this new phase of

his life.

04/25/03 HOUSE Introduced -HJ 00650

04/28/03 HOUSE Read second time -HJ 00697; Adopted; See also SR
2848 (Adopted) -HJ 00697

(CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE) **ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



0870872003 FLORIDA LEGISLATURE -  REGULAR SESSION - 2003
06:30 PM CO-SPONSOR REPORT PAGE 73
Representative Cantens (Continued)

S 2848 RESOLUTION by Atwater; (CO-SPONSORS) Fasano; Cowin (Similar
H 9151)
Shreve, Jack; honors Mr. Jack Shreve for his 25 years of service as
Florida’s Public Counsel & commends him for his many achievements &
for his faithful commitment, dedication, & service to people of
Florida & for his unwavering advocacy on their behalf.
04/15/03 SENATE Filed
04/25/03 SENATE Introduced -SJ 00585; Adopted; See also HR 9151

(Adopted) -SJ 00585

**ASTERISK INDICATES LEAD BILL ON TIED
BILLS



	Representative Cantens
	H 1417
	H 9019
	H 9079
	H 9171
	H 9173
	H 0001
	H 0003
	H 0013
	H 0027
	H 0037
	H 0045
	H 0051
	H 0059
	H 0061
	H 0063
	H 0077
	H 0083
	H 0089
	H 0119
	H 0125
	H 0193
	H 0195
	H 0197
	H 0213
	H 0215
	H 0223
	H 0227
	H 0231
	H 0243
	H 0267
	H 0311
	H 0323
	H 0327
	H 0345
	H 0347
	H 0415
	H 0429
	H 0437
	H 0453
	H 0463
	H 0481
	H 0493
	H 0527
	H 0535
	H 0541
	H 0545
	H 0547
	H 0627
	H 0707
	H 0709
	H 0715
	H 0747
	H 0749
	H 0803
	H 0805
	H 0843
	H 0847
	H 0859
	H 0947
	H 0961
	H 1019
	H 1091
	H 1097
	H 1107
	H 1155
	H 1185
	H 1253
	H 1287
	H 1311
	H 1369
	H 1375
	H 1405
	H 1411
	H 1475
	H 1515
	H 1527
	H 1529
	H 1585
	H 1675
	H 1683
	H 1703
	H 1735
	H 9005
	H 9015
	H 9017
	H 9021
	H 9033
	H 9047
	H 9089
	H 9111
	H 9113
	H 9149
	H 9151


