Journal of the Senate

Number 22—Regular Session

Friday, April 29, 2005

CONTENTS
Bills on Third Reading .. ........................... 711, 743
Callto Order ........... ..., 710, 721
Co-Introducers . .......... ..., 751
Committee Substitutes, First Reading ..................... 744
House Messages, First Reading . ......................... 747
Motions . ..... .. 743
Motions Relating to Committee Meetings . .................. 743
Motions Relating to Committee Reference .................. 743
Reports of Committees . .............. ... . ... ......... 744

Resolutions . . ... ... .. 710
Special Order Calendar

CALL TO ORDER

The Senate was called to order by President Lee at 10:24 a.m. A
quorum present—39:

Mr. President Diaz de la Portilla Miller
Alexander Dockery Peaden
Argenziano Fasano Posey
Aronberg Garcia Pruitt
Atwater Geller Rich
Baker Haridopolos Saunders
Bennett Hill Sebesta
Bullard Jones Siplin
Campbell King Smith
Carlton Klein Villalobos
Clary Lawson Webster
Constantine Lynn Wilson
Crist Margolis Wise
Excused: Senator Dawson

PRAYER

The following prayer was offered by Rabbi Kurt Stone, North Broward
Havurah, Coral Springs:

Master of the Universe: We call you by a hundred different names,
and call upon you in a thousand different ways. And yet, whether we
address you as God, Jesus, Ha-Shem, Allah, Vishnu or Yaweh; whether
we stand, kneel or fall prostrate on the ground; whether we recite
prayers that are written from left to right, right to left or top to bottom,
we are all, essentially, addressing the one who creates and sustains, who
exalts and judges, who blesses and enables that which is best in each of
us. Through the very act of invoking your name, we seek your guidance,
your approval, and above all, your strength and blessing.

Unquestionably, you have already bestowed manifold blessings upon
the members of this august legislative body—Dblessings that have per-
mitted them to become leaders in this great state. We pray that they be
ever mindful of the awesome responsibility that comes from being so
engifted; that they constantly pause to reflect upon the very nature of
communal responsibility. May they keep uppermost in their hearts and
minds the most basic and purposive reasons why they are here: To feed
the hungry and clothe the naked; to exercise stewardship over all the
natural glories that you have created; to educate, to elevate, and to
advocate.

May we, who have been given so many blessings, be ever cognizant of
the fact that many paths can lead to the same destination. May these

men and women—they who call each other “Honorable” and “Distin-
guished”—realize that you, dear God, have given us two ears with which
to hear, and but one mouth with which to speak. May all of us under-
stand that although there are undoubtedly many paths to the gates of
glory, there is but one gatekeeper—you and you alone.

May you bless us and keep us.

May you cause your great countenance to shine upon us and be gra-
cious unto us.

May you lift up the light of your countenance and grant us the most
precious of all your abundant blessings—the blessing of peace. Amen.

PLEDGE

Senate Pages Kenny McCloud of Quincy; Eric James Perrott of Pem-
broke Pines; Blake Palmer Burford of Ft. Pierce; and Katherine Ward,
daughter of House Chief of Staff Bob Ward, of Tallahassee, led the
Senate in the pledge of allegiance to the flag of the United States of
America.

DOCTOR OF THE DAY

The President recognized Dr. Ronald L. Knaus of Largo, sponsored by
Senator Jones, as doctor of the day. Dr. Knaus specializes in Psychiatry.

ADOPTION OF RESOLUTIONS

At the request of Senator Dockery—
By Senator Dockery—

SR 2760—A resolution recognizing the Sumter County Board of
County Commissioners for its work on the Florida Organic Recycling
Center for Excellence.

WHEREAS, Sumter County, in partnership with the Department of
Environmental Protection and with public and private researchers, cre-
ated the Florida Organic Recycling Center for Excellence (F.O.R.C.E.),
and

WHEREAS, the purpose of F.O.R.C.E. is to bring together academic
researchers and industry leaders to develop practical and applicable
solutions for Florida’s organic waste, and

WHEREAS, the solid-waste stream accounts for about one-half of
Florida’s solid waste, and

WHEREAS, training and outreach activities provided by F.O.R.C.E.
have been attended by a wide range of Florida government and industry
leaders, and

WHEREAS, F.O.R.C.E. has been active in making presentations at
local, state, and national meetings and conferences regarding solid-
waste recycling and composting, and

WHEREAS, the efforts of F.O.R.C.E. have produced a searchable
database providing information and links to over 200 organizations na-
tionwide in the organics processing industry, and

WHEREAS, researchers from the public and private sectors in con-
junction with F.O.R.C.E. are involved in over $200,000 worth of research
and development projects, and

WHEREAS, organics recovery and production can provide physical,
chemical, and environmental benefits in helping to protect Florida’s soil
and groundwater, NOW, THEREFORE,

710



April 29, 2005

Be It Resolved by the Senate of the State of Florida:

That the Sumter County Commission is commended for its outstand-
ing efforts to reduce solid waste and improve the soil and groundwater
in the State of Florida through the Florida Organic Recycling Center of
Excellence.

—SR 2760 was introduced, read and adopted by publication.

At the request of Senator Jones—
By Senator Jones—

SR 2770—A resolution commending Ronald L. Knaus, D.O., for his 25
consecutive years of service as Doctor of the Day for the Florida Legisla-
ture.

WHEREAS, Dr. Ronald L. Knaus, an osteopathic physician of Semi-
nole, Florida, has served as Doctor of the Day in the Florida Legislature
for 25 consecutive years, and

WHEREAS, Dr. Knaus is board-certified in Psychiatry and Sports
Medicine, and

WHEREAS, Dr. Knaus has been treating patients for more than 27
years, and

WHEREAS, Dr. Knaus has spent his career as a psychiatrist and
author helping those in need at mental health centers, hospitals, clinics,
and in his private practice in Seminole, Florida, NOW, THEREFORE,

Be It Resolved by the Senate of the State of Florida:

That the Florida Senate commends and congratulates Ronald L.
Knaus, D.O., on his 25 consecutive years of service as Doctor of the Day
in the Florida Legislature.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that a copy of this resolution, with the
Seal of the Senate affixed, be presented to Ronald L. Knaus, D.O., as a
token of the appreciation of the Florida Senate.

—SR 2770 was introduced, read and adopted by publication.

MOTION

On motion by Senator Crist, by two-thirds vote CS for SB 276 which
passed April 28 was ordered immediately certified to the House.

BILLS ON THIRD READING

Consideration of CS for SB 718, HB 1659, CS for SB 530, SB 752,
HB 1141 and CS for SB 284 was deferred.

HB 699—A bill to be entitled An act relating to architecture, land-
scape architecture, and interior design; amending s. 481.219, F.S.; revis-
ing provisions on architectural and interior design services certifications
to include applicability to limited liability companies; amending s.
481.221, F.S.; requiring the Board of Architecture and Interior Design
to prescribe, by rule, one or more forms of seals for use by a registered
architect or interior designer who holds a valid certificate of registration;
authorizing use of one seal and registration of the seal electronically;
authorizing electronic transmission and sealing of final plans, specifica-
tions, or reports; prohibiting signing or sealing of final plans, specifica-
tions, or reports after expiration, suspension, or revocation of certificate
of registration; requiring surrender of the seal upon suspension or revo-
cation of the certificate of registration; amending s. 481.225, F.S.; revis-
ing grounds for disciplinary actions relating to the practice of architec-
ture; amending s. 481.2251, F.S.; revising grounds for disciplinary pro-
ceedings relating to the practice of interior design; amending s. 481.229,
F.S.; revising an exemption relating to interior design services and titles
to include applicability to certain limited liability companies; amending
s. 481.321, F.S.; requiring the Board of Landscape Architecture to pre-
scribe, by rule, one or more forms of seals for use by a registered land-
scape architect who holds a valid certificate of registration; authorizing
use of one seal and registration of the seal electronically; authorizing

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

711

electronic transmission and sealing of final plans, specifications, or re-
ports; prohibiting signing or sealing of final plans, specifications, or
reports after expiration, suspension, or revocation of certificate of regis-
tration; requiring surrender of the seal upon suspension or revocation
of the certificate of registration; reenacting s. 481.325(1)(a) and (3), F.S.,
relating to disciplinary proceedings against registered landscape archi-
tects, to incorporate the amendment to s. 481.321, F.S., in a reference
thereto; providing an effective date.

—was read the third time by title.

On motion by Senator Clary, HB 699 was passed and certified to the
House. The vote on passage was:

Yeas—37

Mr. President Diaz de la Portilla Miller
Alexander Dockery Peaden
Argenziano Fasano Posey
Aronberg Garcia Pruitt
Atwater Geller Rich
Baker Haridopolos Saunders
Bennett Hill Sebesta
Bullard Jones Siplin
Campbell King Smith
Carlton Klein Wilson
Clary Lawson Wise
Constantine Lynn

Crist Margolis

Nays—None

Vote after roll call:

Yea—Villalobos, Webster

SENATOR MILLER PRESIDING

CS for CS for SB 2550—A bill to be entitled An act relating to
assistive technology devices and services; creating s. 1003.575, F.S.;
requiring interagency agreements to ensure that assistive technology
devices be retained for use by a person with disabilities as he or she
makes certain transitions; providing an effective date.

—was read the third time by title.

On motion by Senator Wise, CS for CS for SB 2550 was passed and
certified to the House. The vote on passage was:

Yeas—37

Alexander Dockery Posey
Argenziano Fasano Pruitt
Aronberg Garcia Rich
Atwater Geller Saunders
Baker Haridopolos Sebesta
Bennett Hill Siplin
Bullard Jones Smith
Campbell King Villalobos
Carlton Klein Webster
Clary Lawson Wilson
Constantine Lynn Wise
Crist Margolis

Diaz de la Portilla Peaden

Nays—None
Vote after roll call:

Yea—Miller

CS for SB 48—A bill to be entitled An act relating to automated
external defibrillators; amending s. 401.2915, F.S.; revising legislative
intent with respect to the use of an automated external defibrillator;
defining an automated external defibrillator as a lifesaving defibrilla-
tion device; defining a related term; providing that it is a first-degree



712 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

misdemeanor for a person to commit certain acts involving the misuse
of an automated external defibrillator; authorizing a local government
to adopt an ordinance to license, permit, or inspect automated external
defibrillators; providing for enforcement of such local ordinances; requir-
ing the Department of Health to implement an educational campaign to
inform the public about the lack of immunity from liability regarding the
use of automated external defibrillator devices under certain conditions;
providing an effective date.

—was read the third time by title.

On motion by Senator Geller, CS for SB 48 was passed and certified
to the House. The vote on passage was:

April 29, 2005

Yeas—38

Alexander Dockery Peaden
Argenziano Fasano Posey
Aronberg Garcia Pruitt
Atwater Geller Rich
Baker Haridopolos Saunders
Bennett Hill Sebesta
Bullard Jones Siplin
Campbell King Smith
Carlton Klein Villalobos
Clary Lawson Webster
Constantine Lynn Wilson
Crist Margolis Wise
Diaz de la Portilla Miller

Nays—None

Yeas—38

Alexander Dockery Peaden
Argenziano Fasano Posey
Aronberg Garcia Pruitt
Atwater Geller Rich
Baker Haridopolos Saunders
Bennett Hill Sebesta
Bullard Jones Siplin
Campbell King Smith
Carlton Klein Villalobos
Clary Lawson Webster
Constantine Lynn Wilson
Crist Margolis Wise
Diaz de la Portilla Miller

Nays—None

CS for CS for SB 652—A bill to be entitled An act relating to public
construction bonds; amending s. 255.05, F.S.; revising requirements for
the form used for public construction bonds; requiring payment provi-
sions of public construction bonds to be construed as statutory bonds;
requiring payment bond forms to reference notice and time limitation
provisions; amending s. 624.155, F.S.; providing that a surety issuing a
payment or performance bond on certain projects is not an insurer for
the purpose of specified civil remedies; providing an effective date.

—as amended April 28 was read the third time by title.

On motion by Senator Sebesta, CS for CS for SB 652 as amended was

Consideration of CS for SB 1344 was deferred.

HB 879—A bill to be entitled An act relating to public school educa-
tional instruction; requiring the Department of Education to evaluate
the extent to which the Sunshine State Standards in the arts are being
taught; requiring a report to the Governor and the Legislature; provid-
ing an effective date.

—as amended April 28 was read the third time by title.

On motion by Senator Margolis, HB 879 as amended was passed and
certified to the House. The vote on passage was:

Yeas—38

Alexander Dockery Peaden
Argenziano Fasano Posey
Aronberg Garcia Pruitt
Atwater Geller Rich
Baker Haridopolos Saunders
Bennett Hill Sebesta
Bullard Jones Siplin
Campbell King Smith
Carlton Klein Villalobos
Clary Lawson Webster
Constantine Lynn Wilson
Crist Margolis Wise
Diaz de la Portilla Miller

Nays—None

HB 925—A bill to be entitled An act relating to traffic regulations;
amending s. 316.1303, F.S.; requiring vehicle operators to stop and yield
to mobility-impaired pedestrians who are assisted by guide dogs or other
service animals; providing a penalty; providing an effective date.

—as amended April 28 was read the third time by title.

On motion by Senator Rich, HB 925 as amended was passed and
certified to the House. The vote on passage was:

passed and certified to the House. The vote on passage was:

Yeas—38

Alexander Dockery Peaden
Argenziano Fasano Posey
Aronberg Garcia Pruitt
Atwater Geller Rich
Baker Haridopolos Saunders
Bennett Hill Sebesta
Bullard Jones Siplin
Campbell King Smith
Carlton Klein Villalobos
Clary Lawson Webster
Constantine Lynn Wilson
Crist Margolis Wise
Diaz de la Portilla Miller

Nays—None

HB 41—A bill to be entitled An act relating to alarm system contract-
ing; amending s. 633.702, F.S.; providing a criminal penalty for inten-
tionally or willfully installing, servicing, testing, repairing, improving,
or inspecting a fire alarm system unless authorized by part II of ch. 489;
providing exemptions; providing an effective date.

—was read the third time by title.

On motion by Senator Bennett, HB 41 was passed and certified to the
House. The vote on passage was:

Yeas—38

Alexander Crist Lawson
Argenziano Diaz de la Portilla Lynn
Aronberg Dockery Margolis
Atwater Fasano Miller
Baker Garcia Peaden
Bennett Geller Posey
Bullard Haridopolos Pruitt
Campbell Hill Rich
Carlton Jones Saunders
Clary King Sebesta
Constantine Klein Siplin



April 29, 2005

Smith Webster Wise
Villalobos Wilson
Nays—None

CS for CS for SB 1348—A bill to be entitled An act relating to indoor
smoking places; amending s. 386.203, F.S.; conforming a cross-reference;
defining the term “person” for purposes of the act; redefining the term
“stand-alone bar” to include a licensed premises that derives no more
than a specified amount of gross revenue from the sale of food consumed
on the licensed premises and that is located in a building individually
listed in the National Register of Historic Places; requiring that an
application for historic designation be submitted within a specified pe-
riod of time; amending s. 386.204, F.S.; eliminating certain exceptions
to the prohibition against smoking in an enclosed indoor workplace;
prohibiting a proprietor or person in charge of an enclosed indoor work-
place from permitting smoking in that workplace; requiring that a pro-
prietor or person in charge of an enclosed indoor workplace request a
person who is smoking to stop smoking or leave the premises; providing
penalties; amending s. 386.2045, F.S.; conforming cross-references;
amending s. 386.205, F.S.; conforming cross-references; amending s.
386.206, F.S.; deleting certain provisions made obsolete by operation of
law which require the posting of signs in an enclosed indoor workplace;
amending s. 386.208, F.S.; authorizing a law enforcement officer to issue
a citation to a person who violates the Florida Clean Indoor Air Act;
providing requirements for the citation; providing that failure to comply
with a citation is deemed a waiver of the right to contest the citation;
authorizing a law enforcement officer to remove a person from the prem-
ises who is in violation of the Florida Clean Indoor Air Act; providing
that penalties imposed under the act do not limit other actions by a law
enforcement officer or state agency; amending s. 561.695, F.S.; conform-
ing cross-references; providing a penalty for a licensee who knowingly
makes a false statement on an annual compliance affidavit; eliminating
provisions requiring a stand-alone bar to certify to the Division of Alco-
holic Beverages and Tobacco of the Department of Business and Profes-
sional Regulation compliance with certain provisions of the Florida
Clean Indoor Air Act; providing additional penalties for a third or subse-
quent violation of requirements applicable to a stand-alone bar; provid-
ing an effective date.

—as amended April 28 was read the third time by title.
MOTION

On motion by Senator Geller, the rules were waived to allow the
following amendment to be considered:

Senator Geller moved the following amendment which was adopted by
two-thirds vote:

Amendment 1 (064738)—On page 10, lines 4 and 5, delete “October
1, 2005” and insert: 90 days after the effective date of this act

On motion by Senator Geller, CS for CS for SB 1348 as amended was
passed, ordered engrossed and then certified to the House. The vote on
passage was:

Yeas—27

Alexander Constantine Lawson
Argenziano Crist Miller
Aronberg Dockery Peaden
Atwater Garcia Pruitt
Baker Geller Sebesta
Bennett Haridopolos Smith
Bullard Hill Villalobos
Campbell Jones Wilson
Clary King Wise
Nays—10

Carlton Lynn Rich
Diaz de la Portilla Margolis Saunders
Fasano Posey Webster
Klein

Vote after roll call:

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

713

Nay—Siplin
Yea to Nay—Wise

HB 1141—A bill to be entitled An act relating to greenways and trails;
renaming ch. 260, F.S., as the “Florida Greenways and Trails Act”;
amending s. 260.011, F.S.; providing a popular name; amending s.
260.012, F.S.; revising legislative intent with respect to the development
and completion of the Florida National Scenic Trail; conforming cross
references; amending s. 260.013, F.S.; revising and providing defini-
tions; amending s. 260.0141, F.S.; removing provisions authorizing cer-
tain acquisitions; amending s. 260.0142, F.S.; revising the powers and
duties of the Florida Greenways and Trails Council; extending the terms
of certain appointees; providing for reappointment of appointees; revis-
ing eligibility requirements for appointees of the trail user community
to include users of off-highway vehicles; amending s. 260.015, F.S.; re-
moving provisions for the appraisal of certain property by the Depart-
ment of Environmental Protection; conforming cross references; amend-
ing s. 260.016, F.S.; revising the general powers of the department;
revising provisions relating to rules for public access to greenways and
trails; conforming cross references; creating s. 260.019, F.S.; establish-
ing the Florida Circumnavigation Saltwater Paddling Trail; providing
for review, adjustment, and redesignation of the trail segments by the
department; requiring the department to prepare and submit a report
to the Governor and Legislature by a specified date pursuant to such
review; creating s. 260.021, F.S.; providing for a partnership between
various organizations and mining interests to develop recreational op-
portunities on mined lands; creating s. 335.067, F.S.; creating the Con-
serve by Bicycle Program within the Department of Transportation,
providing purposes of the program, and requiring such department to
conduct a Conserve by Bicycle study; amending s. 373.199, F.S.; requir-
ing water management districts to include information about the Florida
National Scenic Trail in the Florida Forever Water Management Dis-
trict Work Plan; amending s. 378.036, F.S.; removing provisions relating
to recreational opportunities on mined lands; amending s. 380.507, F.S.;
revising the powers of the Florida Communities Trust with respect to the
Florida National Scenic Trail; amending s. 110.501, F.S.; conforming a
cross reference; providing an effective date.

—was read the third time by title.

On motion by Senator Dockery, HB 1141 was passed and certified to
the House. The vote on passage was:

Yeas—38

Alexander Dockery Peaden
Argenziano Fasano Posey
Aronberg Garcia Pruitt
Atwater Geller Rich
Baker Haridopolos Saunders
Bennett Hill Sebesta
Bullard Jones Siplin
Campbell King Smith
Carlton Klein Villalobos
Clary Lawson Webster
Constantine Lynn Wilson
Crist Margolis Wise
Diaz de la Portilla Miller

Nays—None

SPECIAL ORDER CALENDAR
Consideration of SB 1356 was deferred.

On motion by Senator Lynn, by two-thirds vote HB 285 was with-
drawn from the Committees on Judiciary; and Criminal Justice.

On motion by Senator Lynn—

HB 285—A bill to be entitled An act relating to the right to a speedy
trial; creating time limits within which a person charged with a crime
must be brought to trial; permitting state attorneys to file a demand for
a speedy trial; providing conditions that must be met in order to do so;



714

requiring that the trial judge schedule a calendar call upon the filing of
a demand for a speedy trial in order to schedule a trial; prescribing
conditions under which the trial court may postpone a trial date; provid-
ing an effective date.

—a companion measure, was substituted for CS for SB 214 and read
the second time by title.

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, HB 285 was placed on the calendar of Bills on
Third Reading.

Consideration of CS for SB 1498 was deferred.

On motion by Senator King—

CS for CS for CS for SB 2—A bill to be entitled An act relating to
scholarship programs; amending s. 1002.39, F.S., relating to the John M.
McKay Scholarships for Students with Disabilities Program; revising
the definition of an eligible student; revising the eligibility requirements
of the program; revising requirements for scholarship funding and pay-
ments; providing reporting requirements for school districts; holding a
school district harmless from a specified student enrollment ceiling;
prohibiting the transfer of funds to the Florida School for the Deaf and
the Blind under certain circumstances; extending the term of the schol-
arship; prohibiting certain students from receiving a scholarship; revis-
ing the parental notification requirements; authorizing certain scholar-
ship students to participate in a distance learning or correspondence
course or a private tutoring program under certain circumstances; pro-
viding a definition of timely parental notification; providing require-
ments for district school boards with respect to completing and making
changes to the matrix of services for scholarship students; requiring
school districts to provide parental notification related to reassessments;
revising requirements that a participating private school demonstrate
fiscal soundness; requiring annual registration of private schools; pro-
viding requirements for documentation and notice; providing additional
requirements for participating private schools; requiring annual sworn
and notarized compliance statements to be filed with the department;
requiring specific documentation for participating scholarship students;
requiring that the private school maintain a physical location in this
state; requiring that information be made available to potential scholar-
ship students and the department; requiring scholarship students to
participate in assessments; requiring notification to parents regarding
student skill levels; requiring notification to the department regarding
changes in information; requiring notification to local health depart-
ments; prohibiting discrimination on the basis of religion by a private
school; requiring certain individuals to undergo level 2 background
screening requirements pursuant to s. 943.0542, F.S.; requiring the De-
partment of Education to verify the background screening information
provided by the private school; providing for the Department of Law
Enforcement to retain and search fingerprint records; providing for an
annual fee as provided by rule of the Department of Law Enforcement;
requiring that costs of background checks to be borne by certain parties;
requiring the Department of Law Enforcement to provide the Depart-
ment of Education with information related to background screening;
prohibiting a private school from acting as an attorney in fact for the
parent of a scholarship student or endorsing scholarship warrants on
behalf of a parent; prohibiting participating private schools from send-
ing or directing scholarship funds to parents of a scholarship student
who receives instruction at home; prohibiting a participating school from
being a private tutoring program or a correspondence or distance learn-
ing school; requiring a private school that is subject to enforcement
action by the department for certain violations to file certain surety
bonds and, pending compliance with certain laws, cease accepting new
scholarship students; prohibiting a participating school from accepting
students pending verification of information; authorizing a participating
private school to request, and the department to grant, closed-
enrollment status for a school; requiring a private school that is subject
to enforcement action by the department for certain violations to file
certain surety bonds and, pending compliance with certain laws, cease
accepting new scholarship students; prohibiting the parent of a scholar-
ship student from designating a participating private school as the par-
ent’s attorney in fact to sign a scholarship warrant; clarifying that the
school district must report to the department the students who are
attending a private school under the program; establishing additional
obligations of the Department of Education; requiring the department

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

April 29, 2005

to review, approve, and verify information; requiring the department to
determine the eligibility of a private school to participate in the program;
requiring the department to publish an on-line list of current eligible
private schools; requiring the department to deny or refuse to allow the
participation of a private school for failing to meet certain requirements;
requiring the department to issue a notice of noncompliance for minor
violations; providing for an emergency order revoking the registration
of a private school for failing to satisfy the requirements in the notice;
requiring the Department of Education to immediately revoke the regis-
tration of a private school for certain other violations; requiring the
department to revoke the scholarship for a participant for failing to
comply with statutory requirements or for engaging in specified prac-
tices; requiring the department to conduct investigations of legally suffi-
cient complaints of violations; authorizing the department to require
supporting information or documentation; authorizing the Department
of Education to change the matrix of services under certain circum-
stances; providing for audits by the Auditor General; providing require-
ments for the audits; requiring the State Board of Education to adopt
rules; specifying the required rules; amending s. 220.187, F.S., relating
to the Corporate Tax Credit Scholarship Program; providing a short
title; providing definitions; eliminating the $5-million cap on contribu-
tions to any single eligible nonprofit scholarship-funding organization;
prohibiting certain private schools and other entities from participating
in the scholarship program; authorizing students whose family income
level meets certain federal poverty level criteria to continue to partici-
pate in the scholarship program; prohibiting certain students from par-
ticipating in the scholarship program; revising limitations on the alloca-
tion of annual credits granted under the program; providing limitations
on eligible contributions; requiring scholarship-funding organizations to
obligate all of the contributions subject to certain conditions; requiring
the Auditor General to review certain audits, request certain informa-
tion, and report to the Legislative Auditing Committee any findings of
noncompliance; authorizing the Legislative Auditing Committee to con-
duct hearings and compel the Department of Education to revoke eligi-
bility of certain nonprofit scholarship-funding organizations; providing
for audit reports to be submitted to the Department of Education; requir-
ing audits be conducted within 180 days after completion of the nonprofit
scholarship-funding organization’s fiscal year; requiring a nonprofit
scholarship-funding organization to make scholarship payments at least
on a quarterly basis; prohibiting commingling of certain scholarship
funds; requiring a nonprofit scholarship-funding organization to main-
tain a separate account for scholarship funds; requiring a nonprofit
scholarship-funding organization to verify student attendance at a pri-
vate school prior to submission of scholarship funds; requiring a non-
profit scholarship-funding organization to verify income eligibility of
qualified students at least once a year in accordance with State Board
of Education rules; requiring a nonprofit scholarship-funding organiza-
tion to submit certain reports to the Department of Education; requiring
certain individuals to undergo level 2 background screening require-
ments pursuant to s. 435.04, F.S.; providing for the Department of Law
Enforcement to retain and search fingerprint records; providing for an
annual fee as provided by rule of the Department of Law Enforcement;
requiring costs of background checks be borne by certain parties; requir-
ing the Department of Education to verify the background screening
information provided by the eligible nonprofit scholarship-funding orga-
nization; requiring the Department of Law Enforcement to provide the
Department of Education with information related to background
screening; prohibiting certain eligible nonprofit scholarship-funding or-
ganizations the owners of which have filed for bankruptcy from partici-
pating in the program; requiring a nonprofit scholarship-funding organi-
zation comply with antidiscrimination provisions of 42 U.S.C. s. 2000d;
prohibiting an owner or a nonprofit scholarship-funding organization
from owning, operating, or administering an eligible private school
under the scholarship program; requiring a nonprofit scholarship-
funding organization to report any private school not in compliance with
scholarship program requirements to the Department of Education; pro-
hibiting provision of scholarship funds to a student to attend a private
school not in compliance; authorizing a parent to transfer the scholar-
ship; requiring award of scholarships on a first-come, first-served basis;
prohibiting a nonprofit scholarship-funding organization from targeting
certain students for scholarships; prohibiting the award of scholarships
to a child of an owner of a nonprofit scholarship-funding organization;
prohibiting a nonprofit scholarship-funding organization from securing
financing in anticipation of eligible contributions; prohibiting a non-
profit scholarship-funding organization from participating in the pro-
gram if the organization fails to meet statutory obligations; requiring
students to meet certain attendance policies; requiring parents to meet
certain parental involvement requirements unless excused; prohibiting



April 29, 2005

a parent from authorizing a power of attorney for endorsement of schol-
arship warrant; requiring a parent to ensure that a scholarship student
participates in testing requirements; prohibiting a student or parent of
a student from participating in the scholarship program if the student
or parent fails to meet statutory obligations; revising provisions with
respect to private schools; revising requirements that a participating
private school demonstrate fiscal soundness; requiring a private school
that is subject to enforcement action by the department for certain
violations to file certain surety bonds and, pending compliance with
certain laws, cease accepting new scholarship students; requiring a pri-
vate school to employ or contract with teachers who have regular and
direct contact with students at the school’s physical location; requiring
the private schools to employ or contract with teachers who have at least
a baccalaureate degree or 3 years of teaching experience at a public or
private school, and other skills that qualify the teacher to provide appro-
priate instruction; requiring a private school to report to the Department
of Education the qualifications of teachers; requiring a private school to
annually register with the Department of Education and provide certain
information concerning the private school organization, student list, and
notice of intent to participate in the scholarship program; requiring
certain individuals to undergo level 2 background screening require-
ments pursuant to s. 435.04, F.S.; providing for the Department of Law
Enforcement to retain and search fingerprint records; providing for an
annual fee as provided by rule of the Department of Law Enforcement;
requiring that costs of background checks be borne by certain parties;
requiring the Department of Law Enforcement to provide the Depart-
ment of Education with information related to background screening;
requiring a private school to administer or to make provision for admin-
istering certain tests to scholarship students; requiring reporting of
scores to the student’s parent and to the public university that was
selected to analyze and report certain data; requiring a private school to
cooperate with a scholarship student whose parent chooses to partici-
pate in certain assessments; requiring a private school to file an affida-
vit; requiring a private school to notify the Department of Education in
writing within 7 days if a student is ineligible to participate in the
scholarship program; requiring a private school to report to the Depart-
ment of Education and distribute to scholarship applicants information
concerning accreditation and years in existence; requiring the Depart-
ment of Education to make certain information concerning private
school accreditation available to the public; prohibiting a private school
from participating in the scholarship program if the private school fails
to meet its statutory obligations; prohibiting discrimination on the basis
of religion by a private school; requiring the Department of Education
to determine the eligibility of certain nonprofit scholarship-funding or-
ganizations within 90 days after application; requiring a written notice
with specific reasons for approval or denial; requiring the Department
of Education to annually determine the eligibility of nonprofit scholar-
ship-funding organizations and private schools; requiring the Depart-
ment of Education to make accessible to the public a list of eligible
private schools; requiring the Department of Education to annually ver-
ify the eligibility of students; requiring the Department of Education to
maintain a student database of program participants and to update the
database at least quarterly; requiring the Department of Education to
notify a nonprofit scholarship-funding organization of any ineligible stu-
dent; requiring the Department of Education to annually account for and
verify the eligibility of program expenditures; requiring the Department
of Education to review audits; providing for selection by the Commis-
sioner of Education of a public university to analyze and report on
certain student data; requiring the public university to report student
performance data; providing limitations on reporting; requiring the De-
partment of Education to revoke the eligibility of program participants
for failure to comply with statutory obligations; requiring the Depart-
ment of Education to conduct investigations of certain complaints; re-
quiring the Department of Education to annually report on accountabil-
ity activities; requiring the department to verify information; requiring
the State Board of Education to adopt rules regarding documentation to
establish eligibility of nonprofit scholarship-funding organizations, re-
quiring an affidavit, and requiring independent income verification for
determining the eligibility of students; authorizing the State Board of
Education to delegate its authority to the Commissioner of Education
with the exception of rulemaking authority; providing that a secular
private school may continue its participation in the scholarship program
even if the act is found to violate the State Constitution; providing an
effective date.

—was read the second time by title.

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

715

MOTION

On motion by Senator Wise, the rules were waived to allow the follow-
ing amendment to be considered:

Senator Wise moved the following amendment which was adopted:

Amendment 1 (302708)(with title amendment)—On page 62,
lines 8-12, delete section 4 and renumber subsequent section.

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 11, line 28 through page 12, line 1, delete those lines and
insert: authority; providing an

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, CS for CS for CS for SB 2 as amended was
ordered engrossed and then placed on the calendar of Bills on Third
Reading.

On motion by Senator Aronberg—

CS for SB 282—A bill to be entitled An act relating to criminal acts
committed during a state of emergency; amending s. 810.02, F.S.; pro-
viding enhanced penalties for specified burglaries that are committed
during a state of emergency; providing that a person arrested for com-
mitting a burglary during a state of emergency may not be released until
that person appears before a magistrate at a first-appearance hearing;
directing that a felony burglary committed during a state of emergency
be reclassified one level above the current ranking of the offense commit-
ted; amending s. 812.014, F.S.; providing enhanced penalties for the
theft of certain property stolen during a state of emergency; directing
that a felony theft committed during a state of emergency be reclassified
one level above the current ranking of the offense committed; providing
an effective date.

—was read the second time by title.

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, CS for SB 282 was placed on the calendar of
Bills on Third Reading.

CS for CS for SB 2236—A bill to be entitled An act relating to tuition
rates at state colleges and universities; amending s. 1009.24, F.S.; pro-
viding that the Legislature has the responsibility to establish tuition
and fees; providing that tuition and fees for certain state university
resident students are established within the General Appropriations Act
or law; requiring each board of trustees to set university tuition and fees
under certain circumstances; providing that such tuition and fees may
not exceed tuition and fees for corresponding programs at certain public
institutions; requiring each university to allocate a certain percentage
amount raised by tuition increases to financial aid for students; provid-
ing that tuition and fees for certain students are not subject to a cap;
creating s. 1009.286, F.S.; requiring students to pay 75 percent of the
actual cost per credit hour for credit hours in excess of a specified num-
ber for community-college credits and for overall credits applied to a
baccalaureate degree; excluding certain credit hours from calculation as
hours required to earn a baccalaureate degree; providing for notification
of students by a postsecondary institution; providing applicability; pro-
viding an effective date.

—was read the second time by title.
MOTION

On motion by Senator Constantine, the rules were waived to allow the
following amendment to be considered:

Senator Constantine moved the following amendment which was
adopted:

Amendment 1 (562590)—On page 5, lines 19-21, delete those lines
and insert: undertaken while pursuing a degree;

(g) Remedial and English as a Second Language credit hours; and

(h) Credit hours earned in military science courses (R.0.T.C).



716

On motion by Senator Constantine, further consideration of CS for
CS for SB 2236 as amended was deferred.

On motion by Senator Atwater—

CS for CS for SB 2264—A bill to be entitled An act relating to the
payment of instructional costs for students; amending s. 1009.21, F.S,;
defining the term “initial enrollment” for purposes of determining a
postsecondary student’s residential status for tuition purposes; provid-
ing duties of institutions of higher education; providing conditions under
which a nonresident may be reclassified as a resident of this state;
requiring that specified evidence of the legal residence and dependent
status of an individual be provided as a prerequisite to classification as
aresident for tuition purposes; amending s. 1009.24, F.S.; providing that
the Legislature has the responsibility to establish tuition and fees; pro-
viding that tuition and fees for certain state university resident students
are established within the General Appropriations Act or law; requiring
each board of trustees to set university tuition and fees under certain
circumstances; providing that such tuition and fees may not exceed
tuition and fees for corresponding programs at certain public institu-
tions; requiring each university to allocate a certain percentage amount
raised by tuition increases to financial aid for students; providing that
tuition and fees for certain students are not subject to a cap; amending
s. 1009.40, F.S.; providing that certain students are ineligible to receive
more than one state-funded tuition assistance grant; providing an effec-
tive date.

—was read the second time by title.

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, CS for CS for SB 2264 was placed on the
calendar of Bills on Third Reading.

On motion by Senator Clary—

CS for SB 786—A bill to be entitled An act relating to fees imposed
on tire and battery sales; amending s. 403.718, F.S.; imposing a fee on
the sale of new motor vehicle tires sold to governmental entities; amend-
ing s. 403.7185, F.S.; imposing a fee on the sale of new or remanufac-
tured lead-acid batteries sold to governmental entities; specifying that
certain amendments are remedial in nature and are intended for clarifi-
cation; providing that certain dealers are not eligible for a refund; pro-
viding an effective date.

—was read the second time by title.

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, CS for SB 786 was placed on the calendar of
Bills on Third Reading.

Consideration of CS for CS for SB 2542 was deferred.

CS for CS for SB 1264—A bill to be entitled An act relating to
highway safety; creating the Anjelica and Victoria Velez Memorial Traf-
fic Safety Act; amending s. 316.650, F.S.; requiring the printed traffic
citation form to have a box for failing to stop at a traffic signal; amending
s. 318.18, F.S.; revising the penalty for a moving violation of a traffic
control signal showing a steady red indication; providing for distribution
of moneys collected; amending s. 318.21, F.S.; providing for distribution
of specified civil penalties; amending s. 322.0261, F.S.; requiring a driver
improvement course for a second moving violation of a traffic control
signal showing a steady red indication within a specified time period;
providing a penalty for failure to complete such course within a specified
time period; amending s. 322.27, F.S.; assigning a point value for convic-
tion of a moving violation of a traffic control signal showing a steady red
indication; correcting a cross-reference relating to assessment of points
for litter violations; creating s. 395.4036, F.S.; providing for distribution
of funds to trauma centers; authorizing trauma centers to request that
such funds be used as intergovernmental transfer funds in the Medicaid
program; providing for audits and attestations; providing an appropria-
tion; providing an effective date.

—was read the second time by title.

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

April 29, 2005

Amendments were considered and adopted to conform CS for CS for
SB 1264 to HB 497.

Pending further consideration of CS for CS for SB 1264 as amended,
on motion by Senator Saunders, by two-thirds vote HB 497 was with-
drawn from the Committees on Transportation; Health Care; Govern-
ment Efficiency Appropriations; Health and Human Services Appropria-
tions; and Ways and Means.

On motion by Senator Saunders, the rules were waived and—

HB 497—A bill to be entitled An act relating to highway safety; creat-
ing the Anjelica and Victoria Velez Memorial Traffic Safety Act; amend-
ing s. 316.650, F.S.; requiring traffic citation forms to include a check box
indicating a failure to stop at a traffic signal; amending s. 318.18, F.S.;
revising the penalty for a moving violation of a traffic control signal
steady red indication and of a traffic control device when a driver fails
to stop at a traffic signal; providing for distribution of moneys collected;
amending s. 318.21, F.S.; providing for distribution of specified civil
penalties; amending s. 322.0261, F.S.; requiring the Department of
Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles to identify a person who has com-
mitted a second moving violation of a traffic control signal steady red
indication or of a traffic control device within a specified time period and
require such person to complete a driver improvement course; providing
for cancellation of license for failure to complete said course within a
specified time period; amending s. 322.27, F.S.; assigning a point value
for the conviction of a moving violation of a traffic control signal steady
red indication or of a traffic control device; creating s. 395.4036, F.S.;
providing for distribution of funds to trauma centers; authorizing
trauma centers to request that such funds be used as intergovernmental
transfer funds in the Medicaid program; providing for audits and attes-
tations; providing an appropriation; providing an effective date.

—a companion measure, was substituted for CS for CS for SB 1264
as amended and read the second time by title.

On motion by Senator Saunders, further consideration of HB 497 was
deferred.

CS for CS for SB 1110—A bill to be entitled An act relating to the
distribution of proceeds from the excise tax on documents; amending s.
201.15, F.S.; revising monetary criteria for distributing portions of the
tax to certain trust funds; requiring that proceeds of the tax in excess of
specified amounts be deposited into the General Revenue Fund; provid-
ing for increased distributions to certain trust funds under certain cir-
cumstances to provide for payments on bonds; revising monetary criteria
for distributing portions of the tax to the State Housing Trust Fund and
the Local Government Housing Trust Fund for purposes of preserving
the rights of holders of affordable housing guarantees; requiring distri-
butions to the State Housing Trust Fund to be sufficient for certain
purposes; providing direction on the recurring impact; making appropri-
ations; providing a limitation; providing an effective date.

—was read the second time by title.

Senators Carlton and Pruitt offered the following amendment which
was moved by Senator Carlton and adopted:

Amendment 1 (654258)(with title amendment)—On page 10,
lines 11-20, delete those lines and insert:

Section 2. Effective July 1, 2005, there is appropriated for the 2005-
2006 fiscal year to the Florida Housing Finance Corporation
$175,500,000 from the Local Government Housing Trust Fund and
$74,500,000 from the State Housing Trust Fund for the purpose of pro-
viding funds to eligible entities for affordable housing recovery efforts as
recommended by the Hurricane Housing Work Group.

Section 3. To administer section 2 of this act, the Florida Housing
Finance Corporation may adopt emergency rules pursuant to section
120.54, Florida Statutes. The Legislature finds that emergency rules
adopted pursuant to this section meet the health, safety, and welfare
requirement of section 120.54(4), Florida Statutes. The Legislature finds
that such emergency rulemaking power is necessary for the preservation
of the rights and welfare of the people in order to provide additional funds
to assist those areas of the state which sustained housing damage due to
hurricanes during 2004. Therefore, in adopting such emergency rules, the



April 29, 2005

corporation need not make the findings required by section 120.54(4)(a),
Florida Statutes. Emergency rules adopted under this section are exempt
from section 120.54(4)(c), Florida Statutes, and shall remain in effect for
180 days.

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 1, lines 18-20, delete those lines and insert: for certain
purposes; making appropriations; authorizing the Florida Housing Fi-
nance Corporation to adopt emergency rules; providing legislative find-
ings; exempting such emergency rules from the requirements of the
Administrative Procedure Act in s. 120.54, F.S., relating to the effective
time period for emergency rules; providing an effective

MOTION

On motion by Senator Klein, the rules were waived to allow the follow-
ing amendment to be considered:

Senator Klein moved the following amendment which failed:

Amendment 2 (115550)—On page 7, line 10 through page 10, line 7,
delete those lines and insert:

(9) The lesser of seven and fifty-three hundredths percent of the
remaining taxes collected under this chapter or an amount equal to
$8.38 multiplied by the state population, with the determination of such
population to be made with respect to any fiscal year on the basis of the
most recent census estimate of the resident population of the state re-
leased by the Bureau of Census before the January 15 which precedes the
beginning of such fiscal year, shall be paid into the State Treasury to the
credit of the State Housing Trust Fund and shall be used as follows:

(a) Half of that amount shall be used for the purposes for which the
State Housing Trust Fund was created and exists by law.

(b) Half of that amount shall be paid into the State Treasury to the
credit of the Local Government Housing Trust Fund and shall be used
for the purposes for which the Local Government Housing Trust Fund
was created and exists by law.

(10) The lesser of eight and sixty-six hundredths percent of the re-
maining taxes collected under this chapter or an amount equal to $10.65
multiplied by the state population, with the determination of such popu-
lation to be made with respect to any fiscal year on the basis of the most
recent census estimate of the resident population of the state released by
the Bureau of Census before the January 15 which precedes the beginning
of such fiscal year, shall be paid into the State Treasury to the credit of
the State Housing Trust Fund and shall be used as follows:

(a) Twelve and one-half percent of that amount shall be deposited
into the State Housing Trust Fund and be expended by the Department
of Community Affairs and by the Florida Housing Finance Corporation
for the purposes for which the State Housing Trust Fund was created
and exists by law.

(b) Eighty-seven and one-half percent of that amount shall be dis-
tributed to the Local Government Housing Trust Fund and shall be used
for the purposes for which the Local Government Housing Trust Fund
was created and exists by law. Funds from this category may also be
used to provide for state and local services to assist the homeless.

(11) From the moneys specified in paragraphs (1)(d) and (2)(a) and
prior to deposit of any moneys into the General Revenue Fund, $30
million shall be paid into the State Treasury to the credit of the
Ecosystem Management and Restoration Trust Fund in fiscal year 2000-
2001 and each fiscal year thereafter, to be used for the preservation and
repair of the state’s beaches as provided in ss. 161.091-161.212, and $2
million shall be paid into the State Treasury to the credit of the Marine
Resources Conservation Trust Fund to be used for marine mammal care
as provided in s. 370.0603(3).

(12) The Department of Revenue may use the payments credited to
trust funds pursuant to paragraphs (1)(c) and (2)(b) and subsections (3),
(4), (5), (6), (7), (8), (9), and (10) to pay the costs of the collection and
enforcement of the tax levied by this chapter. The percentage of such
costs which may be assessed against a trust fund is a ratio, the numera-
tor of which is payments credited to that trust fund under this section
and the denominator of which is the sum of payments made under

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

717

paragraphs (1)(c) and (2)(b) and subsections (3), (4), (5), (6), (7), (8), (9),
and (10).

(13) The distribution of proceeds deposited into the Water Manage-
ment Lands Trust Fund and the Conservation and Recreation Lands
Trust Fund, pursuant to subsections (4) and (5), shall not be used for
land acquisition, but may be used for preacquisition costs associated
with land purchases. The Legislature intends that the Florida Forever
program supplant the acquisition programs formerly authorized under
ss. 259.032 and 373.59. Prior to the 2005 Regular Session of the Legisla-
ture, the Acquisition and Restoration Council shall review and make
recommendations to the Legislature concerning the need to repeal this
provision. Based on these recommendations, the Legislature shall re-
view the need to repeal this provision during the 2005 Regular Session.

(14) Amounts distributed pursuant to subsections (5), (6), (7) and (8)
are subject to the payment of debt service on outstanding Conservation
and Recreation Lands revenue bonds.

(15) Beginning July 1, 2008, in each fiscal year that the remaining
taxes collected under this chapter exceed such collections in the prior
fiscal year, the stated maximum dollar amounts provided in subsections
(2), 4), (6), and (7) shall each be increased by an amount equal to 10
percent of the increase in the remaining taxes collected under this chapter
multiplied by the applicable percentage provided in those subsections.

(16) If the payment requirements in any year for bonds outstanding
on July 1, 2007, or bonds issued to refund such bonds, exceed the limita-
tions of this section, distributions to the trust fund from which the bond
payments are made shall be increased to the lesser of the amount needed
to pay bond obligations or the limit of the applicable percentage distribu-
tion provided in subsections (1)-(12).

(17) Distributions to the State Housing Trust Fund pursuant to sub-
sections (9) and (10) shall be sufficient to cover amounts required to be
transferred to the Florida Affordable Housing Guarantee Program’s an-
nual debt service reserve and guarantee fund pursuant to s.
420.5092(6)(a) and (b) up to but not exceeding the amount required to be
transferred to such reserve and fund based on the percentage distribution
of documentary stamp tax revenues to the State Housing Trust Fund
which is in effect in the 2004-2005 fiscal year.

(18) In each fiscal year after fiscal year 2007-2008, the stated maxi-
mum dollar amounts provided in subsections (9) and (10) shall be in-
creased by a cost adjustment equal to such dollar amount multiplied by
the percentage by which the median sales price of a single-family existing
home as of December of the calendar year preceding such fiscal year
exceeds the sales price of such a home as of December 2006. For purposes
of this subsection, the term “median price of a single-family existing
home” means the price in the Florida Sales Report released each year by
the Florida Association of Realtors and the University of Florida Real
Estate Research Center.

(19) The remaining taxes collected under this chapter,

On motion by Senator Atwater, further consideration of CS for CS
for SB 1110 as amended was deferred.

On motion by Senator Atwater—

HB 1889—A bill to be entitled An act relating to the distribution of
proceeds from the excise tax on documents; amending s. 201.15, F.S,;
revising monetary criteria for distributing portions of the tax to certain
trust funds; revising authorization for the Department of Revenue to use
certain amounts for certain purposes; requiring that proceeds of the tax
in excess of specified amounts be deposited into the General Revenue
Fund; providing for increased distributions to certain trust funds under
certain circumstances to provide for payments on bonds; revising mone-
tary criteria for distributing portions of the tax to the State Housing
Trust Fund and the Local Government Housing Trust Fund for purposes
of preserving the rights of holders of affordable housing guarantees;
requiring distributions to the State Housing Trust Fund to be sufficient
for certain purposes; providing a limitation; providing effective dates.

—was read the second time by title.

Senator Atwater moved the following amendment which was adopted:



718

Amendment 1 (874624)(with title amendment)—Delete every-
thing after the enacting clause and insert:

Section 1. Section 201.15, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

201.15 Distribution of taxes collected.—All taxes collected under this
chapter shall be distributed as follows and shall be subject to the service
charge imposed in s. 215.20(1), except that such service charge shall not
be levied against any portion of taxes pledged to debt service on bonds
to the extent that the amount of the service charge is required to pay any
amounts relating to the bonds:

(1) Sixty-two and sixty-three hundredths percent of the remaining
taxes collected under this chapter shall be used for the following pur-
poses:

(a) Amounts as shall be necessary to pay the debt service on, or fund
debt service reserve funds, rebate obligations, or other amounts payable
with respect to Preservation 2000 bonds issued pursuant to s. 375.051
and Florida Forever bonds issued pursuant to s. 215.618, shall be paid
into the State Treasury to the credit of the Land Acquisition Trust Fund
to be used for such purposes. The amount transferred to the Land Acqui-
sition Trust Fund fer-saeh—purpeses shall not exceed $300 million in
fiscal year 1999-2000 and thereafter for Preservation 2000 bonds and
bonds issued to refund Preservation 2000 bonds, and $300 million in
fiscal year 2000-2001 and thereafter for Florida Forever bonds. The
annual amount transferred to the Land Acquisition Trust Fund for Flor-
ida Forever bonds shall not exceed $30 million in the first fiscal year in
which bonds are issued. The limitation on the amount transferred shall
be increased by an additional $30 million in each subsequent fiscal year,
but shall not exceed a total of $300 million in any fiscal year for all bonds
issued. It is the intent of the Legislature that all bonds issued to fund
the Florida Forever Act be retired by December 31, 2030. Except for
bonds issued to refund previously issued bonds, no series of bonds may
be issued pursuant to this paragraph unless such bonds are approved
and the debt service for the remainder of the fiscal year in which the
bonds are issued is specifically appropriated in the General Appropria-
tions Act. For purposes of refunding Preservation 2000 bonds, amounts
designated within this section for Preservation 2000 and Florida Forever
bonds may be transferred between the two programs to the extent pro-
vided for in the documents authorizing the issuance of the bonds. The
Preservation 2000 bonds and Florida Forever bonds shall be equally and
ratably secured by moneys distributable to the Land Acquisition Trust
Fund pursuant to this section, except to the extent specifically provided
otherwise by the documents authorizing the issuance of the bonds. No
moneys transferred to the Land Acquisition Trust Fund pursuant to this
paragraph, or earnings thereon, shall be used or made available to pay
debt service on the Save Our Coast revenue bonds.

(b) The remainder of the moneys distributed under this subsection,
after the required payment under paragraph (a), shall be paid into the
State Treasury to the credit of the Save Our Everglades Trust Fund in
amounts necessary to pay debt service, provide reserves, and pay rebate
obligations and other amounts due with respect to bonds issued under
s. 215.619.

(¢) The remainder of the moneys distributed under this subsection,
after the required payments under paragraphs (a) and (b), shall be paid
into the State Treasury to the credit of the Land Acquisition Trust Fund
and may be used for any purpose for which funds deposited in the Land
Acquisition Trust Fund may lawfully be used. Payments made under
this paragraph shall continue until the cumulative amount credited to
the Land Acquisition Trust Fund for the fiscal year under this para-
graph and paragraph (2)(b) equals 70 percent of the current official
forecast for distributions of taxes collected under this chapter pursuant
to subsection (2). As used in this paragraph, the term “current official
forecast” means the most recent forecast as determined by the Revenue
Estimating Conference. If the current official forecast for a fiscal year
changes after payments under this paragraph have ended during that
fiscal year, no further payments are required under—this—paragraph

during the fiscal year.

(d) The remainder of the moneys distributed under this subsection,
after the required payments under paragraphs (a), (b), and (c), shall be
paid into the State Treasury to the credit of the General Revenue Fund
of the-state to be used and expended for the purposes for which the
General Revenue Fund was created and exists by law or to the
Ecosystem Management and Restoration Trust Fund or to the Marine
Resources Conservation Trust Fund as provided in subsection (11).

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

April 29, 2005

(2) The lesser of seven and fifty-six hundredths percent of the re-
maining taxes collected under this chapter or $84.9 million in each fiscal
year shall be used for the following purposes:

(a) Beginning in the month following the final payment for a fiscal
year under paragraph (1)(c), available moneys shall be paid into the
State Treasury to the credit of the General Revenue Fund efthe-state
to be used and expended for the purposes for which the General Revenue
Fund was created and exists by law or to the Ecosystem Management
and Restoration Trust Fund or to the Marine Resources Conservation
Trust Fund as provided in subsection (11). Payments made under this
paragraph shall continue until the cumulative amount credited to the
General Revenue Fund for the fiscal year under this paragraph equals
the cumulative payments made under paragraph (1)(c) for the same
fiscal year.

(b) The remainder of the moneys distributed under this subsection
shall be paid into the State Treasury to the credit of the Land Acquisi-
tion Trust Fund. Sums deposited in the fund pursuant to this subsection
may be used for any purpose for which funds deposited in the Land
Acquisition Trust Fund may lawfully be used.

(8) The lesser of one and ninety-four hundredths percent of the re-
maining taxes collected under this chapter or $26 million in each fiscal
year shall be paid into the State Treasury to the credit of the Land
Acquisition Trust Fund. Moneys deposited in the trust fund pursuant to

this section shall be used for-thefellowingpurpeses:

to acquire coastal lands
or to pay debt service on bonds issued to acquire coastal lands; and

to develop and manage
lands acquired with moneys from the Land Acquisition Trust Fund.

(4) The lesser of four and two-tenths percent of the remaining taxes
collected under this chapter or $60.5 million in each fiscal year shall be
paid into the State Treasury to the credit of the Water Management
Lands Trust Fund. Sums deposited in that fund may be used for any
purpose authorized in s. 373.59.

(5) Four and two-tenths percent of the remaining taxes collected
under this chapter shall be paid into the State Treasury to the credit of
the Conservation and Recreation Lands Trust Fund to carry out the
purposes set forth in s. 259.032. Nine and one-half percent of the amount
credited to the Conservation and Recreation Lands Trust Fund pursuant
to this subsection shall be transferred to the State Game Trust Fund and
used for land management activities.

(6) The lesser of two and twenty-eight hundredths percent of the
remaining taxes collected under this chapter or $36.1 million in each
fiscal year shall be paid into the State Treasury to the credit of the
Invasive Plant Control Trust Fund to carry out the purposes set forth in
ss. 369.22 and 369.252.

(7)  The lesser of one-half of one percent of the remaining taxes col-
lected under this chapter or $9.3 million in each fiscal year shall be paid
into the State Treasury to the credit of the State Game Trust Fund to
be used exclusively for the purpose of implementing the Lake Restora-
tion 2020 Program.

(8) One-half of one percent of the remaining taxes collected under
this chapter shall be paid into the State Treasury and divided equally
to the credit of the Department of Environmental Protection Water
Quality Assurance Trust Fund to address water quality impacts associ-
ated with nonagricultural nonpoint sources and to the credit of the
Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services General Inspection
Trust Fund to address water quality impacts associated with agricul-
tural nonpoint sources, respectively. These funds shall be used for re-
search, development, demonstration, and implementation of suitable
best management practices or other measures used to achieve water
quality standards in surface waters and water segments identified pur-
suant to ss. 303(d) of the Clean Water Act, Pub. L. No. 92-500, 33 U.S.C.
ss. 1251 et seq. Implementation of best management practices and other
measures may include cost-share grants, technical assistance, imple-
mentation tracking, and conservation leases or other agreements for
water quality improvement. The Department of Environmental Protec-
tion and the Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services may
adopt rules governing the distribution of funds for implementation of
best management practices. The unobligated balance of funds received



April 29, 2005

from the distribution of taxes collected under this chapter to address
water quality impacts associated with nonagricultural nonpoint sources
will be excluded when calculating the unobligated balance of the Water
Quality Assurance Trust Fund as it relates to the determination of the
applicable excise tax rate.

(9) The lesser of seven and fifty-three hundredths percent of the
remaining taxes collected under this chapter or $107 million in each
fiscal year shall be paid into the State Treasury to the credit of the State
Housing Trust Fund and shall be used as follows:

(a) Half of that amount shall be used for the purposes for which the
State Housing Trust Fund was created and exists by law.

(b) Half of that amount shall be paid into the State Treasury to the
credit of the Local Government Housing Trust Fund and shall be used
for the purposes for which the Local Government Housing Trust Fund
was created and exists by law.

(10) The lessor of eight and sixty-six hundredths percent of the re-
maining taxes collected under this chapter or $136 million in each fiscal
year shall be paid into the State Treasury to the credit of the State
Housing Trust Fund and shall be used as follows:

(a) Twelve and one-half percent of that amount shall be deposited
into the State Housing Trust Fund and be expended by the Department
of Community Affairs and by the Florida Housing Finance Corporation
for the purposes for which the State Housing Trust Fund was created
and exists by law.

(b) Eighty-seven and one-half percent of that amount shall be dis-
tributed to the Local Government Housing Trust Fund and shall be used
for the purposes for which the Local Government Housing Trust Fund
was created and exists by law. Funds from this category may also be
used to provide for state and local services to assist the homeless.

(11) From the moneys specified in paragraphs (1)(d) and (2)(a) and
prior to deposit of any moneys into the General Revenue Fund, $30
million shall be paid into the State Treasury to the credit of the
Ecosystem Management and Restoration Trust Fund in fiscal year 2000-
2001 and each fiscal year thereafter, to be used for the preservation and
repair of the state’s beaches as provided in ss. 161.091-161.212, and $2
million shall be paid into the State Treasury to the credit of the Marine
Resources Conservation Trust Fund to be used for marine mammal care
as provided in s. 370.0603(3).

(12) The Department of Revenue may use the payments credited to
trust funds pursuant to paragraphs (1)(c) and (2)(b) and subsections (3),
(4), (5), (6), (7), (8), (9), and (10) to pay the costs of the collection and
enforcement of the tax levied by this chapter. The percentage of such
costs which may be assessed against a trust fund is a ratio, the numera-
tor of which is payments credited to that trust fund under this section
and the denominator of which is the sum of payments made under
paragraphs (1)(c) and (2)(b) and subsections (3), (4), (5), (6), (7), (8), (9),
and (10).

(13) The distribution of proceeds deposited into the Water Manage-
ment Lands Trust Fund and the Conservation and Recreation Lands
Trust Fund, pursuant to subsections (4) and (5), shall not be used for
land acquisition, but may be used for preacquisition costs associated
with land purchases. The Legislature intends that the Florida Forever
program supplant the acquisition programs formerly authorized under
ss. 259.032 and 373.59. Prior to the 2005 Regular Session of the Legisla-
ture, the Acquisition and Restoration Council shall review and make
recommendations to the Legislature concerning the need to repeal this
provision. Based on these recommendations, the Legislature shall re-
view the need to repeal this provision during the 2005 Regular Session.

(14) Amounts distributed pursuant to subsections (5), (6), (7) and (8)
are subject to the payment of debt service on outstanding Conservation
and Recreation Lands revenue bonds.

(15) Beginning July 1, 2008, in each fiscal year that the remaining
taxes collected under this chapter exceed such collections in the prior
fiscal year, the stated maximum dollar amounts provided in subsections
2), (4), (6), (7), (9), and (10) shall each be increased by an amount equal
to 10 percent of the increase in the remaining taxes collected under this
chapter multiplied by the applicable percentage provided in those subsec-
tions.

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

719

(16) If the payment requirements in any year for bonds outstanding
on July 1, 2007, or bonds issued to refund such bonds, exceed the limita-
tions of this section, distributions to the trust fund from which the bond
payments are made shall be increased to the lesser of the amount needed
to pay bond obligations or the limit of the applicable percentage distribu-
tion provided in subsections (1)-(12).

(17) Distributions to the State Housing Trust Fund pursuant to sub-
sections (9) and (10) shall be sufficient to cover amounts required to be
transferred to the Florida Affordable Housing Guarantee Program’s an-
nual debt service reserve and guarantee fund pursuant to s.
420.5092(6)(a) and (b) up to but not exceeding the amount required to be
transferred to such reserve and fund based on the percentage distribution
of documentary stamp tax revenues to the State Housing Trust Fund
which is in effect in the 2004-2005 fiscal year.

(18) The remaining taxes collected under this chapter, after the distri-
butions provided in the preceding subsections, shall be paid into the State
Treasury to the credit of the General Revenue Fund.

Section 2. Effective July 1, 2005, there is appropriated for the 2005-
2006 fiscal year to the Florida Housing Finance Corporation $175.5
million from the Local Government Housing Trust Fund and $74.5 mil-
lion from the State Housing Trust Fund for the purpose of providing
funds to eligible entities for affordable housing recovery efforts as recom-
mended by the Hurricane Housing Work Group.

Section 3. To administer section 2 of this act, the Florida Housing
Finance Corporation may adopt emergency rules pursuant to section
120.54, Florida Statutes. The Legislature finds that emergency rules
adopted pursuant to this section meet the health, safety, and welfare
requirement of section 120.54(4), Florida Statutes. The Legislature finds
that such emergency rulemaking power is necessary for the preservation
of the rights and welfare of the people in order to provide additional funds
to assist those areas of the state which sustained housing damage due to
hurricanes during 2004. Therefore, in adopting such emergency rules, the
corporation need not make the findings required by section 120.54(4)(a),
Florida Statutes. Emergency rules adopted under this section are exempt
from section 120.54(4)(c), Florida Statutes, and shall remain in effect for
180 days.

Section 4. Except as otherwise expressly provided in this act, this act
shall take effect July 1, 2007.

And the title is amended as follows:

Delete everything before the enacting clause and insert: A bill to be
entitled An act relating to the distribution of proceeds from the excise
tax on documents; amending s. 201.15, F.S.; revising monetary criteria
for distributing portions of the tax to certain trust funds; requiring that
proceeds of the tax in excess of specified amounts be deposited into the
General Revenue Fund; providing for increased distributions to certain
trust funds under certain circumstances to provide for payments on
bonds; revising monetary criteria for distributing portions of the tax to
the State Housing Trust Fund and the Local Government Housing Trust
Fund for purposes of preserving the rights of holders of affordable hous-
ing guarantees; requiring distributions to the State Housing Trust Fund
to be sufficient for certain purposes; making appropriations; authorizing
the Florida Housing Finance Corporation to adopt emergency rules;
providing legislative findings; exempting such emergency rules from the
requirements of s. 120.54, F.S,, relating to the effective time period for
emergency rules; providing an effective date.

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, HB 1889 as amended was placed on the calen-
dar of Bills on Third Reading.

On motion by Senator Haridopolos—

CS for SB 1592—A bill to be entitled An act relating to the Depart-
ment of Military Affairs; amending s. 250.01, F.S.; defining the term
“servicemembers’ group life insurance”; creating s. 250.342, F.S_; requir-
ing the department to provide life insurance for members of the Florida
National Guard, subject to appropriation; requiring a report; creating s.
250.5206, F.S.; requiring the Department of Military Affairs to establish
the Family Readiness Program; stating that the purpose of the program
is to provide need-based assistance to families of specified members of
the Florida National Guard who are on active duty; providing that im-
plementation of the program is subject to appropriations expressly pro-



720

vided for the program; specifying uses of the funds; specifying services
for which the funds may be used; providing criteria for program eligibil-
ity; providing for a review of requests for assistance under the program;
creating a Family Readiness Advisory Board; providing for membership
of the board; providing that the Adjutant General or the Adjutant Gener-
al’s designee has the authority to disburse program funds; providing for
periodic audits of the program; requiring the department to provide an
annual report to the Governor and the Legislature; authorizing the
department to adopt rules; providing an effective date.

—was read the second time by title.

An amendment was considered and adopted to conform CS for SB
1592 to HB 1069.

Pending further consideration of CS for SB 1592 as amended, on
motion by Senator Haridopolos, by two-thirds vote HB 1069 was with-
drawn from the Committees on Community Affairs; and Transportation
and Economic Development Appropriations.

On motion by Senator Haridopolos, the rules were waived and—

HB 1069—A bill to be entitled An act relating to the Family Readiness
Program; creating s. 250.5206, F.S.; creating the Family Readiness Pro-
gram within the Department of Military Affairs; providing purpose of
the program; providing for program funding and use of program funds;
specifying eligible services and eligible program recipients; providing
procedure with respect to requests for assistance and award of funds
under the program; providing for monthly audit reviews of the program,;
providing for annual reports; providing rulemaking authority of the
Department of Military Affairs; providing an appropriation; providing
an effective date.

—a companion measure, was substituted for CS for SB 1592 as
amended and read the second time by title.

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, HB 1069 was placed on the calendar of Bills
on Third Reading.

On motion by Senator Fasano—

SB 308—A bill to be entitled An act relating to law enforcement
officers; amending s. 112.532, F.S.; requiring that all identifiable wit-
nesses be interviewed, whenever possible, before beginning the investi-
gative interview of the accused law enforcement officer; requiring that
the complaint and all witness statements be given to the law enforce-
ment officer before beginning an investigative interview; providing an
effective date.

—was read the second time by title.

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, SB 308 was placed on the calendar of Bills on
Third Reading.

On motion by Senator Peaden—

CS for SB 1208—A bill to be entitled An act relating to long-term care
coverage; amending s. 409.905, F.S.; providing conditions for eligibility;
creating s. 409.9102, F.S.; directing the Agency for Health Care Admin-
istration to establish the Long-term Care Partnership Program; provid-
ing purpose and duties; directing the agency to submit a plan and pro-
posed legislation to the Legislature; providing a contingent effective
date.

—was read the second time by title.
MOTION

On motion by Senator Peaden, the rules were waived to allow the
following amendment to be considered:

Senator Peaden moved the following amendment which was adopted:

Amendment 1 (765870)—On page 3, line 28, delete “section
409.902,” and insert: section 409.905,

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

April 29, 2005

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, CS for SB 1208 as amended was ordered
engrossed and then placed on the calendar of Bills on Third Reading.

On motion by Senator Saunders, by two-thirds vote HB 1081 was
withdrawn from the Committees on Banking and Insurance; and Health
Care.

On motion by Senator Saunders—

HB 1081—A bill to be entitled An act relating to discount medical plan
organizations; amending s. 636.202, F.S.; revising a definition; amend-
ing s. 636.204, F.S.; revising provisions relating to licensure require-
ments to do business as a discount medical plan organization; creating
s. 636.205, F.S.; providing requirements for issuance of a license; autho-
rizing the Office of Insurance Regulation to deny a license; amending s.
636.206, F.S.; providing that discount medical plan organizations are
not subject to the Florida Insurance Code for purposes of examination
and investigation; creating s. 636.207, F.S.; providing for applicability
of pt. II of ch. 636, F.S.; amending s. 636.208, F.S.; revising provisions
relating to reimbursement of certain charges and fees upon cancellation
of membership in the plan; amending s. 636.210, F.S.; revising prohibi-
tions relating to advertising; amending s. 636.212, F.S.; revising provi-
sions relating to disclosures to prospective members; amending s.
636.214, F.S.; revising provisions relating to provider agreements;
amending s. 636.216, F.S.; providing conditions for approval of charges
and forms; deleting a provision relating to request for a hearing; amend-
ing s. 636.218, F.S.; revising requirements for information to be included
in annual reports; creating s. 636.223, F.S.; providing for administrative
penalties; amending s. 636.228, F.S.; specifying marketing requirements
of discount medical plans; providing limitations; amending s. 636.230,
F.S.; specifying fee disclosure requirements for bundling discount medi-
cal plans with other products; amending s. 636.236, F.S.; requiring dis-
count medical plan organizations to maintain surety bonds; providing
conditions for substituting deposited securities for surety bonds; amend-
ing s. 636.238, F.S.; revising penalties; repealing s. 636.242, F.S., relat-
ing to civil remedies; providing an effective date.

—a companion measure, was substituted for CS for SB 2214 and read
the second time by title.

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, HB 1081 was placed on the calendar of Bills
on Third Reading.

CS for SB 1232—A bill to be entitled An act relating to wind-
protection provisions of the Florida Building Code; amending ch. 2000-
141, Laws of Florida; providing for removal of outdated wind-protection
standards from the Florida Building Code; providing for an update of the
code’s wind-protection standards; providing an appropriation; providing
for incorporation in the Florida Building Code of the repeal of a design
option relating to internal pressure for buildings within the windborne
debris region; requiring the Florida Building Commission to make rec-
ommendations to the Legislature; providing an effective date.

—was read the second time by title.

The Committee on Regulated Industries recommended the following
amendment which was moved by Senator Lynn and adopted:

Amendment 1 (125694)—On page 3, line 1, after “appropriates” in-
sert: , for fiscal year 2005-2006 only,

Senator Lynn moved the following amendment:

Amendment 2 (091450)(with title amendment)—On page 1, line
19 through page 2, line 20, delete those lines and insert:

Section 1. Notwithstanding subsection (3) of section 109 of chapter
2000-141, Laws of Florida, for areas of the state which are not within the
high-velocity hurricane zone, the Florida Building Commission, upon
updating the Florida Building Code, shall adopt, pursuant to section
553.73, Florida Statutes, the most current edition of the wind-protection
requirements of the American Society of Civil Engineers, Standard 7, as
implemented by the International Building Code. This section is in-
tended to explicitly supersede only the first sentence of subsection (3) of
section 109 of chapter 2000-141, Laws of Florida.



April 29, 2005

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 1, lines 3-8, delete those lines and insert: of the Florida
Building Code; providing for the adoption into the Florida Building Code
of certain wind-protection standards applicable to areas outside the
high-velocity hurricane zone; providing an appropriation;

On motion by Senator Lynn, further consideration of CS for SB 1232
as amended with pending Amendment 2 (091450) was deferred.

On motion by Senator Bennett—

CS for SB 1702—A bill to be entitled An act relating to teen courts;
amending s. 938.19, F.S.; authorizing a board of county commissioners
to adopt an ordinance that incorporates the provisions of the act; provid-
ing funding for a teen court through the assessment of an additional
court cost against each person who pleads guilty or nolo contendere to,
or is convicted of, a violation of a criminal law, an ordinance, or a traffic
offense in the county; providing for administration by the clerk of the
circuit court; authorizing the clerk of the court to retain a specified
percentage of the assessments collected as income to the clerk of the
court; requiring the teen court to account for all funds deposited into the
teen court account; requiring an annual report to the board of county
commissioners by a specified date; authorizing specified organizations
to operate and administer a teen court program; prohibiting teen courts
in counties adopting an ordinance from recovering court costs under s.
939.185, F.S.; amending s. 939.185, F.S.; providing an exception for teen
court funding; providing an effective date.

—was read the second time by title.

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, CS for SB 1702 was placed on the calendar of
Bills on Third Reading.

RECESS

On motion by Senator Pruitt, the Senate recessed at 12:24 p.m. to
reconvene at 1:30 p.m. or upon call of the President.

AFTERNOON SESSION

The Senate was called to order by the President at 1:52 p.m. A quorum
present—39:

Mr. President Diaz de la Portilla Miller
Alexander Dockery Peaden
Argenziano Fasano Posey
Aronberg Garcia Pruitt
Atwater Geller Rich
Baker Haridopolos Saunders
Bennett Hill Sebesta
Bullard Jones Siplin
Campbell King Smith
Carlton Klein Villalobos
Clary Lawson Webster
Constantine Lynn Wilson
Crist Margolis Wise

SPECIAL ORDER CALENDAR, continued

On motion by Senator Alexander, by two-thirds vote HB 853 was
withdrawn from the Committee on Transportation.

On motion by Senator Alexander—

HB 853—A bill to be entitled An act relating to motor vehicle lease
agreements; amending s. 521.004, F.S.; revising retail lessor disclosure
requirements; revising requirement for copies of certain documents to be
provided to the lessee; providing an effective date.

—a companion measure, was substituted for SB 1356 and read the
second time by title.

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, HB 853 was placed on the calendar of Bills on
Third Reading.

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

721

SENATOR CARLTON PRESIDING
On motion by Senator Miller—

CS for SB 1498—A bill to be entitled An act relating to the Lead
Poisoning Prevention Screening and Education Act; providing a popular
name; providing legislative findings; providing definitions; providing for
the establishment of a statewide comprehensive educational program on
lead poisoning prevention; providing for a public information initiative;
providing for distribution of literature about childhood lead poisoning;
requiring the establishment of a screening program for early identifica-
tion of persons at risk of elevated levels of lead in the blood; providing
for screening of children; providing for prioritization of screening; pro-
viding for the maintenance of records of screenings; providing for report-
ing of cases of lead poisoning; providing an appropriation; providing
contingencies for appropriation; providing effective dates.

—was read the second time by title.
Senator Miller moved the following amendment which was adopted:

Amendment 1 (255792)—On page 8, lines 13 and 14, delete those
lines and insert: effect only upon the Department of Health receiving
federal lead poisoning prevention funds of $1 million or greater.

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, CS for SB 1498 as amended was ordered
engrossed and then placed on the calendar of Bills on Third Reading.

On motion by Senator Constantine, the Senate resumed consideration
of—

CS for CS for SB 2236—A bill to be entitled An act relating to tuition
rates at state colleges and universities; amending s. 1009.24, F.S_; pro-
viding that the Legislature has the responsibility to establish tuition
and fees; providing that tuition and fees for certain state university
resident students are established within the General Appropriations Act
or law; requiring each board of trustees to set university tuition and fees
under certain circumstances; providing that such tuition and fees may
not exceed tuition and fees for corresponding programs at certain public
institutions; requiring each university to allocate a certain percentage
amount raised by tuition increases to financial aid for students; provid-
ing that tuition and fees for certain students are not subject to a cap;
creating s. 1009.286, F.S.; requiring students to pay 75 percent of the
actual cost per credit hour for credit hours in excess of a specified num-
ber for community-college credits and for overall credits applied to a
baccalaureate degree; excluding certain credit hours from calculation as
hours required to earn a baccalaureate degree; providing for notification
of students by a postsecondary institution; providing applicability; pro-
viding an effective date.

—which was previously considered and amended this day.

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, CS for CS for SB 2236 as amended was
ordered engrossed and then placed on the calendar of Bills on Third
Reading.

On motion by Senator Smith—

CS for CS for SB 2542—A Dill to be entitled An act relating to the
state judicial system; amending s. 27.40, F.S., relating to circuit regis-
tries for court-appointed counsel; requiring that an attorney enter into
a contract to be included on the registry; limiting the appointment of
attorneys from the same law firm; prohibiting the sharing of duties
among attorneys except under certain circumstances; requiring data on
the race, sex, and ethnicity of attorneys; requiring the Justice Adminis-
trative Commission to approve uniform procedures and forms for use in
billing for an attorney’s fees, costs, and related expenses; requiring that
a withdrawal order be filed with the commission; providing that with-
drawal from a case creates a rebuttable presumption of nonentitlement
to the entire flat fee; amending s. 27.42, F.S.; requiring that the circuit
Article V indigent services committee establish the compensation rates
for court-appointed counsel or in cases of indigency; providing a limita-
tion on the rates; requiring each committee to establish a schedule of
allowances for due-process expenses; authorizing alternate models for
providing criminal and civil due-process representation; requiring that
the expenses for representing indigent persons be appropriated in a



722

separate category within the Justice Administrative Commission rather
than paid from funds appropriated for use by the public defenders;
requiring the commission to track and report data on the race, sex, and
ethnicity of private court-appointed counsel; amending s. 27.52, F.S.,
relating to the determination of indigent status; providing for applica-
tion to the clerk of court for such a determination and appointment of
a public defender; prescribing duties of the clerk and the public defender
relating to an application; prescribing application requirements and re-
view criteria; providing for review by the court of a clerk’s determina-
tion; authorizing the court to determine a person indigent for costs and
eligible for payment of due-process expenses; requiring certain parents
or legal guardians to furnish legal services and costs; providing for a
reevaluation of indigent status and referral to the state attorney upon
evidence of financial discrepancies or fraud; providing criminal penalties
for the provision of false information; amending s. 27.5304, F.S.; provid-
ing that court-appointed counsel use uniform contract, procedures, and
forms in certain circumstances; authorizing the Justice Administrative
Commission to pay attorney’s fees without court approval under certain
conditions; requiring the attorney to provide the commission with ad-
vance notice of a court hearing on payment of fees and costs; authorizing
the commission to participate in such hearings telephonically; eliminat-
ing a requirement for the Article V Indigent Services Advisory Board to
make recommendations on compensation of private court-appointed
counsel; providing that private court-appointed counsel is entitled to
compensation upon final disposition of the case; providing exceptions;
specifying intervals other than final disposition of a case at which pri-
vate court-appointed counsel may request payment; clarifying a prohibi-
tion against allowing an attorney who is not on the registry to appear;
limiting the reimbursement allowed for the preparation of invoices;
amending s. 27.54, F.S.; requiring that the county or municipality pay
certain costs for due-process services; prescribing assessment of fees to
recover such costs; amending s. 28.24, F.S.; requiring that the clerk of
the court provide copies to public guardians, attorneys ad litem, and
court-appointed counsel paid by the state; requiring clerks of the court
to participate in the Comprehensive Case Information System by a cer-
tain date; designating the custodian of official records; providing that
official records are county property; amending s. 28.2402, F.S.; prohibit-
ing the circuit court from charging a county or municipality more than
one filing fee for a single filing containing multiple allegations; exempt-
ing certain enforcement actions from the filing fee; amending s. 28.241,
F.S.; providing for the clerk of the court to collect a service fee for appeals
from circuit court; amending s. 28.245, F.S.; requiring that the clerks of
the court remit collections to the Department of Revenue within a speci-
fied period; amending s. 28.246, F.S.; conforming a reference; revising
provisions authorizing an individual to enter into a payment plan for the
payment of fees, costs, or fines; providing for the court to review the
payment plan; amending s. 28.345, F.S.; exempting certain court staff,
public guardians, attorneys ad litem, and court-appointed counsel from
the payment of fees and charges assessed by the clerk of the circuit court;
amending s. 28.35, F.S.; requiring the Florida Clerks of Court Opera-
tions Committee to report on additional budget funding authority pro-
vided to a clerk; amending s. 28.36, F.S.; revising the date for the county
clerk to submit a proposed budget; conforming a reference to the Florida
Clerks of Court Operations Corporation; conforming a reference to the
Chief Financial Officer; conforming a cross-reference; providing for iden-
tification of ineligible expenditures by the clerks of court; requiring the
clerks to reimburse ineligible expenditures to the Clerks of Court Trust
Fund; authorizing the corporation to approve additional annual funding
for a clerk under prescribed conditions; amending s. 28.37, F.S.; expand-
ing the types of excess funds that clerks of the court must remit to the
Department of Revenue over the amount needed to meet approved bud-
gets; creating s. 28.44, F.S.; providing a method by which the clerk of
court may discontinue or substantially modify court-related functions;
providing a definition; amending s. 29.004, F.S.; providing for state
appropriations to be used for expert witnesses who are appointed by the
court rather than requested by any party; amending s. 29.007, F.S;
providing for state funds to be used in providing mental health profes-
sionals in certain civil cases; clarifying the use of state funds at the trial
or appellate level to pay certain costs on behalf of a litigant who is
indigent; amending s. 29.008, F.S.; requiring that the county where the
appellate district is located fund the appellate division of the public
defender’s office; expanding the definition of the term “facility” to in-
clude items necessary for court-reporting services; narrowing a limita-
tion on the application of certain requirements to specified facilities;
including hearing rooms within those facilities funded by the county as
a court-related function; including audio equipment within county-
funded communications services; creating s. 29.0081, F.S.; authorizing

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

April 29, 2005

counties and judicial circuits to agree to the funding of personnel posi-
tions for the circuit; providing requirements for such agreements; pro-
viding for the effect and limitation of such agreements; amending s.
29.015, F.S.; authorizing the Justice Administrative Commission to
transfer funds to address budget deficits relating to due-process ser-
vices; requiring notice of the transfer; amending s. 29.018, F.S.; elimi-
nating the authority for court-appointed counsel to contract to share in
court and due-process costs; providing that the Justice Administrative
Commission may contract for such cost-sharing on behalf of court-
appointed counsel; creating s. 29.0185, F.S.; specifying conditions under
which state-funded due-process services are provided; amending s.
34.045, F.S.; prohibiting the county court from charging a county or
municipality more than one filing fee for a single filing containing multi-
ple allegations; exempting certain enforcement actions of local code vio-
lations from the filing fee; expanding conditions under which the county
or municipality is the prevailing party; requiring an assessment for a
filing fee; amending s. 34.191, F.S.; providing that for certain purposes,
a municipality does not include certain unincorporated areas; clarifying
a requirement that certain fines and forfeitures committed within an
unincorporated area of a municipality be paid to the clerk of the county
court; amending s. 39.0132, F.S.; authorizing the Justice Administrative
Commission to inspect certain court dockets; amending s. 39.821, F.S.;
requiring that the Guardian Ad Litem Program rather than the chief
judge request the federal criminal records check for purposes of certify-
ing guardians ad litem; amending s. 39.822, F.S.; directing agencies,
persons, and other organizations to provide a guardian ad litem access
to certain records related to the best interests of a child; amending s.
40.29, F.S.; clarifying procedures for the payments made by the state to
the clerk of the court for the costs of witnesses; creating s. 40.355, F.S.;
requiring the clerk of the court to report on, and refund to the state
attorneys and public defenders, certain moneys collected for payment of
jurors and due-process costs; amending s. 43.16, F.S.; providing that the
Justice Administrative Commission is not subject to the Administrative
Procedure Act; amending s. 43.26, F.S.; prescribing responsibilities of
the chief judge and the clerk of court relating to the administration of
justice and provision of court-related functions; amending s. 44.102,
F.S,; revising conditions under which nonvolunteer court mediators may
be compensated by the county or parties; amending s. 44.108, F.S.;
clarifying the fees charged for scheduled mediation services provided by
a circuit court’s mediation program; requiring the clerk of the court to
report to the chief judge the amount of such fees collected; amending s.
57.081, F.S.; adding a cross-reference to conform; creating s. 57.082,
F.S,, relating to the determination of civil indigent status; providing for
application to the clerk of court for such a determination; prescribing
duties of the clerk relating to an application; prescribing application
requirements and review criteria; providing for an interim determina-
tion by the court and appointment of counsel; providing for review by the
court of the clerk’s determination; providing for enrollment in a payment
plan by a person determined indigent; providing for the waiver of fees
and costs under certain conditions; providing for reevaluation of indi-
gent status and referral to the state attorney upon evidence of financial
discrepancies or fraud; providing criminal penalties for providing false
information; amending s. 92.142, F.S.; deleting a provision that provides
for payment of per diem and travel expenses for a witness in a criminal
case at the discretion of the court; amending s. 92.231, F.S.; removing
references to the Article V Indigent Services Advisory Board and the
provision of recommendations on expert witness fees; amending s.
110.205, F.S.; providing that officers and employees of the Justice Ad-
ministrative Commission and specified related organizations are not
career service positions; amending s. 116.01, F.S.; providing procedures
for the clerk of the court to remit funds to the Department of Revenue;
amending s. 116.21, F.S.; providing for the disposition of unclaimed
moneys collected in the course of court-related activities by the clerk of
the court; requiring the clerk to pay certain publication costs; amending
s. 119.07, F.S.; extending the time period during which certain social
security numbers and other data included in court or official county
records may be available for public inspection unless redaction is re-
quested; extending the deadline by which court clerks and county record-
ers must keep such data confidential; amending s. 142.01, F.S.; clarify-
ing those moneys to be included within the fine and forfeiture fund of the
clerk of the circuit court; amending s. 213.13, F.S.; requiring that the
funds remitted by the clerk to the state be transmitted electronically
within a specified period; amending s. 219.07, F.S.; clarifying the distri-
butions that the clerk is required to make as part of his or her court-
related functions; amending s. 219.075, F.S.; exempting funds collected
by the clerk from the requirements for the investment of surplus funds
of a county; amending s. 318.121, F.S,; clarifying that certain court costs
and surcharges are added to civil traffic penalties; amending s. 318.18,



April 29, 2005

F.S.; requiring that the clerk of the court report the amount of certain
surcharges collected to the chief judge, the Governor, and the Legisla-
ture; authorizing local governments to assess a surcharge on noncrimi-
nal offenses; amending s. 318.21, F.S.; providing for the disposition of
traffic-infraction penalties for violations occurring in unincorporated
areas of certain municipalities having a consolidated government;
amending s. 318.31, F.S.; deleting provisions concerning the appoint-
ment of a civil traffic infraction hearing officer; amending s. 318.325,
F.S.; deleting provisions specifying the funding of such hearing officer;
amending s. 322.29, F.S.; increasing the fees charged for reinstating a
driver’s license; amending s. 372.72, F.S.; requiring that the proceeds
from unclaimed bonds be deposited into the clerk’s fine and forfeiture
fund; amending s. 903.26, F.S.; revising the procedure for determining
the amount of the costs incurred in returning a defendant to the county
of jurisdiction; amending s. 903.28, F.S.; revising certain notice require-
ments following the surrender or apprehension of a defendant for pur-
poses of remission of a forfeiture; authorizing the clerk of the circuit
court to enter into certain contracts for purposes of representation in an
action for the remission of a forfeiture; providing that the clerk is the
real party in interest for all appeals arising from such an action; amend-
ing s. 916.115, F.S.; providing requirements for the payment of experts;
specifying those fees which are paid by the state, the office of the public
defender, the office of the state attorney, or the Justice Administrative
Commission; amending s. 916.12, F.S.; revising the procedures under
which the court may take action following a finding that the defendant
is incompetent to proceed; amending s. 916.301, F.S.; requiring the court
to pay for certain court-appointed retardation and autism experts;
amending s. 939.185, F.S.; authorizing certain local governments to
assess a surcharge on criminal offenses; amending s. 938.29, F.S.; pro-
viding for a judgment lien for the payment of certain attorney’s fees to
be filed without cost; amending s. 939.06, F.S.; clarifying that an acquit-
ted defendant is not liable for certain fees; providing a procedure for such
a defendant to request a refund from the Justice Administrative Com-
mission of costs or fees paid; amending s. 985.05, F.S.; authorizing the
Justice Administrative Commission to have access to certain court rec-
ords; amending s. 985.201, F.S.; revising the manner in which a court
may retain jurisdiction over a child and the child’s parent when the court
has ordered restitution for certain delinquent acts; requiring entry of a
restitution order; creating s. 92.152, F.S.; requiring that the party call-
ing a witness in traffic court bear the costs; requiring that the office of
the state attorney pay such costs if the witness is required to testify on
behalf of the prosecution; directing the trial court administrator to re-
cover expenditures for state-funded services if those services were fur-
nished to a user possessing the ability to pay; providing that the rate
may not exceed the cost of the service and recovery; revising the maxi-
mum annual budget amount for the Clerk of Court for the Eleventh
Judicial Circuit; providing legislative intent for revisions to ss. 34.191
and 318.21, F.S.; repealing s. 29.005(4), F.S., relating to prosecution
expenses for appointing mental health professionals; repealing s.
29.014, F.S,, relating to the Article V Indigent Services Advisory Board,;
repealing s. 318.37, F.S,, relating to funding for a Civil Traffic Infraction
Hearing Officer Program; providing appropriations; providing effective
dates.

—was read the second time by title.

Senator Villalobos offered the following amendment which was moved
by Senator Smith and adopted:

Amendment 1 (352146)(with title amendment)—On page 87, be-
tween lines 7 and 8, insert:

Section 50. Subsection (1) of section 318.32, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

318.32 Jurisdiction; limitations.—

(1) Hearing officers shall be empowered to accept pleas from and
decide the guilt or innocence of any person, adult or juvenile, charged
with any civil traffic infraction and shall be empowered to adjudicate or
withhold adjudication of guilt in the same manner as a county court
judge under the statutes, rules, and procedures presently existing or as
subsequently amended, except that hearing officers shall not:

(a) Have the power to hold a defendant in contempt of court, but
shall be permitted to file a motion for order of contempt with the appro-
priate state trial court judge;

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

723

(b) Hear a case involving a crash resulting in injury or death; e

(¢) Hear a criminal traffic offense case or a case involving a civil
traffic infraction issued in conjunction with a criminal traffic offense; or=

(d) Have the power to suspend a defendant’s driver’s license pursuant
to s. 316.655(2).

(Redesignate subsequent sections.)

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 10, line 13, after the semicolon (;) insert: amending s.
318.32, F.S.; prohibiting a hearing officer from suspending a defendant’s
driver’s license;

Senator Bennett moved the following amendment:

Amendment 2 (823556)(with title amendment)—On page 89, be-
tween lines 26 and 27, insert:

Section 52. Section 938.19, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:
938.19 Teen courts.—

(1) Notwithstanding s. 318.121, in each county in which a teen court
has been created, the board of county commissioners may adopt a manda-
tory cost to be assessed in specific cases by incorporating by reference the
provisions of this section in a county ordinance. Assessments collected by
the clerk of the circuit court under this subsection shall be deposited into
an account specifically for the operation and administration of the teen
court.

(2) A sum of up to $3 shall be assessed as a court cost in the circuit
and county court in the county against each person who pleads guilty or
nolo contendere to, or is convicted of, regardless of adjudication, a viola-
tion of a criminal law or a municipal ordinance or county ordinance or
who pays a fine or civil penalty for any violation of chapter 316. Any
person whose adjudication is withheld under s. 318.14(9) or (10) shall
also be assessed the cost.

(3) The assessment for court costs shall be assessed in addition to any
fine or civil penalty or other court cost and may not be deducted from the
proceeds of that portion of any fine or civil penalty which is received by
a municipality in the county or by the county in accordance with ss.
316.660 and 318.21. The assessment shall be specifically added to any
civil penalty paid for a violation of chapter 316, regardless of whether the
penalty is paid by mail, paid in person without request for a hearing, or
paid after hearing and determination by the court. However, the assess-
ment may not be made against a person for a violation of any state law,
county ordinance, or municipal ordinance relating to the parking of vehi-
cles, with the exception of a violation of the handicapped parking laws.

(4)(a) The clerk of the circuit court shall collect the assessments for
court costs established in this section and shall remit the assessments to
the teen court monthly.

(b) The clerk of the circuit court shall withhold 5 percent of the assess-
ments collected, which shall be retained as fee income of the office of the
clerk of the circuit court.

(5) A teen court that receives the cost assessments established by the
adopted county ordinance must account for all funds that have been
deposited into the designated account in a written report to the board of
county commissioners. The report must be given to the commissioners by
August 1 of each year or by a date required by the commissioners.

(6) A teen court may be administered by a nonprofit organization, a
law enforcement agency, the court administrator, the clerk of the court,
or another similar agency authorized by the board of county commission-
ers.

(7) A teen court administered in a county that adopts an ordinance
to assess court costs under this section may not receive court costs col-

lected under s. 939.185(1)(a)4. Gounties—are-hereby-authorized-to—fund
teen—eourts:

Section 53. Paragraph (a) of subsection (1) of section 939.185, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:



724

939.185 Assessment of additional court costs.—

(1)(a) The board of county commissioners may adopt by ordinance an
additional court cost, not to exceed $65, to be imposed by the court when
a person pleads guilty or nolo contendere to, or is found guilty of, any
felony, misdemeanor, or criminal traffic offense under the laws of this
state. Such additional assessment shall be accounted for separately by
the county in which the offense occurred and be used only in the county
imposing this cost, to be allocated as follows:

1. Twenty-five percent of the amount collected shall be allocated to
fund innovations to supplement state funding for the elements of the
state courts system identified in s. 29.004 and county funding for local
requirements under s. 29.008(2)(a)2.

2. Twenty-five percent of the amount collected shall be allocated to
assist counties in providing legal aid programs required under s.
29.008(3)(a).

3. Twenty-five percent of the amount collected shall be allocated to
fund personnel and legal materials for the public as part of a law library.

4. Twenty-five percent of the amount collected shall be used as deter-
mined by the board of county commissioners to support teen court pro-
grams, except as provided in s. 938.19(7), juvenile assessment centers,
and other juvenile alternative programs.

Each county receiving funds under this section shall report the amount
of funds collected pursuant to this section and an itemized list of expend-
itures for all authorized programs and activities. The report shall be
submitted in a format developed by the Supreme Court to the Governor,
the Chief Financial Officer, the President of the Senate, and the Speaker
of the House of Representatives on a quarterly basis beginning with the
quarter ending September 30, 2004. Quarterly reports shall be submit-
ted no later than 30 days after the end of the quarter. Any unspent funds
at the close of the county fiscal year allocated under subparagraphs 2.,
3., and 4., shall be transferred for use pursuant to subparagraph 1.

(Redesignate subsequent sections.)
And the title is amended as follows:

On page 10, line 1, after the first semicolon (;) insert: amending s.
938.19, F.S.; authorizing a board of county commissioners to adopt an
ordinance that incorporates the provisions of the act; providing funding
for a teen court through the assessment of an additional court cost
against each person who pleads guilty or nolo contendere to, or is con-
victed of, a violation of a criminal law, an ordinance, or a traffic offense
in the county; providing for administration by the clerk of the circuit
court; authorizing the clerk of the court to retain a specified percentage
of the assessments collected as income to the clerk of the court; requiring
the teen court to account for all funds deposited into the teen court
account; requiring an annual report to the board of county commission-
ers by a specified date; authorizing specified organizations to operate
and administer a teen court program; prohibiting teen courts in counties
adopting an ordinance from recovering court costs under s. 939.185, F.S.;
amending s. 939.185, F.S.; providing an exception for teen court funding;

MOTION

On motion by Senator Smith, the rules were waived to allow the
following amendment to be considered:

Senator Bennett offered the following amendment to Amendment 2
which was moved by Senator Smith and adopted:

Amendment 2A (054354)—On page 1, line 22, after “commissioners”
insert: or local governing body

Amendment 2 as amended was adopted.
MOTION

On motion by Senator Smith, the rules were waived to allow the
following amendments to be considered:

Senator Smith moved the following amendments which were adopted:

Amendment 3 (955228)(with title amendment)—On page 13, line
6 through page 14, line 27, delete those lines and insert:

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

April 29, 2005

(3) In utilizing a registry:

(a) Each circuit Article V indigent services committee shall compile
and maintain a list of attorneys in private practice, by county and by
category of cases. In the eleventh judicial circuit for the 2005-2006 and
2006-2007 fiscal years, the committee shall compile and maintain a list
of attorneys by race, sex, and ethnicity of the assigned attorneys. To be
included on a registry, attorneys shall certify that they meet any mini-
mum requirements established in general law for court appointment,
are available to represent indigent defendants in cases requiring court
appointment of private counsel, and are willing to abide by the terms of
the contract for services. To be included on a registry, an attorney also
must enter into a contract for services with the Justice Administrative
Commission. Failure to comply with the terms of the contract for services
may result in termination of the contract and removal from the registry.
Each attorney on the registry shall be responsible for notifying the
circuit Article V indigent services committee and the Justice Adminis-
trative Commission of any change in his or her status. Failure to comply
with this requirement shall be cause for termination of the contract for
services and removal from the registry until the requirement is fulfilled.

(b) The court shall appoint attorneys in rotating order in the order
in which names appear on the applicable registry, unless the court
makes a finding of good cause on the record for appointing an attorney
out of order. An attorney not appointed in the order in which his or her
name appears on the list shall remain next in order.

(¢) Ifit finds the number of attorneys on the registry in a county or
circuit for a particular category of cases is inadequate, the circuit Article
V indigent services committee shall notify the chief judge of the particu-
lar circuit in writing. The chief judge shall submit the names of at least
three private attorneys with relevant experience. The clerk of court shall
send an application to each of these attorneys to register for appoint-
ment.

(d) Quarterly, beginning-neo-later-than Oetober1,2004; each circuit
Article V indigent services committee shall provide a current copy of each
registry to the Chief Justice of the Supreme Court, the chief judge, the
state attorney and public defender in each judicial circuit, and the clerk
of court in each county, the Justice Administrative Commission, and the
Indigent Services Advisory Board with-a—eurrent-copy-of-each-registry.
In the eleventh judicial circuit for the 2005-2006 and 2006-2007 fiscal
years, the registry shall identify the race, sex, and ethnicity of each attor-
ney listed in the registry.

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 1, lines 7-11, delete those lines and insert: revising require-
ments for private court-appointed counsel; requiring that data be com-
piled on the race, sex, and ethnicity of attorneys within a specified circuit
for a limited time; requiring the

Amendment 4 (022784)(with title amendment)—On page 15, line
27, before the period (.) insert: , subject to the attorney-client privilege
and work product privilege

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 1, line 19, after the first semicolon (;) insert: authorizing the
Justice Administrative Commission to review certain records;

Amendment 5 (091040)—On page 17, lines 20-28, delete those lines
and insert:

(3) Notwithstanding any other provision of this section, a circuit Arti-
cle Vindigent services committee may approve, and the Justice Adminis-
trative Commission shall investigate and evaluate the use of funds for,
alternate models for the provision of criminal and civil due-process ser-
vices and representation other than a model based on a per-case fee if a
more cost-effective and efficient system can be provided. An alternate
model may include court-reporting services and the provision of court-
appointed counsel.

Amendment 6 (420292)(with title amendment)—On page 19,
lines 3-6, delete those lines and insert: guardianship.
And the title is amended as follows:

On page 2, lines 2-4, delete those lines and insert: defenders; amend-

ing s.



April 29, 2005

Amendment 7 (450822)—On page 20, lines 30 and 31, delete those
lines and insert: Commission, to be used as appropriated by the Legis-
lature. The

Amendment 8 (880240)—On page 27, line 13, delete “and (9)” and
insert: (9), and (10)

Amendment 9 (953482)(with title amendment)—On page 31,
lines 3-9, delete those lines and insert:

(9) Private court-appointed counsel may not bill for preparation of
invoices whether or not the case is paid on the basis of an hourly rate or

by flat fee.

(10) The Justice Administrative Commission shall develop a sched-
ule to provide partial payment of attorney fees for cases that are not
resolved within 6 months. The schedule must provide that the aggregate
payments shall not exceed limits established by law. Any partial payment
made pursuant to this subsection shall not exceed the actual value of
services provided to date. Any partial payment shall be proportionate to
the value of services provided based on payment rates included in the
contract, not to exceed any limit provided by law.

And the title is amended as follows:
On page 3, lines 13 and 14, delete those lines and insert:

restricting the reimbursement allowed for the preparation of invoices;
requiring the Justice Administrative Commission to develop a schedule
to provide partial payment for attorney fees under certain circum-
stances; amending s. 27.54,

Amendment 10 (772220)(with title amendment)—On page 39,
line 20 through page 40, line 9, delete those lines and insert:

Section 7. Paragraph (a) of subsection (1) and subsection (2) of sec-
tion 28.2402, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

28.2402 Cost recovery; use of the circuit court for ordinance or spe-
cial law violations.—

(1)(a) Inlieu of payment of a filing fee under s. 28.241, a filing fee of
$10 shall be paid by a county or municipality when filing a county or
municipal ordinance violation or violation of a special law in circuit
court. This fee shall be paid to the clerk of the court for performing court-
related functions. A county or municipality is not required to pay more
than one filing fee for a single filing against a single defendant which
contains multiple alleged violations. A filing fee, other than that imposed
under this section, may not be assessed for initiating an enforcement
proceeding in circuit court for a violation of a county or municipal code
or ordinance or a violation of a special law. The filing fee does not apply
to instances in which a county or a municipality has contracted with the
state, or has been delegated by the state, responsibility for enforcing state
operations, policies, or requirements under s. 125.69, s. 166.0415, or
chapter 162.

(2) To offset costs incurred by the clerks of the court in performing
court-related functions associated with the processing of violations of
special laws and municipal ordinances, 10 percent of the total amount
of fines paid to each municipality for special law or ordinance violations
filed in circuit court shall be retained by the clerk of the court for deposit
into the clerk’s fine and forfeiture fund established pursuant to s. 142.01,
except for fines a portion of which the clerk of the court retains pursuant
to any other provision of state law. A municipality does not include the
unincorporated areas, if any, of a government created pursuant to s. 6(e),
Art. VIII of the State Constitution.

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 4, line 1, after the first semicolon (;) insert: excluding unin-
corporated areas of certain consolidated governments from the term
“municipality” for purposes of sharing with the clerk certain fines from
local ordinance violations;

Amendment 11 (555486)(with title amendment)—On page 40,
line 10 through page 41, line 10, delete those lines and redesignate
subsequent sections.

And the title is amended as follows:

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

725

On page 4, lines 1-3, delete those lines and insert: fee; amending s.

Amendment 12 (914046)(with title amendment)—On page 59,
line 26 through page 60, line 9, delete those lines and insert:

filing against a single defendant which contains multiple alleged viola-
tions. A filing fee, other than that imposed under this section, may not be
assessed for initiating an enforcement proceeding in county court for a
violation of a county or municipal code or ordinance or a violation of a
special law. The filing fee does not apply to instances in which a county
or a municipality has contracted with the state, or has been delegated by
the state, responsibility for enforcing state operations, policies, or require-
ments under s. 125.69, s. 166.0415, or chapter 162.

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 6, delete line 21 and insert: enforcement actions
Amendment 13 (632892)(with title amendment)—On page 61,
lines 6-19, delete those lines and insert:

(2) All fines and forfeitures received from violations of municipal
ordinances committed within a municipality within the territorial juris-
diction of the county court, other than the charge provided in s.
318.1215, shall be paid monthly to the municipality except as provided
in s. 28.2402(2), s. 34.045(2), s. 318.21, or s. 943.25. For purposes of this
section, a municipality does not include the unincorporated areas, if any,
of a government created pursuant to s. 6(e), Art. VIII of the State Consti-
tution.

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 6, lines 25-31, delete those lines and insert: filing fee;
amending s. 34.191, F.S.; excluding certain consolidated governments
from the term municipality for purposes of remitting certain fines and
forfeitures; amending s. 39.0132, F.S.;

Amendment 14 (355204)(with title amendment)—On page 74,
line 11 through page 75, line 5, delete those lines and insert:

(5) PROCESSING CHARGE; PAYMENT PLANS.—A person who
the clerk or the court determines is indigent for civil proceedings under
this section shall be enrolled in a payment plan under s. 28.246 and shall
be charged a one-time administrative processing charge under s.
28.24(26)(c). A monthly payment amount, calculated based upon all fees
and all anticipated costs, is presumed to correspond to the person’s ability
to pay if it does not exceed 2 percent of the person’s annual net income,
as defined in subsection (1), divided by 12. The person may seek review
of the clerk’s decisions regarding a payment plan established under s.
28.246 in the court having jurisdiction over the matter. A case may not
be impeded in any way, delayed in filing, or delayed in its progress,
including the final hearing and order, due to nonpayment of any fees by
an indigent person.

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 8, lines 15 and 16, delete those lines and insert: determined

indigent;

Amendment 15 (551018)(with title amendment)—On page 84,
line 13, after the second period (.) insert: Up to 25 percent of the revenue
from such surcharge may be used to support local law libraries provided
that the county or unit of local government provides a level of service
equal to that provided prior to July 1, 2004, which shall include the
continuation of library facilities located in or near the county courthouse
or annexes.

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 10, line 1, after the second semicolon (;) insert: authorizing
a portion of certain surcharge revenues to be used for local law libraries;

Amendment 16 (154338)(with title amendment)—On page 86,
line 2, after the period (.) insert: Proceeds from the imposition of the
surcharge authorized in this subsection shall not be used for the purpose
of securing payment of the principal and interest on bonds. This subsec-
tion, and any surcharge imposed pursuant to this subsection, shall stand
repealed on September 30, 2007.

And the title is amended as follows:



726

On page 10, line 6, after the semicolon (;) insert:
of surcharge proceeds;

restricting the use

Amendment 17 (835118)(with title amendment)—On page 86,
lines 19-27, delete those lines and insert:

3. If the violation occurred within the unincorporated area of a
county, including the unincorporated areas, if any, of a government cre-
ated pursuant to s. 6(e), Art. VIII of the State Constitution, that is not
within a special improvement district of the Seminole Indian Tribe or
Miccosukee Indian Tribe, 56.4 percent shall be deposited into the fine
and forfeiture fund established pursuant to s. 142.01.

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 10, lines 10 and 11, delete those lines and in-
sert: consolidated governments; amending s. 318.31, F.S.; deleting

Amendment 18 (105916)(with title amendment)—On page 93,
between lines 25 and 26, insert:

(11) Upon remission of bond pursuant to this section, the clerk of the
circuit court shall withhold any unpaid fines, fees, service charges, and
court costs imposed as a matter of law or ordered by the court.

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 11, line 2, after the semicolon (;) insert: authorizing the
clerk to withhold unpaid fines, fees, costs, and charges under certain
circumstances;

Amendment 19 (235370)(with title amendment)—On page 100,
line 20, after the period (.) insert: Proceeds from the imposition of the
surcharge authorized in this subsection shall not be used for the purpose
of securing payment of the principal and interest on bonds. This subsec-
tion, and any surcharge imposed pursuant to this subsection, shall stand
repealed on September 30, 2007.

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 11, line 16, after the first semicolon (;) insert:
use of surcharge proceeds;

restricting the

Amendment 20 (270292)—On page 102, lines 4-14, delete those lines

Amendment 21 (215962)(with title amendment)—On page 102,
line 15 through page 103, line 7, delete those lines and insert:

Section 61. Subsection (2) of section 985.05, Florida Statutes, is
amended, and subsection (5) is added to that section, to read:

985.05 Court records.—

(2) The clerk shall keep all official records required by this section
separate from other records of the circuit court, except those records
pertaining to motor vehicle violations, which shall be forwarded to the
Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles. Except as provided
in ss. 943.053 and 985.04(4), official records required by this part are not
open to inspection by the public, but may be inspected only upon order
of the court by persons deemed by the court to have a proper interest
therein, except that a child and the parents, guardians, or legal custodi-
ans of the child and their attorneys, law enforcement agencies, the
Department of Juvenile Justice and its designees, the Parole Commis-
sion, and the Department of Corrections, and the Justice Administrative
Commission shall always have the right to inspect and copy any official
record pertaining to the child. The court may permit authorized repre-
sentatives of recognized organizations compiling statistics for proper
purposes to inspect, and make abstracts from, official records under
whatever conditions upon the use and disposition of such records the
court may deem proper and may punish by contempt proceedings any
violation of those conditions.

(5) This part does not prohibit a circuit court from providing a resti-
tution order containing the information prescribed in s. 985.201(4)(c) to
collection court or a private collection agency for the sole purpose of
collecting unpaid restitution ordered in a case in which the circuit court
has retained jurisdiction over the child and the child’s parent or legal
guardian. The collection court or private collection agency shall maintain
the confidential status of the information to the extent such confidential-
ity is provided by law.

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

April 29, 2005

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 11, line 26, after the semicolon (;) insert: authorizing circuit
courts to share certain juvenile delinquency restitution orders;

Amendment 22 (305464)(with title amendment)—On page 105,
lines 11-21, delete those lines and insert:

Section 66. It is the intent of the Legislature that the amendments
made by this act to sections 28.2402(2), 34.191, and 318.21, Florida
Statutes, are remedial. It is the further intent of the Legislature that fines
and forfeitures or civil penalties arising from offenses or violations com-
mitted or occurring within an unincorporated area of a government cre-
ated under section 6(e), Article VIII of the State Constitution be paid or
deposited for Fiscal Year 2004-2005 as provided in sections 28.2402(2),
34.191, and 318.21, Florida Statutes, as those sections are amended by
this act. The section shall take effect upon becoming a law.

And the title is amended as follows:
On page 12, delete line 15 and insert: ss. 28.2402(2), 34.191, and
318.21, F.S.; repealing s.

Amendment 23 (230070)(with title amendment)—On page 46,
lines 4-30, delete those lines and insert:

(6) The legislature budget commission may approve adjustments to
the clerk’s maximum annual budget for court-related duties if either of
the following conditions exist:

(a) The additional funding is necessary to pay the cost of performing
new or additional functions required by changes in law or court rule.
Before the maximum annual budget of any clerk can be increased, the
Clerk of the Court corporation shall provide the legislative budget com-
mission a statement of the impact of the proposed budget changes on state
revenues, and evidence that the respective clerk of the court is meeting or
exceeding the established performance standards for measures on the
fiscal management, operational efficiency, and effective collection of
fines, fees, service charges, and court costs.

(b) The additional funding is necessary to pay the cost of supporting
increases in the number of judges or magistrates authorized by the Legis-
lature. Before the maximum annual budget of any clerk can be increased.
The Clerk of the Court Corporation shall provide the legislative budget
commission a statement of the impact of the proposed budget changes on
state revenues, evidence that the respective clerk of the court is meeting
or exceeding the established performance standards for measures on the
fiscal management, operational efficiency, and effective collection of
fines, fees, service charges, and court costs, and a proposed staffing
model, including the cost and number of staff necessary to support each
new judge or magistrate.

And the title is amended as follows:

On page 4, line 29 through page 5, line 1, delete those lines and
insert: of Court Trust Fund; authorizing legislative budget commission
to approve adjustments to the clerk’s budget for court-related duties
under certain conditions;

MOTION

On motion by Senator Campbell, the rules were waived to allow the
following amendment to be considered:

Senator Campbell moved the following amendment which was
adopted:

Amendment 24 (124740)(with title amendment)—On page 68,
between lines 17 and 18, insert:

Section 33. Subsection (3) of section 44.103, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

44,103 Court-ordered, nonbinding arbitration.—

(3) Arbitrators shall be selected and compensated in accordance with
rules adopted by the Supreme Court. Arbitrators shall be compensated
by the parties, or, upon a finding by the court that a party is indigent,
an arbitrator may be partially or fully compensated from state funds
according to the party’s present ability to pay. A¢ no time may an arbitra-
tor charge more than $1,500 per diem, unless the parties agree otherwise.



April 29, 2005

Prior to approving the use of state funds to reimburse an arbitrator, the
court must ensure that the party reimburses the portion of the total cost
that the party is immediately able to pay and that the party has agreed
to a payment plan established by the clerk of the court that will fully
reimburse the state for the balance of all state costs for both the arbitra-
tor and any costs of administering the payment plan and any collection
efforts that may be necessary in the future. Whenever possible, qualified
individuals who have volunteered their time to serve as arbitrators shall
be appointed. If an arbitration program is funded pursuant to s. 44.108,
volunteer arbitrators shall be entitled to be reimbursed pursuant to s.
112.061 for all actual expenses necessitated by service as an arbitrator.

(Redesignate subsequent sections.)
And the title is amended as follows:
On page 7, line 28, after the semicolon (;) insert: amending s. 44.103,

F.S.; limiting the amount of per diem expenses that an arbitrator may
charge;

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, CS for CS for SB 2542 as amended was
ordered engrossed and then placed on the calendar of Bills on Third
Reading.

On motion by Senator Saunders, the Senate resumed consideration
of—

HB 497—A bill to be entitled An act relating to highway safety; creat-
ing the Anjelica and Victoria Velez Memorial Traffic Safety Act; amend-
ing s. 316.650, F.S.; requiring traffic citation forms to include a check box
indicating a failure to stop at a traffic signal; amending s. 318.18, F.S.;
revising the penalty for a moving violation of a traffic control signal
steady red indication and of a traffic control device when a driver fails
to stop at a traffic signal; providing for distribution of moneys collected;
amending s. 318.21, F.S.; providing for distribution of specified civil
penalties; amending s. 322.0261, F.S.; requiring the Department of
Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles to identify a person who has com-
mitted a second moving violation of a traffic control signal steady red
indication or of a traffic control device within a specified time period and
require such person to complete a driver improvement course; providing
for cancellation of license for failure to complete said course within a
specified time period; amending s. 322.27, F.S.; assigning a point value
for the conviction of a moving violation of a traffic control signal steady
red indication or of a traffic control device; creating s. 395.4036, F.S.;
providing for distribution of funds to trauma centers; authorizing
trauma centers to request that such funds be used as intergovernmental
transfer funds in the Medicaid program; providing for audits and attes-
tations; providing an appropriation; providing an effective date.

—which was previously considered this day.

Pursuant to Rule 4.19, HB 497 was placed on the calendar of Bills on
Third Reading.

On motion by Senator Lynn, the Senate resumed consideration of—

CS for SB 1232—A bill to be entitled An act relating to wind-
protection provisions of the Florida Building Code; amending ch. 2000-
141, Laws of Florida; providing for removal of outdated wind-protection
standards from the Florida Building Code; providing for an update of the
code’s wind-protection standards; providing an appropriation; providing
for incorporation in the Florida Building Code of the repeal of a design
option relating to internal pressure for buildings within the windborne
debris region; requiring the Florida Building Commission to make rec-
ommendations to the Legislature; providing an effective date.

—which was previously considered and amended this day. Pending
Amendment 2 (091450) by Senator Lynn was withdrawn.

Pending further consideration of CS for SB 1232 as amended, on
motion by Senator Lynn, by two-thirds vote HB 835 was withdrawn
from the Committees on Community Affairs; and Regulated Industries.

On motion by Senator Lynn—

HB 835—A bill to be entitled An act relating to wind-protection provi-
sions of the Florida Building Code; requiring the commission to adopt

JOURNAL OF THE SENATE

727

certain wind protection requirements for areas of the state not within
the high velocity hurricane zone; providing construction; providing for
incorporation into the Florida Building Code of the repeal of a design
option relating to internal pressure for buildings within the windborne
debris region; providing an appropriation for a joint program to educate
contractors for certain purposes; requiring the commission to review
damage from Hurricane Ivan and make recommendations to the Legis-
lature for changes to the Florida Building Code, especially relating to
certain areas; requiring a report; directing the commission to evaluate
the definition of the 